MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY
WA 122510 BARRACUDA E-MAIL PROTECTION LICENSES RENEWAL

Regq. 10234-1
1
ITEM (1) (2)
QUANTITY DESCRIPTION GHA
No. VPRIME
TECHNOLOGIES,
TECH, INC.
INC.)
1 1 EA | Barracuda E-mail Protection E-mail $7,008.30 $8,802.00

Gateway Defense Subscription License (1
Year)-225 users (EP-EGD-USR-1M)

2 1 EA | Barracuda E-mail Protection Subscription $8,009.47 $10,071.00
License (1 Year)-225 users-hosted-with
Barracuda Cloud archiving service (AP-CAS-
USR-1M)

TOTAL BID $15,017.77 $18,873.00




December 23, 2025

Page 1
Monroe County Water Authority
MCWA 122509 - Clow/Eddy Hydrant Parts
No Bid No Bid
3% ) @) @) @
ItemNo Qty : Description Ferguson T. Mina Supply | Core & Main F.W. Webb

1 10 ea Eddy #2 Operating Nut $294.80 $314.00 $0 $0
Z 10 ea Eddy #3 Packing Gland #F2400249 $589.60 $627.70 $0 $0
3 30ea Eddy #4 Rubber Packing #F2400494 $609.90 $649.50 $0 $0
4 lea Eddy #9 Pumper Nozzle 5" $308.00 $327.95 $0 $0
5 1ea Eddy #16 Hose Nozzle 2-1/2" $140.28 $149.36 $0 $0
6 lea Eddy #19 4-1/2" 5' Upper Stem #A1610839 $330.38 $351.76 $0 $0
T 1ea Eddy #19 4-1/2" 5'6" Upper Stem NO BID $351.76 $0 $0
8 1ea Eddy #19 4-1/2" 6' Upper Stem NO BID $351.76 $0 $0
9 2ea Eddy #19 5-1/4" 5' Upper Stem #A1610841 $660.78 $703.52 $0 $0
10 lea Eddy #19 5-1/4" 5'6" Upper Stem NO BID $351.76 $0 $0
1T 1ea Eddy #19 5-1/4" 6' Upper Stem NO BID $351.76 $0 $0
12 1ea Eddy #21A 4-1/2" Valve Plate $187.09 $199.20 $0 $0
13 1lea Eddy #21A 5-1/4" Valve Plate $279.56 $297.65 $0 $0
14 1ea Eddy #24 4-1/2" Valve Rubber #T1600105 NO BID $43.29 $0 $0
15 lea Eddy #24 5-1/4" Valve Rubber #T1600104 NO BID $77.93 $0 $0
16 1ea Eddy #24 4" Valve Rubber #T1600105 NO BID $43.29 $0 $0
17 1ea Eddy #25 4-1/2" Seat Ring #R2100439 $83.36 $88.75 $0 $0
18 1lea Eddy #25 5-1/4" Seat Ring #R2100084 $91.49 $97.41 $0 $0
19 1ea Eddy #29A 4-1/2" Lower Stem 5' #F2202814 $247.00 $263.00 $0 $0
20 4 ea Eddy #29A 5-1/4" Lower Stem 5' #F2202813 $282.60 $1,203.60 $0 $0
21 1ea Eddy #34 Drain Lever #F1600172 $56.93 $60.60 $0 $0
22 1ea Eddy #35 Lever Pin (with cotter pins) #F1600138 $8.14 $7.58 $0 $0
23 1lea Eddy #36 Clevis & Nut #R1620030 $46.76 $49.79 $0 $0
24 6 ea Eddy #37 4-1/2" Drain Support #M1600114 $688.68 $733.80 $0 $0
25 6 ea Eddy #37 5-1/4" Drain Support #M1600135 $689.22 $733.80 $0 $0
26 1ea Eddy #46 Stem Coupling #M2200608 $109.79 $116.89 $0 $0
27 1ea Eddy #47 Stem Coupling Pin #T0400401 $5.08 $5.40 $0 $0
28 6 ea Eddy #48 5' Middle Stem $359.88 $383.10 $0 $0
29 1ea Eddy #48 5'6" Middle Stem $72.17 $76.85 $0 $0




No Bid No Bid
R PO | @) @) 3) @)
JeemENe- Qe 1y Description Ferguson T. Mina Supply | Core & Main F.W. Webb

30 1lea Eddy #48 6' Middle Stem $84.37 $89.83 $0 $0
31 lea  Eddy #AA Assy (Parts 19, 29A, 46, 47, 48) 4-1/2" $895.60 $953.55 $0 $0
32 lea Eddy #AA Assy (Parts 19, 29A, 46,47, 48) 5-1/4" $1,046.05 $1,113.74 $0 $0
33 2 ea Eddy #BB Assembly 4-1/2" 5' Hydrant $414.66 $441.50 $0 $0
34 2ea  Eddy #BB Assembly 5-1/4" 5' Hydrant $609.94 $649.40 $0 $0
35 lea Eddy #C Assembly (Parts 34, 35, 36, 37) 4-1/2" $230.76 $245.70 $0 $0
36 1ea Eddy #C Assembly (Parts 34, 35, 36, 37) 5-1/4" $243.98 $276.00 $0 $0
37 10 ea Eddy F-2640 4-1/2" Hydrant Repair Kit-#944 $3,245.30 $3,455.30 $0 $0
38 20 ea Eddy F-2640 5-1/4" Hydrant Repair Kit-#945 $6,490.60 $6,910.60 $0 $0

TOTAL BID *$19,402.75 $23,148.38 $0 $0

*Non-responsive

*Ferguson non-responsive as they did not bid on all items.




