
Scrubber Installation, Webster WTP 

I certify that this tabulation is a true 

representation of bids received on 

December 12, 2024 at 10:00 a.m. 

for this project: 

By: 

Branden Farnsworth-Weinblatt, PE 
Erdman Anthony 

Date: 20-Dec-2024 

Item Estimated 
No. Description Quantity Unit 

1.0 WWTP Scrubber 1 LS 

Bid Informalities: 

1. There were no informalities in the bids. 

John W. Danforth Company 

Engineer's 930 Old Dutch Road 

Estimate Victor, NY 14564 

(585) 924-7030 

Unit Unit 

Price Amount Price Amount 

$ 2.79,616.00 $ 279,616.00 $ 278,700.00 $ 278,700.00 

$ 279,616.00 $ 278,700.00 

$ 

Eng. No.: 24-S01 

Auth. No.: 241-000 

Bid Opening: 12/12/202-. 

Crosby-Brownlie, [nc. 

100 Nassau Street 

Rochester, NY 14605 

(585) 325-1290 

Unit 
Price Amount 

357,630.00 $ 357,63Cl00 

$ 357,63000 



Monroe County Water Authority 

WA 122416 - Salt Supply for Corfu WTP 

Bid Tabulation 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on December 20, 2024 at 11 am for this contract. 

By: 

Date: ,z~-z.t 

Item Estimated 

No. Description Quantity Unit 

1 Delivery of Salt for Corfu WTP 170 TON 

Total Bid Price 

Notes: 

$ 

$ 

Eng. No.: NIA 

Auth. No.: NIA 

.. .. 
Bid Opening: December 20, 2024 at 11 am 

Midwest Salt LLC Compass 

1300 West Washington St 9900 W. 109th St. 

WestChicago, IL 60185 Overland Park, KS 66210 

630.513. 7575 913.344.9200 

Unit Unit 

Price Amount Price Amount 

525.00 $ 89,250.00 $ 210.00 $ 35,700.00 

89,250.00 $ 35,700.00 

Non-Responsive111 

1. Bid determined to be non-responsive for multiple deficiencies induding submission of the bid by electronic mail (not acceptable), failure 
to complete all required forms properly, and failure to submit required documentation for the product induding copy of NSF certification, 
Safety Data Sheet (SOS), and chemical analysis. 



WWTP High Duty Pump #3 Motor Rehabilitation 

Town of Webster 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on January 28, 2025 at 11 :00 a.m. for this project. 

:-Oc2.e.­By 1vfC 
Date: Janua!Y_ 28, 2025 

Item 

I 
Estimated 

No. Description Quantity 

1 WWTP High Duty Pump #3 Motor Rehabilitation j 1 
•-.. •·ooo•Ho .. , __ ••••• .. •••• ·!00 ho, nU••-••--••--••••~--·•••~--,---•••-•-•• •-H ... - ·--•• .. - • ·• 

2 Miscellaneous Additional Work Allowance I 1 

Total Bid Price 

Engineers 

Estimate 

Unit 

Unit Price Amount 

LS $ 40,000.00 $ 40,000.00 
- •-•••-•- •-·••H••"n,, . • ---· -----···-·• 

LS $ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00 

$50,000.00 

Eng. No.: 24-S13 

Auth. No.: 6443 

Bid Opening: January 28, 2025 

Power-Flo Technologies, Inc. KJ Electric 

270 Park Ave 5894 East Molly Road 

Garden City Park NY, 11040 Syracuse NY, 13211 

(516) 812-6800 (315) 454-5535 

Unit Unit 

Price Amount Price Amount 

$ 34,529.00 $ 34,529.00 $ 58,598.00 $ 58,598.00 
·--·- ·-· -··· - ·-~--··--·-·-·- .................... .................. .. .......... ,., _______ ,--

$ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00 

$44,529.00 $68,598.00 



E
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BID TAB - WA 012501 HYDROVERGE VALVE EXERCISERS 

ITEM F.W. Webb Blair Supply Ferguson Ent., Core& Main lntermtn 

# Co. Corp. LLC LP Tech. Int, Inc. Sales, Inc. 

1 HYDROVERGE HYDRANT BUDDY XL-VALVE & HYDRANT EXERCISER $ 27,974.45 $ 40,600.00 $ 27,737.36 $ 35,873.25 $ 36,050.00 $ 30,866.99 

2 HYDROVERGE ADJUSTABLE VALVE KEY-78"-135" $ 3,000.55 $ 3,815.00 $ 2,913.47 $ 3,325.00 $ 3,675.00 $ 2,800.00 

LESS PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT: $ 619.50 $ . $ . $ . $ 99.31 $ 

TOTAL: $ 30,355.50 $ 44,415.00 $ 30,650.83 $ 39,198.25 $ 39,625.69 $ 33,666.99 
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2026 Water Stor8ge Tank Demolitions 

I certify ttud this tabulatioci Is a V'UII mpreserrtaticri af bids received Eng No : 24-D1i 

~·~~~ 
1/, ~ 

Bid Opening: FeDruary 'ZT, 2025 el 10:00 am 

Oolo ....,1~/-7~ 
Dtnbla Dan,ooogn, U.C Wargo-, "1c ACPBIAmU.C Rac:he&ter Earth Inc 

Cngineers Estlma!e PO~fT 5055 Havena Rd 1'l5~AY6 Scnt 10J. P08o<170 
~Ni'1-ms Aloan, KY 1400t Butlab.NY'H<!112 North Chli, NY 14514 

@6!201-t~ (716)542-1333 71&-25!1.S071 SIIS-nS-0010 

": 1- I Eotlmaad I Unit 1/rit Una tJnil '"'~ 
Quancr,, Ur.it """' ....... 

"""" 
....;..,. ...... - p- - Pna, Am0uOI 

IO lea.,t'idd W.sct :-..z- n.,,J,, ~ I LS $.50.0CIC 00 s $C.00Q.OO s "7l1111J:CD· S .,_ s t'T7.1J75.(IJ s -; H.B'i.S.00 S 88.11G.00 S 88..116.tlJ S179JIXLOO s 171i 8CDC.O 
2 0 Aftamal2., ~ .._ Wa!fsl'~ Tank.Oend.ition 1 lS $9500000 s 95.000.00 S \256111).00 S 125_eao:00 s 125'350(1) 5. 125.35000 S 1&&116.00 $ JM..'11fUX> S1.90;,00 Oil $ 19050000 

Tomt ~ B10: 8'.c h.cm H111. 1 • X>.000 00 s 47 BOO 00 s H1$.?~ 0C s ~ .11603 s 179.900 00 
TOQl~•t DJd· Sit:i itt m N-9,,- 1 & 2 J t~,00000 111:uao.ao ~ .oo nn.m.oa S37Q,,,)OCI 00 

1 &l Low Bidder --- 3rdlow61dda" 

Bid lrmnnalities: 

l } ACP Bu"ak>, LLC Made changes to U1e total at\.erna!e 1 bld price and did no inifial lhe c:ha19'I Tots C~ rQ change Che bid results 

2) WBPJO Enmrp-ises, Ire. had a rna1h oow by not aYT9:lly adding Bid No t & 2 tagelher lD ~ lhe "Tatel AltBmatB 1 Bid Price" This cj(I nal dw,gR lhO bid results 

3) W8fVo Entwprisas, Inc. cfld not SIJbrn• lhe intact. full specffic:aticn Only Sedion 7 wu 6Ubrritted 

4) Durable Oemolioon tid nral irwal a chargB that was made try while aut Thi& did rot c:tange the bid r9&.JQs 



' U:rtlt'y tha t f/"l•S t..lOu !ation ~"' '1Ut" 

rcprl!'~C' r. l a~lon 01 bid s rcce-iv~d or. 

M,ccX:~'s~r;';iri:' 
-· 

3/2,0/-:t.5. ,.,, 
I I 

tern 
No O~ a 1p~0n 

:..c, COvc::rilt- tr'O'\W.tler P.,t.l ,t\ 

:...: • M.J, O...ctit• Iran knel• 1 M l• iD«feC'f ,., r MI Oval.t W~ 1rrc:. U-1/1 nr..rrft ,.. !r"MJ ~k-k'Ct\lc-Ni <S ,. 
u a· M J . Dua.ile 1r0r: a;.;nd ; o o~ rc-n 

1.0 S-'1c-\f""ll,~.bl)(~it "°"'W;)h!of~ 

•• II"" 11 r t .. :,pln,: SIN-;c-~ V.:Jw::Md "fa, 
so ~G.lttV..l!w 

" ,C,oef'C.ta.llM~Cl~.\1'W'fflllt't 

" ()w-;td(~~f':Jil!N:J<v:..1H ... .an:t~ , .. V--0.;,~rlUI ic,.- Cl-Mn-' 

LO 1• U:,, pon,Uon 

,: 1· t.o=,e,r ~ w o~" ci.c-1e1 LNn 

" ( • C,oO:,,t' l l'llulilUGn D", 0Clf" G.i\ J'I ?..lff'ffltnl 

u 1· Coooa lntt.11.lallDn by Non•O~ C...l , ... l/4" «-' "" ~ ~ Tniruf.-flUwft. Ot;i;t~ I 

'l..l.Q 1• 61t!! Slc p lft~o, h-wtfficlll: 

lLJ J"\~2~s:ii - 1'o 2CnnlwfJ'1;;;:\~0:tit 

", f .. ~ wy A~.at'I 
1.: 0 Stt 11tetJ\: • 
l>.O o.wh 
Ii.I UWn Re-stOf'atlon 

Hi1 F"i,dGXc,;ton,t;0., 
:,o l-tol\t.0."IQl 0 .:-t-ci tv-;31 Orl:li t1.II ...-lfhS'" ? 1(X" 

·;o.Q r l'ffA:tfflO!Ql 
l.90 eot'C"w.tllCluf ~!.IN. 

= ,.,......_,,. 
2.:..~ w-.. ~M•lf'II ~~..,,.. ,,~ Va.'w !cu~ 
uo iffi>'d/"3 n1 A\"l.<"Tlbl" ,\:,;ir,cj01\""('nl 

><-0 xot.:iui~~ 
a,, lto"W0"1Conn~~-.i.l'\IC:".w.tnkrl-"10t~(G,nl'lb:ltotWl~l ,. .. f1ov,c,'l t.tr. l i-o:St0•1e011::C\.Dilm 
z:l'.a S:Of111!1. L.-"'t(l! .~I( -· ,oo.111r""fJO'w"~ 
<I.C) ~-C,•urur 

0..0 tlani:.-or; 
◄3 .0 (l,-o,;o.,,tarv u:(,,i,v, t"°" s.!'-tt,C'd 

<0.0 , .. ,..._,,Sotd!w'ft't 
'5. l &"M:d-»"aet: ~P u·o,~· 
cs, s--~~1 • . 6":i,r 
46.! riy!::tantlwe,.,,,a,n. C'.tr ... "la"' 

"'' ~ !..thm~ 1.-~• .ID"' .:,,t X"" 
,n ,o ,~1~,,.."° :<r~~S&IIH 
,ao Type 3 Select Rl l - RW'I -Of•a.ink Gfcvcl 
49 0 Tvvc4So:!-.lect·:11 - S,:i.-.d 

50.0 l r.i~ 5 ~ t =;"il Controlled Oc n~1-,, ~u 
51.C VJJye.'11.Mt t.l.ttnJOl'i~ : •. :r. '1' Of~ 
.H, lc-m~rary~ncinR 

uo E•~Coc.,uo.l - .$1hftt« 
><< ,,.. 

cur ~-

Llnit ,, 
,:,. 
l • i 
Lo\ 
,:,. 

" I ... ,,. ... 
!:A ,. 
IA 

" '-' 
IJ' ... 
IA 
,:, ., 
" CF 
SF .. 
" ! .& ,.. 
" V. .. .... ,~ 
"' ... 
IJ' 
::T 
Lf 
CY 

CY 
EA I 
SA 

EA 

EA 

EA 

CY 

Ci 

CY 
,:, 
ta 

-· " .. 
:.Jnde f"K!'O',Jn(I 1nn:>vati o11 1- Gro•;p aid llem 13 O. ln.>ccural t' riac'l & 0-.-erall Et:t t'Mdl'd Tettal d ;d nol toLl l CD rT~"1y 

Reeves Road Water Main R~c.efTWl'll PT13iect 

vtflill•C~lnc. 

Engtnt.-#'t'"s tltimillte 
42S Old '-UGedon (enltt r Road 

Fairport.. New Yot1t 14450 
1585) 223-7697 

E$1,m.J~ll" Uno UM 
~nmv Price Amount .... Amount 

.um s 11..$..CIO S .t1•.,.D00..(10 S 'RI» s ..... .,.., .. s , s UlSt.Q) s ll1&Al s 705.<l0S 1.• t.o.m $ 

' s .u.;s.o:: s 2.MOJ)O s ns..oos lA<l"' s 
:, ' , - J)O s ::i.6SUI> s no.co s U.1?0Jl0 S 

4 $ :..J.0 .-"D s s~1n 00 s ' "'-"" s I.I- s 
- s I~ l !<.-• es.ao s ~-_.. s 

1 S u-m.m s U\O,D0 S "'.887'00 S 9.SSUIO S. 

' s ll.00 s ,,_.,., s ltallll S 1S.OC40, s 
' s ,.,so.oa s -S..00.00 s &5"'100 S S-toinOC s 
' s 7.700.00 !i 15«:a.m ~ ........ s 17.000.00 S 

41, .lllU !t 2.20 ' > 2.00 s a..nooo ~ 

" s 7IJJlJl s !'J.S'J'S..CO s 75G.OO S .l&.7SOa:I s 
, so s S7..IX! S .. __.. s liJ.00 s U.14!!0..,00 S 

70 ' 
U.00 s 1.7011.00 5 180.00 S 3,6oo.OO S ,., 

' SiS CXI .S Cl.JJ.000 S 40.00 s 29..800.00 S 

' s I..Q01Jl0 5 J.001.00 s >.l>OO.COS UOl.OO S ,. ~ UU.&.00 'S n:naco s "50.m s 1&.1SCDO s 
!S s 4!1..00 S 1..200.00 S -.:i2..00 S 1.JDQ.00 s 

343 S 1800 S 6,1"'4,0Cl S •JJO s 1.172.00 S 
60 S l lUll S 1.llSO.OO > oO.DO s 3,600.00 S 

143 s 20.00 S .U.000 S 6S.OO s 9.29S.OO S 
11.440 > LOil 5 -00 S LOO S 34 .880.00 S 
!7,160 --5 1 00 :!;; 11.lltO.GO S , 00 s 17..J,I.Q.00 'S 

,... s u,:uio s UJ..1200) s u sm s W~Dll.m S 
I -$ -~ """"'5 uoo.oo ! 1.11111.00 S 

"' s 111.al S 8,6Bll.OO s. IC0.00 s 4,000.00 s 
10 S 11&QQ :5- J.360..0) S" ttooo s >-.00 s 
I S -4 /,0.a.(IC! s ._00 S ...S00,03 S 45CQ..CQ S 
• s 12;.m s. l!m.00 S 5"3l.00 S 3,000.00 S 
I S ,noo s 7.864..IXJ S 7S0.00 s 6.000.Ql s 
' s ~ s 1 408..00 S 1.0CO.r.1:1 ; , .00111,i s 
' . J>l.J)J) s 9!i,&.O, s 15AOO • "°"' s 
' s 1SOCC S 

"""' 5 
..a.oos ICOOO < 

1~ ~ W.llO • tl.QXl CO S l4,CO '$ U80.00 s 
700 • ,..., s S,<m.00 $ IS.CO S 1000.oa ~ 
50 S lO.CD S 1.ooa co s 20.00 S l ,OCIODO S 
20 S 20.JXl S 400.00 $ 20.00 S 41)(1.JXl s 
10 S 30.00 S 6QQ.00 s 30.00 I s 60000 S 

I s 35:100 S 350.00 S 350 00 S 350.llll S 
: s lOO..OO s 100.00 $ 300.00 S 3C0JJl s 
' • ) 15.DO s nuo s 37S..00 ""5 n sco s 
: 5 !00.00 .s ice.or, s 10000 $ SCD.0:, S 
l S 200..00 S ;:oa.a;i, s 200.00 S l 01Ul0 S 

'5 s 2:S.OC s = o: s 2S.OO s USOl -S 
15 S 1i 00 S ~ -OCI S 16.oa S 400.m s 
30 S 15.00 S, 4.50,00 S lS.011 , &SQ.1ll) $ 

"' s so.co s l.000.00 s i0.00 s 1.000.00 $ 

! ' ..... s Zio:J .s :S tl) s >S.a> s 
-<m -S IJ)Q s 1.1100.00 S S.00 s ~OOO CO S 

"" ~ l.!IO s U00.00 S :,.00 s J.l00.11) s 

' ' - · '"'""' -i!.:IU,IXI .> ~ .00 > 
S,9",,?v.&.U,. m 

q,ece, (Qftstrl,JttkJI, Aillnm<O ,t~lne 

l3S19 We.st Le-e Ra.id 672A Frey Ro-d 
Albion, New Yortr 14411 M ;,ce<ton. New Yori 14502 

l S8SI 589-4481 (l1SIS3S-8291 

ilnff u ni t 

""" .,. ..... Price- Amoui'\t 

UCJXI S oa.-co oa s l3&l)O s ......., ... s 
....., s U00.00 -S _.,, , s U00.00 S 

i:cooo • LEOOJJO S 
'""""' s 

U00.00 s 
aoo.oo S· ll..>,>)JJO S li00.00 s uoo.00 s 
i OO.OO s iU(ICUlO ~ l!OHIQ S UOQ.QJ S 

"1.1111 s 0, s 7S..00 • 17,00,.00 S 
ID.SO).OO s :<>.!.0000 5 11.000lGO !, ~-· .00 s 17,,SCIO.Oj s l.40Q_(IC S, \7.&:m.00 $ 
7,20l.C)CI S U>00.00 • &.5CODO S •= s 

cf1J ' > s t&O!ll>M ~ 
..,,, s 16..!.Jl.tO S 4.00 • 17µoo:,. -· >.sa>.oo s 1.000.00 S :S.0,0.00 ' 
u.m s 1:.'!SOJ:10 S • ...., s zt,SO OO S 
35.lll • ,moo s 200 00 5 -4,QnCO S 

S6.00 S •ll.nGii)O S 7S.OO S ~= s 
flll.COS 

l.lS0.00 ' 
1.-400.00 -s. ♦,lD0.0'0 s. 

lJ5.<ID s U1S..00S I.COO.ti) s :u.o::no:, s 
90.00 S 2.!SC.00 S 4500 S ~JlS IXJ S 
,00 s 2.AOl DO S- I 00 S J-4.3.00 S 

S0.00 S- .3,ool.lJO .s la.DO S :..oeo.oo s 
32.00 S 4.57'-DO S 20.00 S ......... s 

2.SO s AU00.00 S 2.lXl s lUIOOO S 
..so s Cl.Jb0.00 S LOO S 17~ -5,. 

u.s.m s l!.O,lOQ.00 s l4DW 'S- IOC..,GCO S 
>.000.00 S !.oOOOO S .-.co s .....,..., 

t.OillD ) UCOJXI S · ~ .s '-"""" s 
som s S<JoOO S IISJJO s sso00 s 

1.ooom s l ,/JO).IIQ S iJXIIOO :5. 5.00).00 S 
00 S 1UCIQ..CICI S 10000 S l,lm!XI s 

s ,.,_,.,, 
''""" s 

4,000.(r) 'S 

- .. s >.AOODO s ""'m i s 1.Ml01Xl ' :5' 

.... oo. ,_ ... s 200,00 "i 60000 S 
1-J)!OllO .S nllD..00 S 200.m s ol(l)<IO s 

!AO.MS !& s sa.oo s l.000.00 s 
2'..111 s 1.000.00 S ,._ .. s SJI00.00 s 
2000 5 1.000.00 S: 20.00 S l .(IIJ.00 $ 
20.00 S 400.00 S 20 00 I s 400 00 S 
..... s 600.00 S 3000 S 60000 -S 

35000 S 350.Q) S 350 00 S JS0 OO S 
30(Ji>:> s 30ILOO s .lOOJ)O s 301a, S 
m.oo s 31500 S: ns.oo s m .co s 
1.00.00 $ 100..00 S 1 /J'JCO S 10000 5 
20l.OO S 200.00 ·S: XIJ.00 S- IOO.O'JI S 
lS.00 s 62S.CXI '5, ZS.00 S ru oo s 
WI) s 40000 S l.6..00 s 40Q.O)S 

15.00 ' ·- s 
15Jl0 S 450 00 S 

.!'J.00 s. l..OOOJI) $ S0.00 s l.00000 S 
ll.C0 > u.m s J'.S.CO S >S.00 s 

5.00' i - 1.1)011113 $ S.ll0 s 2J30QJlO s 
..... s UQO.COS LOO S U00,00 S 

=.ao > -00 • > 5,C.G.uu ,. , ........... 11.0"1&..fil.C,C 

Ent "1M, • 24-009 
At;l"' .'\lo·~ 

Bid 0PNU:'1g-~2.5 

U-~nd ~on, QtCMlp 

P O Bo• 536 
Ando~ r. NY1411Qf, 

{71 6) 498-84:.11 

Unit 

"''"' .=.moun1 

m.oo i. !t1UDD0CI 
I 00 !, Ull.00 
1.l))t00 S :.tS!.00 
l.lti.00 S ,,_ 
l.367 00 $ ~ 1&00 

~ ..... J:O 1 i09j4t000 
4.101.II) s cou,, 
V>t.o:i S UfilOJXI 

'"' s '.IS.ZOO.CO 
7,ntin ( \~ OVI M 

2.0) 5 U l!l.00 
Jlt.11) s a.,m.oo 
D..00 S = 68.00 s U60.00 
7'1.00 S Sl.l.5000 

9.lLOO '5 2.n u,o 
lZ8.oO s um.co 

6600 S 1.65<>00 
12..W !S ..11.;11KD0 

l S OO $ ~080.00 
20.00 s 2.86(),00 
100 S l.4.82000 
100 S i , 

1'1..00 S- lll..UQ.00 

=oo s Ul.OCO CO 
171 .. 00 S O;SA0,00 
l.9: 00 S l.91'>.00 

&1.a»JJO s IIZ.Oll<IJ 
U,SOO S :J.-'"l-UO 
J: <1500 '$ 21..M-:.OO 
1.mJJO $ l.l..61" 00 

456.00 S U "'-"O 
e&,00 S 1.31100 
:tll!JJO • """" .. 

U..00 • "-""'"" 
20.00 S 1,000.00 
20.00 S ◄ 00.00 

30.CC S 60000 
-..i s 35000 
300 00 S 3COJlO 
37500 S r.s..oo 
100 00 _:5 !ODOO 
20,ux, 1.s l<IC.JXI 
25.00 S 6>5 00 
16...QO S ,0000 
lS.DO S 050.00 

50 00 S umoo 
,S.00 5 >S.00 

S..00 s = 
,m s l.>00:00 

-""-"" > SO)~ 

= - ,.co 



2025 Tank Painting and Cleaning 

1 certify lhat lrns \abula tt0n ,s a true represent.ahon or tMds rece1\led 

or. Ma,ct 20~ 

Mar. Sm<h -~ 

Da te 3/z_;gs-

lte'n 

No Descnption 

11 State Road Tank Modificatro~s 

1 2 State Road Tank lntenor CoatmQ R~II!, 

13 Stale Road Tank Exter;or Cleanin:i & Coahnc ,. Slate Road Tank Vault Pip;nq Cleamna & CoatinQ 

2 1 Pen,-• f•nlc -1'Clll~ 

2.2 Pembroke Tank E.xtenor Cle.antnQ & Overcoatmci 

" Concrete Tank Test Patches - East Lake Roac::I Tan 1t 

3 2 Ccnc.re":E: Tank Test Palettes - Eastv,ew Tank. 

33 Concrete TanK Test Pald\es - Harek Roao Tank ,. Concrete Tank Test Patches - W1ll;mt Road Tank . , Eastview Tank r-Aeor.'lcatJcns 

42 HareK Road Tank ModIf1ca11or.s 

' 3 Wt/Iara Roa Cl Tank Mod1ficat1ons 

s, Tank C~ aning- Ch,,.m:hv~le Tank 

52 Tank Cleaning - Sou1n Ave Tan,1; 

53 lank Cleanina - W est BnCJhlon Tank 

< □ C Steel Ta11k Chipping and Grindi~ 

<1 C Sleel Tank. Deep Pit Weld Repair 

42 0 Steel Tank Seam W eld Reoa11 

43 ~ Tank. Cleaning • 1n:er.or Coatn~q H.c11dav Reoa1rs Uo to 20 raet 

◄3 2 Tank Cieani~Q - Interior Coa:.nq Hchctav Reoa1rs Greater Than 20 feet 

81d Inlormal1tIes· 

Eshmiilled 

Oi,antitv Unii. 

1 LS s 
40 HR s 
1 LS s 
1 LS s , LS s , LS s 
1 LS s 
, LS s , LS • 
1 LS s 
1 LS s 
1 LS • 
\ LS s 
1 LS s , LS • 
1 LS $ 

20 HR s 
2 0 HR • 
2.0 Lf s 

20 HR • 
10 HR $ 

Total B iel Pr ice. S 

1) s rave lneiustna Pa1n1,,,9 c1d nol sLbn·11! l''le in~ ct r\. 11 specitcation On y secM n 7 was subrr1ted 

2) Ere Paintng did not stamp their corpor.r.e resokJhon 

Eng No 24-007 

Btd Ooer:ing: March 20. 202s at ~o:oo a m 

Am..., a! Wuwn NY. blc, 

E191neers Est1ma~ 
82.5 Rein Road 

C.,__ NY 14225 
a, 6) 204,-9755 

UM unit 
Prtce Amoonl Price AroounL 

70 000 00 s 70.000 00 s 90.000.00 $ . 90,00Q.DO S 

1 000 00 s 40 000 00 s 1..450.00 s 58,000,00 S 

BOO 000 00 s BOC 000 00 s 7-46.700.00 s 748.700.00 S 

15 000 00 s 15 ODO CO s 38.000..00 S 38.000.00 s 
,s 000 □0 s 15 000 co s 34.000.00 s 34.000.00 S 

200~000 00 s 200 ooc 00 s 98.00D.QO s 98.000.00 S 
30.000.00 s 30 000 00 s 5.400.00 s SAOD.00 $ 

30 000 00 • 30 000 00 s 10.800.00 $ 10.800.00 S 

ss 00000 s ss.oco ~o s 10.IIOOJlO s 10.800.00 S 

30 000 00 s 30 000 00 s 1DJ!OO.OO s 10.900.00 S 

5 000.00 s 5 000 00 s 6,700,00 $ 8.700.00 S 

s :mo oo • B.000 00 s 20.100.00 s 20.,00.00 S 

5,000 00 s 5,000.00 s 6.700.00 s e.70QJIO s 
50 000 00 s 50 000 00 s .22.000.00 s 22.000.00 s 
58.000 00 s SB,000 00 s 22.000.00 s 22.00D.OO $ 

46 000 00 s 46.000 co s 22.000.00 ! 22.000,00 $ 

110 00 • 2..200.00 s 200.00 s 4.000.00 S 

1i 0 00 s 2.200 00 $ 200.00 s 4.000.00 S 

,ccoo s 2 000 00 $ 150.00 s 3.000..00 S 
700 00 s 14 000 00 s 700.00 s 14.00000 S 

1.0C0 00 s lC.000 00 s UlD0,00 $ 10.000.00. $ 

1 487 400 co s 1.235. 00D.OO s 

1st Lew Bidller 

ENI Palntlog &~--toe. Bra""lndus1r1al~U.C. 
Q99 Rein Road 177 Emwood Ave 

Cheel<lowaga. NY 14225 I.Jing Elrandl. NJ 077-40 
716-634-6746 732-.6403 

u,,a Urfl. 

Erice Amollnt Pna, -155.000.00 s 155.IJOO.OO s 180.l)ODJlO S 180,000.00 

1,750.00 s 70.000.00 s 1,00ILOO $ '411.00D.DO 
580.000,110 s 580.000.00 s 1.088.000.00· s 1.088.IIOCl.OCI 

10.000.00 S 10.000.00 .s 85.000.00 s IIUlOOJIO 
84,000.00 s 64.000.00 s 71,800.00. S 71..800,00 

195,180.00 s 195,180.00 s 300.DIID.OO s 300.0DOJIO 

21J.OOO.OO s 20.000.00 s 40;000.00 s 40,000.DO 

30.000.00 s 30 000.00 s 40,IICIO.OO s 4!>,GOO.DO. 

30,000.00 s 30J)OOllO s -4Q,QOO.QD I 40.l)00,110 

30.000..00 s 30.0DIJ.OO s 40,000.00 s 4Q.OOl1.00 

20,700.00 s 20.700.00 s 15.50Q.QD s 15.SQn.OO 

22.00D.OO S 22..llOD.00 ' 24.2IXIJID I 2UIIDJIO 

20.700.00 $ 20.700.00 I 16000.00 s 15.000..IJO 

35.000.00 s 35.000.00 s SC.000.00 I 50.000.DO 

ss.ooa.oo s 35.000.00 s 50.000.00 s 50.000.00 
35,000.00 $ 35.000.00 s 50,000.00 s 50,000.00 

150.00 S 3J)OO..OO s 110.DD s 22tlll.OO 

178.00 s 3.560.00 s 1111.00· S UOOJXI 

143.00 s 2.86G.OO I 100..llD s 2.000.0D 

700.00 s 1 .. J)C)Q.00 s TIii.DO $ 14.l)j)OJQ 

1 000.00 S ,o_ooo oo s 1 00IIJIO $ 10.IIIID.OO. 

1.386,000.0Q s 2. 139.900,00 

2nd low Bidder 



Medium Voltage Electrical Equipment Preventative Maintenance and Repair Services 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on March 26, 2025 at 11 :OD a.m. for this project. 

a, fvf~-= 
Date: Marer\ ~ !6. 

Item 

No. I Description 

Estimated 

Quantity I Unit 

Unit 

Price 

Engineers 

Estimate 

Amount 

Eng. No.: 25-S02 

Auth. No.: -

Bid Opening: March 26, 2025 

Resa Service, LLC. 

53 Marway Circle 

Rochester NY, 14624 

585-626-5562 

Unit 

Price Amount 

__ .1 ...... Field Technician - Normal Work Hours ·~··---·······-··· .. -····--··-··-·······--··--·---··· ....... 1 .8□ ......... HR .... $·---····· 150.00 __ $ . 27,000.00 ... $ --···· 138.00 $ 24,840.00 . 
2 Field Technician - Overtime Work Hours 16 HR $ 200.00 $ 3,200.00 $ 172.00 $ 2,752.00 

-•••••••• -••-h•~••• .. • .. ••--•·•••••-•••••·•••••••-••••• •••••------•-••n--••••••n••-•"•---••·•---• .. --- •••- •••-•·•-•••·•• -••-••••••••• _, ........... -•••••·• .. • .. •••••••••• --•••••-•••••·••-•--,.••-MOO+ , .. ~•••• ••·• .... •••••••-.. •••·• """- ·''· ..... •••••••••·•••• .. ••-••-••••-•uoo•o•• 

.... 3 .... Field .. Technician .. - .sunday &.MCWA HolidayWork .. Hours .... ,---········-·····-·-···16_ ....... HR $ 250.00 .. _$ .... 4.000.DD . $ 209.00 .. .. $ . 3,344.00 

4 Service En~ineer .. - .Office Hours ........ ·-···--· .............. --.. ·-·-···--·-··· ·····-· 45 ........... HR ... $ ........... 180.00 .. _ $ .... 8,100.00 .. $ 138.00 .... $ ·-········6,210.00 

... 5 . . Oil.Samples ·---····---·-······--·-··---··----~-----· .. ·-·-·····-·--6 · ____ EA_. $ ......... 350.00 _$ .... 2,100.00 .. $ 575.00_ .. $ ........ 3,450.00 . 
6 Material Allowance plus Material Mark-up Percentage 1 LS $ 11,600.00 $ 11.600.00 $ 11,200.00 $ 11,200.00 

Total Bid Price $56,000.00 $51,796.00 



lcl. 4 L, &V'. 

O.;ic~:_ ~r 

ltern 
, o [Dto.srnp~o 

LO Va.cu.um Egav:,ojo:-;, to ~rm1nc ~~ r~bre:-..al m l.j1.Wll 
'!.O 'l.oNu.::: ~GiWl~_n 1~ ~tci:_1mn ~ Scxcc-M_>_19rfu.l ln_l\tvcm c.m 

40 t Vff\l :..m Ea:c..-~a.o w l'kct.-rmirir.Sen-itt' ,\.1.uilU\21 m L1wn-.l 1 t;cirvt~c- D~ t-.c:rr,J1n 6 s=~ 

~Q..:t \ "Q;~a: ~"•anon i r, Oa~:JTIIM SN'V\C~ Mo.rwu,!__k, P.i~m:r_m .a: Sc:rvt<c ~th £x"ttj..~6 :'Mt 

ct OjV,1 c:i.1:.u11 f~v.,uor, ~1 nt,n-~~cc l.OC'.llna;i 1n !.Awn. 
iiJtl\'i»CU'llffl ~ri'ilti.01\ .U !U)~.·W~r~~-~-O.Cil!a.Ofll tn 11

.ll._"tct_eni 

<1 ~"'"'""" Ci.rl>llaJ< UIG>tlO> TOtol 

Bid 1Morm3htie5: V&H U."l<ierground did not submil the e1tl irc book, only Scction 7 

f.,nJrgtoJ' 
0...M.or• UM 

2..80000 J;,\ 

zoo.co EA 
7500 l.f 
~00[1 LF 
JO.OD £A 
5,00 EA 

100.00 f.A 

lln&lnecn-
2stima12 

Urm 
Prlc~ Amoom 

s 75D.00 s 2.100.0D0.00 s 
s 1.000.00 s ZU0.000.00 s 
$ ZOO.DO s 1s aoo.oo s 
.s 225.00 s JI.2.S0.00 s 
s 1,000.00 $ IU.000.00 s 
s 1..250.D0 s 6 ZS0.00 s 
s 250.00 $ 25,000.00 s 

0 .361,.SOO.:OO , 
-

2025 Vacuum ~avou:lon ConP":Kl 

T&KH..ln1ftlUJD 
12'94 Sta:ir.Htchw:;iy 12 

Crc.eM , Nrvir York nne 
b07-6S&•7S3S 

Unlr 
Pr,a AJnaun: 

60D.00 s 1.680.000,00 
715.00 s 14l.ll00.0<) 

SD.OD s J.750J)0 
SD.OD s 2.500.00 

600.00 s 6,000.00 
715.00 s 3575.00 
100.00 $ 10.000.00 

___ Sl,84l!J!~,oo 

Low Bidder 

$ 

s 
s 
$ 
5 
I, 

s 

tumsey eonsuuruirs. inc. 
57ll Ca1ew:ay P.ark 

LakevLlle. ~ew York 14480 
s,e5.34o.on.o 

IJa.il 
rll("~ ...... , 

600 oo t S l.6SO~ S 
1.rno.00 S ~ ZlD~.$ 

• SO.DO S 13.750.00 $ 
500 00 ~Oj)Q,DD S 

1 ZOO.DO i I Z.000.0D S 
~00 S 7,50_9.00 $ 

725 00 S 7:t.500.00 $ 

S2.0_!0.1•u.u 

2nd Low Biddder 

Ens No : 2s.01s 

W.,~onttJuctlon.lo,;. 
425 Old M- Cc,rt,r Road 

Faupon, !low York 14450 
sss=-76<J? 

UOil 
!'!!<, 

6,SS.00 S 
i.no.lio_ 1 
~ 
~ 
679.40 S 

1.720.00 ~ 
zoo.oo rs 

-1.918.00000 

~ 
11 125-DO 
~ 

6.79-<.00 
~ 

ioql)O ('Q 

SZ,3'l.9.Z6'J.OO 

3rd I.Dw Bidddcr 



I ,~mfy U,Jt lhi.s Labl.l..lal.Jor. 1s a rruc 
rcpre!lent.a llcfl of bu.is rccc1 ved tln 

::"'TWro~~P•••~• 

'f[uLzs OJ;,c. 
i • 

h11n: 
So. !Jr<-'"..tr...no-ft 

I 111 -- CottwltJtior. ,n f..awn 
L21r (cit'Oftntion i.n.h·vetet'nt 
211:·ea~~ ln.tta,lar,(!nBvOuc11Cut iet..awn 
'2..2 t .. Coouef" lnS:tJlladon hv OQrtli (\1l ir.: Ph'eme.nt 
~U 1 • Co..,-1n~ul!Ar.4on ov Non-O[Ul'n Cuc 
"'-.0 : "" C:l.t tb..S:.a:, tn Lawn or Pa-.·tmtnt 

.;Ol) Rodc.~w:,J 

•·..o AodtPnlUnfl 
12.1 1 .. 1/ ?"' or l" Conxn,ilttQn In U w.n 
~22 t -1n· or2. .. Cot:)aradim 1n Pn~mmit 

Hl \ . ! / ?. • ot r Cotteer 1nsulbtfct~ t1VOD.C!n Cut lo lawn 
(l-2 l·l f 2." or 2" Co:,otr lnJt.tllation ,.,,.,O~n(ut In h \·tment 
,+o 1~1n• ori· CoJt;Jerln~Dllauon bv N"on,ODc:".I Cll t 

•~O 1~112· or'2'" Curb S<os, in Uwn orP•vemrn, 
1!1.0 6x'ol6:"':lt0r'Y &xt.:iw•llon l~ Lawn 
-<70 ,._._klr.iilOf'' E>.c.a,.-::it'in::t :n P.rv~n.\ 

foul 

Sid JnrorrruLtJt"s: V&B Un1:krgroum:I did not submit the enure bo~k on!y Section"/ 

.Estima ted 
0 -.ntJtv Urut 

~000 EA s 
3600 E,\ s 

L700.DQ LF 5 
76300 LF s 
i20.0Q LF s 
1.26.00 £j\ s 
SOOD CY s 
SO.OD I.F s 

1.00 EA $ 

I 1 00 ell s 
1 2000 I.F s 
I 20 00 LI s 
I zo 00 I.JI s 
I l 00 Eh s 
I 10.00 CY s 
I 1000 r:v s 
I 

20:.!S WatCT Service RepJii.ce-mcnt ProieCl Co111ract 

£11g ~o : 2S.·003 

YIOager Construetion. Inc.. Cea.aee BalJd.inc. ~.dfoq. JDC. ~ Coanrumn~ rat. 
£naJneers 425 Old M.icedon Center Road 946 JUbntic Avenue- 5711 Gmway Pan<. 
Estlmaie faif'l>O~ 'Sew York 14450 RodJe:sttr.Htw Yoik 144S() uk~NewYork.14490 

58S·Z23-7697 SSS-S27-BOZD 585-346--0720 
Unit Unit Unit Unit 
Pnce .\mown Price AmOUJJ t ._ Amowll Pna, -1.ooa.00 s 90.000.00 s L4-00 00 s \l6,l)QQ.0-0 s 1 ..,__,_00 s :lS♦-960.:00 · $ 6,60QJJO s S9+.000.00 
1.850 DO s 66.600.00 s 2,601l00 s 93.600.00 s .snoo s 175.392.00 s 6.900.00 S 243 . ..00.00 

SO.O D s BS.OOOQO s 24.50 s 4U.S0..00 s saoo s 98.600.DO s SO.DO s BS.ODO.GO 
100 00 s 1M00.00 s 74.00 s SMl.0.00 s 12.UlO s 92565.00 s 70.00 $ 53 S.<0.00 

75.D0 5 39 000 00 s 1250 s 6SOO.OO t U LOO s 64920:00 $ 2BILOO s H.5 . .60ll.OO 
1.500 00 $ 189.000.00 $ 2.()(lllOO $ 25:!..DOO.OO s 650.00 s Qt 900.00 S "-400.00 s :IOi.4-00.00 

ZS 00 s 1.250.00 s 250.oo I s 12.SC0.00 $ 2D0.00 s 10:000.00 s JOO.DD .S 15000.01) 
25 DO s 1.250,00 $ 375.00 I s 18 7S0.00 s 200.00 s 10.noo.oo s 225.00 $ IJ..250.DO 

L250.00 s L2S0,OO s 3.ooo.oo I s 3.000.00 s 3.<1110.00 s :3.'JOOJIO s 7,000.00 s 7,0011.00 
2,000 00 s 2.000.00 s ♦.0011.00 I s 4.000.00 $ 5.400.00 S, 5,400.00 s 7.'<!111.DO s 1.sno.011 

65 00 s 1.3011.00 s 28.-00 I s 560.00 s 7500 s L500.00 s ·100.00 s Z.OOD.00 
125.00 s 2.500.00 s 91.00 I s LB20.DO s 140.DO s 2.800.00 s 115.00 s 2,300.00 
90.00 I LBOOOO s 54.00 I $ 1,080.00 $ 15:ll.O.O $ 3.0llll.llll s i6S.DO s 3300.00 

2.DOD.00 I 2.000.00 s 3.67S.OO I S 3,675.00 s UDO.OD $ 4.300.00 s 1.S00.00 s 1S00.00 
SO.OD s S00.00 s 175,00 • S 1,750.00 s 100.00 s 1.00D.00 $ 900Jl0 $ 9.000.00 

100-00 s 1.000.00 s 37S.DO I S 3.750.00 s 150.00 s 1500.00 s 950.00 s 9.S00.00 
SSJI0.~50.00 $627.245.00 S909,7$7.00 S'l.497,300.00 

Low 8 ,dde r 2.nd l ow 81dd~r 3nJ Low 8 ::id~r 



WWTP Fire Protection System Extension - Rebid 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on April 23, 2025 at 10:30 a. m. for this project. 

By: ~~,:;71 L 4/{ 

Date: A.e_ril 25, 2025 

Item 

No. Description 

1 WWTP Fire Protection Extension 

Total Bid Price 

Engineers 

Estimate 

Estimated Unit 

I Quantitv I Unit Price Amount 

I 1 l LS $ 77,500.00 $ 77,500.00 

$77,500.00 

Eng. No.: 24-S10 

Auth. No.: 241-100 

Bid Opening: April 23, 2025 

Johnson Controls Fire Protection LP 

475 Mile Crossing Blvd. 

Rochester NY, 14624 

585-737-2821 

Unit 

Price Amount 

$ 77.000.00 $ 77,000.00 

$77,000.00 



Neptune Bid WA042503 
Item# GROUP A : ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY Unit Price Total Price 

1 5/8" x 1/2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2 $ 130.00 s 260.00 
2 5/8" x 1/2" PROCODER900i T-10 INSIDE SET METER 200 $ 183.00 s 36,600.00 
3 5/8" >< 1/2" PROCODER900i T-10 PIT SET METER 2 $ 193.00 $ 386.00 
4 5/8" >< 1/2" MACH10)R900i METER 2 $ 245.00 $ 490.00 
5 5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2 $ 130.00 $ 260.00 
6 5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER900i T-10 METER INSIDE SET METER 12,000 $ 183.00 $ 2,196,000.00 

7 5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER900IT-10 METER PIT SET METER 2 $ 193.00 s 386.00 
8 5/8" X 3/4" MACH 10)R900i METER 2 $ 245.00 $ 490.00 
9 5/8" X 3/4" MACH lO)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 170.00 $ 340.00 

10 1" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2 $ 240.00 $ 480.00 
11 1" PROCODER900i T-10 INSIDE SET METER 200 $ 290.00 $ 58,000.00 

12 1" PROCODER900i T-10 PIT SET METER 2 $ 300.00 $ 600.00 

13 1" MACH 10)R900i METER 2 $ 320.00 $ 640.00 
14 1" MACH 10) STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 235.00 s 470.00 
15 11/2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2 $ 460.00 $ 920.00 

16 11/2" PROCODER900i INSIDE SETT-10 METER 48 $ 530.00 s 25,440.00 
17 11/2" PROCODER900i PIT SET T-10 METER 2 $ 540.00 $ 1,080.00 
18 11/2" MACH10)R900i METER 2 $ 626.00 $ 1,2S2.00 
19 11/2" MACHlO)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 535.00 $ 1,070.00 
20 2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2 $ 620.00 s 1,240.00 
21 2" PROCODER900i INSIDE SET T-10 METER 48 $ 680.00 s 32,640.00 

22 2" PROCODER900i PIT SET T-10 METER 2 $ 690.00 s 1,380.00 

23 2" MACH10)R900i METER 2 $ 720.00 $ 1,440.00 

24 2" MACH10)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 660.00 $ 1,320.00 

25 2" HPTTURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 775.00 $ 1,550.00 
26 2" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 1,820.00 $ 3,640.00 
27 3" HPT TURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 1,490.00 $ 2,980.00 

28 3" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 2,650.00 s 5,300.00 

29 3" MACH 10)R900i 12" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,018.00 $ 4,036.00 

30 3" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 12" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 1,915.00 $ 3,830.00 

31 3" MACH 10)R900i 17" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,067.00 $ 4,134.00 

32 3" MACH lO)STAND ALONE 17" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 1,967.00 $ 3,934.00 

33 3" FIRE HYDRANT DIRECT READ METER W/CPLG & VALVE 2 $ 1,700.00 $ 3,400.00 

34 4" HPTTURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 1,680.00 $ 3,360.00 

35 4" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 3,300.00 $ 6,600.00 

36 4" MACH 10)R900i 14" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,250.00 $ 4,500.00 

37 4" MACH lO)STAND ALONE 14" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,150.00 $ 4,300.00 

38 4" MACH 10)R900i 20" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,520.00 $ 5,040.00 

39 4" MACH lO)STAND ALONE 20" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 2,420.00 $ 4,840.00 

40 4" PIii SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 8,800.00 $ 17,600.00 

41 6" HPTTURBINE PROCODER900I PIT SET METER 2 $ 2,495.00 $ 4,990.00 

42 611 TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 5,100.00 $ 10,200.00 

43 6" MACH 10)R900i 18" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 4,100.00 $ 8,200.00 

44 611 MACH lO)STAND ALONE 18" LAY LENGTH METER 2 s 4,000.00 $ 8,000.00 

45 6" MACH 10)R900i 24" LAY LENGTH METER 2 $ 4,300.00 $ 8,600.00 

46 6" MACH lO)STAND ALONE 24" LAY LENGTH METER 2 s 4,200.00 s 8,400.00 

47 6" PIii SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 13,900.00 s 27,800.00 

48 8" HPT TURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 3,615.00 s 7,230.00 

49 8" MACH 10)R900i METER 2 $ 7,400.00 s 14,800.00 

SD 8" MACH lO)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 7,300.00 $ 14,600.00 

51 8" PIii SS F/5 COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 18,200.00 $ 36,400.00 

52 10" HPTTURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 5,600.00 $ 11,200.00 

53 10" MACH 10)R900i METER 2 $ 9,440.00 s 18,880.00 

54 10" MACH 10)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 9,340.00 $ 18,680.00 

55 10" PIii SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2 $ 22,050.00 $ 44,100.00 

56 12" MACH 10}R900i METER 2 $ 11,110.00 s 22,220.00 

57 12" MACH lO)STAND ALONE METER 2 $ 11,010.00 $ 22,020.00 

58 2" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 422.00 $ 844.00 

59 3" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 757.00 $ 1,514.00 

60 4" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 1,310.00 s 2,620.00 

61 6" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 1,760.00 $ 3,520.00 

62 8" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 3,000.00 s 6,000.00 

63 10" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2 $ 4,654.00 $ 9,308.00 



64 3" STRAINER KIT SS FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2 $ 3,850.00 $ 7,700.00 
65 4" STRAINER KIT SS FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2 $ 4,846.00 $ 9,692.00 
66 6" STRAINER KIT SS FS/PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 6,100.00 $ 12,200.00 
67 8" STRAINER KIT 55 FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2 $ 9,200.00 $ 18,400.00 
68 8" STRAINER KIT SS PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 11,210.00 $ 22,420.00 
69 10" STRAINER KIT SS PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 13,100.00 $ 26,200.00 
70 3" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2 $ 420.00 $ 840.00 
71 4" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2 $ 760.00 s 1,520.00 

72 4" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 760.00 s 1,520.00 
73 6" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS/PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 1,050.00 s 2,100.00 
74 8" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2 $ 1,250.00 $ 2,500.00 
75 8" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 1,400.00 $ 2,800.00 
76 10" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 2 $ 1,950.00 $ 3,900.00 

77 2" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 595.00 s 1,190.00 
78 3" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 841.00 $ 1,682.00 
79 4" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,085.00 $ 2,170.00 
80 6" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,575.00 $ 3,150.00 
81 8" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 2,065.00 s 4,130.00 
82 10" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 2,558.00 s 5,116.00 
83 2" TRU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,450.00 s 2,900.00 
84 3" TRU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,810.00 s 3,620.00 
85 4" TRU FLO UM E PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,940.00 $ 3,880.00 

86 6" TAU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 2,810.00 $ 5,620.00 
87 4" P Ill UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 1,930.00 s 3,860.00 

88 6" P Ill UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 2,800.00 s 5.600.00 
89 8" P Ill UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 3,600.00 $ 7,200.00 
90 10" P Ill UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 $ 4,500.00 s 9,000.00 

91 3" MACH 10)R900i UME 2 $ 1,570.00 s 3,140.00 
92 3" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 1,470.00 s 2,940.00 

93 4" MACH 10)R900i UME 2 $ 2,075.00 s 4,150.00 

94 4" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 1,975.00 $ 3,950.00 
95 6" MACH 10)R900i UME 2 $ 3,050.00 $ 6,100.00 

96 6" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 2,950.00 s 5,900.00 
97 8" MACH 1D)R9001 UME 2 $ 4,025.00 s 8,050.00 

98 8" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 3,925.00 $ 7,850.00 

99 10" MACH 10)R900i UME 2 $ 5,005.00 $ 10,010.00 

100 10" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 4,905.00 $ 9,810.00 

101 12" MACH 10)R900i UME 2 $ 5,990.00 $ 11,980.00 
102 12" MACH lO)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 5,890.00 $ 11,780.00 

TOTAL GROUP A: $ 3,008,924.00 



Neptune Bid WA042503 

ITEM # I QTY GROUP B: ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE 
1 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODER STAND ALONE REGISTER W/TIGPAIL WIRE s 79.00 $ 1,580.00 

2 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODER STAND ALONE REGISTER W/18" WIRE $ 79.00 $ 1,580.00 

3 20 5/8" - 2" PROCODER900i INSIDE SET REGISTER $ 147.00 $ 2,940.00 

4 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODER900i PIT SET REGISTER s 158.00 $ 3,160.00 

5 20 6' PIT ANTENNA s 22.00 $ 440.00 

6 20 20' PIT ANTENNA $ 27.00 $ 540.00 

7 20 R900 V4 PIT SET MIU $ 101.00 s 2,020.00 

8 20 R900 V4 WALL SET MIU s 81 .00 $ 1,620.00 
9 20 CMIU WALL SET $ 120.00 $ 2,400.00 
10 20 CMIU PIT SET $ 142.00 $ 2,840.00 

11 2 POCKET PROREADER RF $ 872.00 $ 1,744.00 

12 2 POCKET PROREADER BATTERIES $ 52.00 $ 104.00 

13 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR POCKET PROREADERS s 3,706,00 $ 7,412.00 

14 2 BELT CLIP TRANSCEIVER $ 5,600.00 $ 11,200.00 

15 2 BELT CLIP TRANCEIVER BATTERIES s 136.00 $ 272.00 

16 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR BELT CLIP TRANSCEIVER s 6,342.00 $ 12,684.00 

17 2 MRX MOBILE DATA COLLECTOR $ 8,900.00 s 17,800.00 

18 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR MRX MOBILE UNIT $ 5,770.00 $ 11,540.00 

19 2 MRX 12V AUTOMOBILE POWER CABLE $ 157.00 $ 314.00 

20 2 REGISTER TAMPER SEAL PINS s 0.13 s 0.26 

21 500 5/8" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE NT-10 s 19.00 s 9,500.00 

22 2 5/8" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE s 19.00 $ 38.00 

23 2 3/4" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE $ 29.00 $ SB.DO 
24 2 1" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE s SB.DD $ 116.00 

25 2 1-1/2" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE-10 MOLD TO SIZE $ 130.00 $ 260.00 

26 2 2" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE s 170.00 $ 340.00 

27 2 2" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO s 400.00 $ 800.00 

28 2 3" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO s 720.00 $ 1,440.00 

29 2 4" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO s 785.00 $ 1,570.00 

30 2 6" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO s 1,300.00 $ 2,600.00 

31 2 1-1/2" CONTROL BLOCK ASSEMBLY T-10 s 10.00 $ 20.00 

32 2 2" CONTROL BLOCK ASSEMBLY T-10 s 10.00 $ 20.00 

33 2 2" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 57.00 $ 114.00 

34 2 3" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 57.00 $ 114.00 

35 2 4" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 115.00 $ 230.00 

36 2 6" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO s 140.00 $ 280.00 

37 2 2" STRAINER COVER GASKETS s 2.00 $ 4.00 

38 2 3" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 2.10 $ 4.20 

39 2 4" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 5.40 $ 10.80 

40 2 6" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 7.00 $ 14.00 

41 2 8" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 10.00 $ 20.00 

42 2 10" STRAINER COVER GASKETS s 12.00 $ 24.00 

TOTAL GROUP B: $ 99,767.26 



NEPTUNE BID WA042503 
Item# GROUP C: ITEM DESCRIPTION 

1 NEPTUNE 360 SAAS PLATFORM ANNUAL SUBSCRIPTION 
NEPTUNE 360 CELLULAR ENDPOINT ANNUAL DATA 

2 SUBSCRIPTION 
3 NEPTUNE 360 SET-UP FEE 
4 NEPTUNE 360 ON-SITE TRAINING 

TOTAL GROUP C: 

TOTAL BID - GROUP A 
TOTAL BID - GROUP B 
TOTAL BID - GROUP C 

TOTAL BID - GROUPS A-D 

Total Price 

$ 68,096.25 

$ 51.24 
$ 
$ 
$ 68,147.49 

$ 3,008,924.00 
$ 99,767.26 
$ 68,147.49 
$ 3,176,838.75 



MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY 

WA 042502 MALWAREBYTES RENEWAL 

.-,---,--- -- --·-----·- ~ I 
(1) 

ITEM INSIGHT 
(2) 

No. QUANTITY DESCruPTION 
PUBLIC 

ATLAZ 

SECTOR, 
INTERNTN'L 

INC. - -1 275 EA Malwarebvtes Threatdown Elite $22,052.25 $21,312.50 
2 70 EA Malwarebvtes Threatdown Elite Server $9 988.30 $9,702.00 
3 10 EA Malwarebvtes Threatdown Mobile Security $99.50 $100.00 

---- - --- ----___ ....._ TOTAL BID $32,140.05 $31114.50 

----- -

(3) (4) 
vPmMH NEWBEG, 

Tl!CH,INC, INC, 

$21.483.00 - $ZOJ391.75 
$9,730.70 $9,463.30 

$96.B0 $94.20 

$31,310.50 $3M49.ZS 



WA052504 DUMPSTER SERVICE 

475 Norris Drive; Rochester, NV 14610 location 

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly 

6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly 

40 Yard Open Construction/Demolition Dumpster, Service Weekly 

4799 Dewey Ave; Rochester NV 14612 location 

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly 

6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly 

ZOS Norris Drive; Rochester, NY 14610 location 

6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly 

4 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly 

1325 Paul Road; Churchville, NY 14428 

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly 

593 Basket Road; Webster, NV 14580 

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly 

*Additional Services and Costs as Needed 

Extra Pickup for 8 Yard Dumpsters 

Extra Pickup for 6 Yard Cardboard Dumpsters 

Service Charge Per Haul For 40 Yard Dumpster 

Disposal Fee Per Ton for 40 Yard Dumpster 

TOTAL: 

Waste Management 

$ 
$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 

$ 
$ 

$ 

$ 
s 

Annual Total 

1,920.00 

1,260.00 

1,200.00 

1,920.00 

1,260.00 

1,260.00 

1,080.00 

1,440.00 

1,080.00 

12,420.00 

$100.00/pick 
$100.00/pick 

$250.00/haul 

$71.00/ton 

Casella Waste Systems 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

NOBID 

Suburban Disposal 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 
NOBID 

NOBID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NOBID 

NOBID 



I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on May 27, 2025 at 10:30 a.m. for this project 

B): ;lfu fL ?z 
Date: Ma_r27, 2025 

Engineers 

Estimate 

Item Estimated Unit 
No. Description Quantilv Unit Price Amount 

1 Dredging and Sludge Transfer 1 LS $150,000.00 $150,000.00 

Total Bid Price $150,000.00 

Backwash Channel Dredging 

Synagro Northeast, LLC Empire Marine Corp. 
435 Williams Court, Suite 100 101 Ketchum Rd. 

Baltimore MD, 21220 Hilton NY, 14468 

410-688-4438 585-545-1035 

Unit Unit 
Price Amount Price Amount 

$120,550.00 $120,550.00 $175,950.00 • $175,950.00 

$120,550.00 $175,950.00 

Denali Water Solutions, LLC 
220 W . Commerce Ave. 

Russellville AR, 72801 

315-374-8645 
Unit 
Price Amount 

$ 188,000.00 $188,000.00 

$188,000.00 

Eng. No.: 25-S01 

Auth. No.: 

Bid Opening: May 27, 2025 

New England Aquatic Services, LLC 
12 Leach Hollow Rd. 

Shennan CT, 06784 

203--885-2318 

Unit 
Price Amount 

$ 445,166.67 $ 445,166.67 

$445, 166.67 





GROUP 40440 -Vehicles, Class 1-8 

Group 40500-23166, VEHICLES, Class 1-8 

Form B (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Response (Item 1) 

Revision Date: 10/17/23 
See the "Instructions and Definitions" worksheet for general fo rm instructions. The Contractor business name in Row 3 and Mini-Bid Request Number in 
Row 7 will automatically populate based on responses on the "Response Summary" worksheet, Use the drop-down menu to complete Question 1.1 in Row 
B, and then complete the yellow-colored cells that appear in Parts A through D below. Failure to enter a response in a yellow-colored cell may result in 
rejection of your Mini-Bid response. 

Contractor: TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT, INC ' • :I" 

1.0 Mini-Bid Questions 
1 o Mini-Bid Reference Number from Form A (Chassis/Body Combination): Mini-Bid Request (e g 

15060001) 

1.1 Item Number for this Mini-Bid 

Contractor Response 

WA062505 

Item 1 

1.2 Is the Mini-Bid for Vehicie(s) to be purchased or leased by the Authorized User? [click on yellow Purchased 
box and use drop-down menu] 

2.0 Vehicle Questions 
2.1 What type of Vehicles were requested in the Mini-Bid, and are being offered in this Mini-Bid 

Response? [click on yellow box and use drop-down menu] 
(Note: Contractor mwt cells below will be black until this gueslion rs answered. The Contractor answer 
to this question will res,,Jt in corresponding cells on this worksheet /urning to yellow for Contractor 
input . A Complete Vehicle is defined as the Product that is the result of the Chassis and Body being 
·oined together to form a Vehicle that is ready for use and requires no further manufacturing operations 
to perform its intended function.) 

Body only (Contractor will not be required to 
coordinate installation of a Chassis on the awarded 
Body) 

• 
2.2 Is the Chassis, Body, or Complete Vehicle offered in this Mini-Bid Response to be Built to Built to Specifications 

Specifications, Pre-Existing Inventory (i.e., off the lot), or a combination? 
{click on yellow box and use drop-down manu] 

2.3 Can the Vehicles offered for the Mini-Bid be delivered by the delivery date specified? Yes 
[Note: A Mini-Bid response may be deemed non-responsive and be rejected if the Vehicles cannot be 
delivered by the delivery data specified} 

2.4 Does the Vehicle offered meet all Authorized User Specifications for the requested Vehicle? Yes 
[Note: See Form A (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Request and the ''Additional Vehicle Specifications 
Document" included with the Mini-Bid Request, if epplicab/e] 

2.5 Enter the estimated number of days after receipt of a Purchase Order, or other ordering 135 
document, that the delivery will be made. 

2 .6 Enter the Final Order Date for the Vehicles offered for the Mini-Bid (Enter "TBA " if the date has not N/A 
been announced by the manufacturer, or "NIA" if there is no Final Order Dale) 

Part 8: Vehicle(s) Offered for Mini-Bid 

[Enter the requested information for the Chassis and/or Body offered for the Mini-Bid in the ye/low-colored boxes below] 

■ -... 
-.. 

' __.. 
---

"' ,.. I 
L.. 

1.0 Chassis Information Contractor Response 
1 1 Chassis Model Year - ~ -
1.2 Chassis Make (e .g., Ford, International, Freighlliner) ::i,- ■ . .......... r7 

1.3 Chassis Model (e g, F450, DuraStar, M2-106) ~ ~ _,. -1.4 Chassis Model Code (the OEM code used to identify a particular subset of a Model) I - "'c:'1=:.JL., 
1.5 Chassis provider business name (i .e., Contractor or third-party) . I ·7 ,, ..----4 -~- /I 

1.6 Chassis Aftermarkel Components Provider(s) : Enter the vendor business name(s) of the Aftermarket ~--- = --

r 

■ 
,, 

.J 

= 

-

= 

. 
Components Provider(s), if applicable. If not applicable, enter "NIA" ~ ·~ ~ 2.0 Body Information 

Award 23166 Item 1 Page 1 



GROUP 40440 -Vehicles, Class 1-8 

2.1 

22 

2.3 

2.4 

2.5 

2.6 

1.0 

1.0 
1.1 

1.2 

1.3 

1.4 

1.5 

1.6 

1.7 

2,0 
2.1 

2.2 

2,3 

24 

25 

Body Model Year 2026 = !'7~ 
Body Make (e g., Viking, Galion) FELLING ~ 

I 

Body Model (e.g ., Praline, 450U) FT-45-2 LP - .... 
Q ;;; = 

Body Model Code (the OEM code used to identify a particular subset of a Model) FT-45-2 LP - --- - -
Body provider business name (i.e , Contractor or third-party). CONTRACTOR = ~- - E 
Body Aftermarket Components Provider(s): Enter the vendor business name(s) of the Aftermarket NIA 

~~ Components Provider(s), if applicable. If not applicable, enter "NIA". ,,_c;;;;: .n_JJ 

Part C: Additional Information 
If applicable, enter any deviations from the Authorized User Specifications, or other additional information applicable to this Mini-Bid. Bidders are strongly 
encouraged to submit proposed deviations to the Authorized User by email prior to the Mini-Bid Response Due Date, so that they may be given due 
consideration prior to the submission of Bids . Do not enter information about Options or Aftermarket Components available for the Vehicle offered, unless it 
has been included in the Authorized User Specifications. If not applicable, enter "NIA" 

NIA 

• 
_L 

Part D: Vehicle Request Price Worksheets 

Enter the requested pricing information for the Chassis and/or Body offered for the Mini-Bid in the yellow-colored boxes below in the "Chassis Price 
Worksheet, "and "Body Price Worksheet". Complete the pricing worksheets for each type of Vehicle request as follows: 

Complete Vehl,;lo. If the Mini-Bid is for a Complete Vehicle in which the Chassis and Body are sold and marketed by different OEMs, complete both the "Chassis Price 
Worksheet" and "Body Price Worksheet" for the Vehicles offered 

Chassis Onlv : If the Mini-Bid is for a Chassis only, with no Body, complete the "Chassis Price Worksheet" for the Chassis offered. If the Authorized User is supplying the 
Body for a Complete Vehicle, then enter the NYS Contract Price for installation of the Body in the "NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body)" field in the "Body Price 
Worksheet" 

Bodv Onlv : If the Mini-Bid is for a Body only, with no Chassis, complete the "Body Price Worksheet" for the Body offered. If the Authorized User is supplying the Chassis for a 
Complete Vehicle, then include the NYS Contract Price for installation of the Body in the "NYS Aftermarke/ Components Price (Chassis)" field in the "Chassis Price 
Worksheet " 

Chassis Price Worksheet Price 
NYS Base MSRP (Chassis) --.: 

-
NYS Discount (Chassis) •: 0.00 
{Type a number only (e.g., 5.5); Do not type a percentage sign(%) after the number; For 5 5% type 5.5, not 0.055]. I 
NYS Base Price (Chassis) $0.00 
{Automatically calculated: NYS Base MSRP (Chassis) minus NYS Discount (Chassis)]. 

NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Chassis) [If there are no Aftermarket Components, leave blank] I - . 
NYS Price For Vehicle (Chassis) $0.00 
(Automatically calculated: NYS Base Price (Chasis) plus the NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Chassis)]. 

Number of Vehicles (Chassis) {This quantity must match the Number of Chassis specified by the Authorized User in the ..,, 
Mini-Bid Request] 

Total Price For Mini-Bid (Chassis) (Automatically calculated: the NYS Price For Vehicle (Chassis) multiplied by the Total Enter Pricing or Number of 
number of Chassis]. Chassis 

Body Price Worksheet Price 
NYS Base Price (Body) $42,445.73 

' 
NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body) [If there are no Aftermarket Components, leave blank] 

.,._ 

NYS Price For Vehicle (Body) $42,445.73 
(Automatically calculated: NYS Base Price (Body) plus the NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body)]. 

Number of Vehicles (Body) {This quantity must match the Number of Bodies specified by the Authorized User in the Mini- . 1 
Bid Request] . 
Total Price For Mini-Bid (Bodies) [Automatically calculated: the NYS Price For Vehicle (Body) multiplied by the Total $42,445.73 
number of Bodies]. 

13.0 !Grand Total Price For Min_i-_B_id_ fo_r_lt_e_m _____________________ __._ ___ P_r_ic_e ___ __. 

Award 23166 Item 1 Page 2 



GROUP 40440 -Vehicles, Cla89 1-8 

Grand Total Price For Mini-Bid for Item 
[Automatically calculated as the sum of the following] : 

$42,445.73 1) Total Price for Mini-Bid (Chassis), if applicable; and 
2) Total Price for Mini-Bid (Bodies), if applicable 

Award 23186 Item 1 Page 3 



GROUP 40440 -1/ehicles, Class 1-11 

Group 40440-23166, VEHICLES, Class 1-8 (Vehicle Marketplace) 

Form B (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Response 
(Response Summary) 

Revision Date: 10117123 
See the "Instructions and Definitions" work.sheet for general fom1 instructions. Cells below will be black-colored until Question 1 1 and 1 2 are answered 
Complele all yellow-co lored cells Failure to enter a response in a yellow-colored cell may resull in the Min~Bid Response being being deemed non­
reponsive and in the disqualification of the Mini-Bid response 

1.0 !Mini-Sid Questions 
1 1 I Mini-Bid Reference Number (e g Tl 5060001 , see Fonm A (Chassis/Body): 

Mini-Bid Reque5/) 

1 2 I Number of Items included in this Mini-Bid (see Fonm A (Chassis/Body): Mini­
Bid Request) 
{click on yellow cell and use drop-down menu]. 

2.0 !Contractor lnfonnation 
2 1 ! Full Legal Business Name, including □BA if appl!cab!e 

2 1 IOGS Contract Number (e g , PC12345) 

2 3 I Federal Employer Identification Number/ FEIN (e g 14-1234567) 

2 4 I NYS Vendor ID Number (e g . 1000012345) 

3.0 I Primary Contact Information 
3 1 I Conlact Name 

3 2 I Conlact Email 

3 3 !Contact Phone (1) 

3 4 I Contact Phone (2) 

4.0 !Secondary Contact Information 
4 1 I Conlacl Name 

4 2 !Contact Email 

4 3 IConlact Pnane (1) 

4 4 IConlact Phone (2) 

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary 

Contractor Response 
WA062505 

16-1058204 

100000-u.10 

I\IJ.CK PADULO 

PADLJLO@~CEYROA□ .. COM 

(585)27B-8840 

(315)437-1471 

JENNIFER KENT 

JKENT@l:RACEYROAD COM 

(315)350-2076 

(315)437-1471 

A..,.==-
~ 

-- -

-

_ ... 

7-
.,> 

--"!"_. -
Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary shall be automatically populated, based on Contractor input on the 1tem" wor1<sheets Cells in each Item Row will be black-colored until a number of Items is indicated in Question 1 1 above After a number of 
Items is selected, the corresponding Rows will be unhidden IF "Enter Pricing" appears in a Row for an Item, that indicates that the pricing for that Vehicle (Chassis, Body) on the applicable "Item" wor1<sheel has not been completed by the 
Contractor In order to submit a responsive Mini-Bid response, all requested information for all Items included in the Mini-Bid Request should be entered on the applicable "Item" worksheet 

If "Enter Pricing" appears in the "Grand Total Price for Mini-Bid" cel l (Cell R39), that indicates that all required pricing information has not been entered by the Contraclor on the applicable "Item" worksheet Failure to enter all required pricing 
information tor an Item shall deem the Mlni--Bid response for that Item non-rasponsive and shall result in the rejection of the Mini-Bid Response for the Mini-Bid. 

It.em 
Chassis 
Model Year 

Chassis Make 
Chassis 

Chassis Model !Model 
Code 

Total# of lNYS INYS Base 
Chassis Discount Price 

(Chassis) (Chassisl 

Total Price 
BodyMod1tl 

for Mini-Bid 
(Chassis) 

Year 
Body Model 

Total# 
NYSBase Total Price !Grand Total Price 

Body Make Body Model of For Mini -Bia for Mini-Sid for Code 
Bodies 

Price(Body) 
(Bodlts) Item 

Enter Pnang 
Item 1 a oo $0.00 0< NU/llbef of 2026 FELLING FT-45-2 LP FT-45-2 LP 1 $42,445 73 $42 445,731 $42,4457J 

C~assls 
ltem2 

Award 23166 Response Summary Page1 



2028 Roor Rthablllletlon Program 

I certll'y that this Tabulatton is a true representation of bide received ::ffl-:;:-JJI:---
o,m } 2o )_DJS 

Item EaUmated 
No Description Quantity Unll 

Echo Street Pump Stalion Modified Bituminous 
1.0 Built-Up Roof Overlay System 2,4110 SF 

Low Lift Pump Station #1 Modified Bituminous Built 
2.0 Up Roof Overlay System 2,950 SF 

Wlacons111 Street Storage eundlng Moelilled 
3.0 Bituminous Built-Up Roof Overlay System 830 SF 

Total Bid Prfco 

Bid lnformallUas: 

Spring Sheet Metal And Roofing 1.) 

s 

$ 

s 

I s 

Engineering No.: 24-020 
Aulhorizetton No.: 164-400 

Bid Opening: Thursday, June 19, 2025 at 10:00 a.m. 

' 
~na1Sli\t/Pr.'1ij)lll~11~. o 

e'll8i.®l/l..lbir•A\lenuJ1'Sou. 
Englnee~s EsUmata BO!ll\A4teC\,~ ·1.1rnfo 

., ~-
. 

Unit Cost EaHmatad Cost Unli{EfifJ\, I llatrn'lalacl•<teilll 

47.00 s 116.150.00 •• fA'lt~ llt ·•· :~lf81tioo.soi .. 

47.00 $ 138,860.00 • ◄lllilAI .I .~m .«a2;ais . 
47.00 s 39,010.00 "S 48.db, 's-. 3'9,it4'0i00~ 

2s2,a1 o.oo I, t 
1st Low Bidder 

Unit p11oe In worda Ia Wllttan as the mulllpllcallon of Iha estimated quanllty 
and unit price In figures. MultlpllcaUon of the aatlmatad quantity and unit 
price In Rgures does not matcll a>ctendad total In figures. The corrected Bid 
amount is $286,372.60. This lnformaHty does not change the Bid results. 
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ITEMNO 

1 

2 

3 

4 

WA062506 48" CONCRETE ADAPTERS 

DESCR 

48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP BELL X MJ SPIGOT (PLAIN END) ADAPTER-MCWA #2246 

48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP SPIGOT (PLAIN END) X MJ SPIGOT ADAPTER-MCWA #2245 

48" GROUT BAND DIAPERS 

48" LCP LAY GASKETS 

TOTAL: 

*Thompson Pipe Group was found to be non-responsive as they did not sign the Certificate of Non-Arrears. 

Rangeline *Thompson Pipe 

$9,552.00 $9,808.00 

$9,552.00 $9,808.00 

$72.00 $0.00 

$200.00 $0.00 

$19,376.00 $19,616.00 



Webster WTP Filter GAC Replacement 

Town of Webster 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on August 26, 2025 at 10:30 a.m. for this project. 

By: ??-1 fLL1 

Date: Au.9.ust 26, 2025 

Engineers 

Estimate 

Item Estimated Unit 

No. Description Quantity Unit Price Amount 

1 Filter Media - GAC 1 LS $ 1,082,000.00 $ 1,082,000.00 
oooa••-•-••••• ........................ _ , ,_,.., __ ,_._., __ , ______ --u-•--•• ·--·-·--- ....... ,o-•·••-•HHnOoo,, ...... - • •••• •- ····-- -••UooO .. OO H OOO 

2 Filter Media - Additional Sand 1200 CF $ 25.00 $ 30,000.00 

Total Bid Price $1 ,112,000.00 

Eng. No. : 25-S05 

Auth . No. : 152-000 

Bid Opening: August 26, 2025 

Carbon Activated Corporation Calgon Carbon Corporation 

3774 Hoover Road 300 GSK Drive 

Blasdell NY, 14219 Moon Township PA, 15108 

(716) 821-7830 (412) 787-6700 

Unit Unit 

Price Amount Price Amount 

$ 1,010,000.00 $ 1,010,000.00 '$ 1,061,400.00 $ 1,061,400.00 
............. --,····-···""-·-- .. _____ ,, _____ ....... ···-····---····-~·--·---·· ...... 
$ 40.00 $ 48,000.00 $ 17.60 $ 21,120.00 

$1,058,000.00 $1,082,520.00 



Monroe County Water Authority 

Lee Road Booster Pumping Station 35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear Rebid 

Bid Tabulation 

I certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received 

on August 21, 2025 11 :00 a.m. for this contract. 

By: 

Date: 6/_!:i t,,,:;;'" 

Eng. No.: 22-S07 

Auth. No.: 142-600 

.. .. 
Bid Opening: August 21 , 2025 11 :00 a.m. 

VP Supply Corporation 

3445 Winton Place 

Engineer's Estimate Rochester, NY 14623 

585.455.2584 

Item Estimated Unit Unit 

No. Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Price Amount 

1 35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear 1 LS $ 1,500,000.00 $ 1,500,000.00 $ 1,337,625.000 $ 1,337,625.00 

Total Bid Price $ 1,500,000.00 $ 1,337,625.00 



$1,600,000 

$1,400,000 

$1 ,200,000 

$1,000,000 

$800,000 

$600,000 

$400,000 

$200,000 

$-

[ ■ Total Bid 

Lee Road BPS 35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear Rebid 
August 21, 2025 Bid Opening 

Bid Results 

Engineer's Estimate VP Supply Corporation 
$1,500,000.00 $1,337,625.00 



To: 

From : 

Subject: 

MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY 
P.O. Box 10999 • 475 Norris Drive• Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999 

Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220 

Larry Magguilli 

Laurel Neff 

Recommendation for Bid Award 

Date: 08/28/2025 

File: WA 082507 

Copies: 

Bids were received on August 28, 2025 for Broadcom/VMWare VSphere Foundation Licensing. 
The apparent low responsive responsible bidder was CDW Government, with a bid of 
$36,576.00 for one year. 

One other bid was received from Insight in the amount of $38,743.68. However, they were 
determined to be non-responsive as they failed to return the signed Proposal and Affirmation 
of Understanding that were required in the bid documents. 

I recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible bidder. 

/In 

~ pproved by ___,_f ~ --~ __ / __ _ 
Department Head Date 

Date 

(Dis)Approved by _________ _ 
Executive Assistant/Board Date 



f certify th.at this tilbulation is a. true 
represenr:J.tion of bids rcccived on 
S-t;nr,nb~Ja...:?02S t i :O:OU a.m. for this project 
/j "() , -, 

BL____,LJJ,~ 

j/11.lz5'" 11:i lr-
I 

Item I 
f'(o Oes.c:r..ntioc 

1.0JGos Well Ab•ndonml!nt 
Total 

Sid Informalities:: Sam Koehler Enterprises did not fill out the bid price in figures 

E:Jtu'!lu,d I t\\111"".tlr'i" UO!t 

I.DO I LS 

Walker Road GasWeUAbaadonmentRe-Bld 

Eng. N°" H-S04 

Sam Xmhler Ente,prlgs PlallCS and Goodwlo, Inc. 
Eaglo .. n 191 Slaght Aaad 360 Hig!l Street 
Esllmab! Andover, NY 148D6 Brad£onl. PA 16701 

607-382-0301 814-598-1474 

Unit 
I 

Unit 
I 

Unit 
I - Amount Prv Amow,t Prier Amount 

S 50.000.00 I s 50.000..00 S 79,000.00 I f 79,000.00 S 148.845.00 I s 148,845.00 
$50.000.00 579,000.00 Sl48.845,00 

Low Bidder 2nd Low Biddder 
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