Scrubber Installation, Webster WTP

[ certify that this tabulation is a true Eng. No.: 24-501
representation of bids received on Auth. No.: 241-000
December 12, 2024 at 10:00 a.m. Bid Opening: 12/12/2024

for this project:

By:  Buk T - WatlH—

Branden Farnsworth-Weinblatt, PE
Erdman Anthony

Date:  20-Dec-2024

John W. Danforth Company Crosby-Brownlie, [nc,
Engineer's 930 0ld Dutch Road 100 Nassau Street
Estimate Victor, NY 14564 Rochester, NY 14605
(585) 924-7030 (585) 325-1290
Item Estimated Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1.0 |WWTP Scrubber 1 LS |$ 279,616.00|$ 279,616.00 |$ 278,700.00|$ 278,700.00 [$ 357,630.00 |$ 357,630.00
$ 279.616.00 $ 278,700.00 $ 35763000

Bid Informalities:
1. There were no informalities in the bids.



Monroe County Water Authority
WA 122416 - Salt Supply for Corfu WTP

Bid Tabulation A

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received Eng. No.: N/A
on December 20, 2024 at 11am  for this contract. Auth. No.: N/A

Bid Opening: December 20, 2024 at 11am
M@L,L |
Christopher J. LaM;nna. P.E.. Director of Production

Date:  12|31|2 4

Midwest Salt LLC Compass
1300 West Washington St 9900 W. 109th St.
West Chicago, IL 60185 Overland Park, KS 66210
630.513.7575 913.344.9200
Item Estimated Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount
1 |Delivery of Salt for Corfu WTP 170 TON|$ 52500 $ 89,250.00| $§ 21000 | $ 35,700.00
Total Bid Price $ 89,250.00 | $ 35,700.00
Non-Responsive'"”

Notes:
1. Bid determined to be non-responsive for multiple deficiencies including submission of the bid by electronic mail (not acceptable), failure
to complete all required forms properly, and failure to submit required documentation for the product including copy of NSF certification,
Safety Data Sheet (SDS), and chemical analysis.



WWTP High Duty Pump #3 Motor Rehabilitation

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received

on January 28, 2025 at 11:00 a.m. for this project.

o (2O

Date: January 28, 2025

Town of Webster

Eng. No.:
Auth. No.:

24-513
6443

Bid Opening: January 28, 2025

Power-Flo Technologies, Inc. KJ Electric
Engineers 270 Park Ave 5894 East Molly Road
Estimate Garden City Park NY, 11040 Syracuse NY, 13211
(516) 812-6800 (315) 454-5535
ltem Estimated Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1 |WWTP High Duty Pump #3 Motor Rehabilitation 1 LS | $ 40,000.00| $ 4000000 (| $ 3452900 % 3452900| $ 58,598.00 | $ 58,598.00
2 |Miscellaneous Additional Work Aliowance 1 LS | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00| $ 10,00000| $ 10,000.00| $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Total Bid Price $50,000.00 $44,529.00 $68,598.00




Gates Water Main Replacements
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BID TAB - WA 012501 HYDROVERGE VALVE EXERCISERS

ITEM F.W. Webb | Blair Supply | Ferguson Ent., | Core & Main Intermtn
# Co. Corp. LLC e Tech. Int, Inc. |Sales, inc.
1 |HYDROVERGE HYDRANT BUDDY XL-VALVE & HYDRANT EXERCISER | $ 27,974.45 | S 40,600.00 |$ 27,737.36 | $ 35,873.25|$ 36,050.00 |$ 30,866.99
2 |HYDROVERGE ADJUSTABLE VALVE KEY-78"-135" $ 3,00055|$ 3,815.00|$ 291347 |$ 3,325.00 (S 3,675.00($ 2,800.00
LESS PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT: $ 61950 % $ 5 $ 99.31 |$
TOTAL: $ 30,355.50 | $ 44,415.00 | $ 30,650.83 [ $ 39,198.25 | $§ 39,625.69 | $ 33,666.99




2025 Water Storage Tank Demolitions

| cetify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received
on February 272025 at 0,00 a m e confras,

el

BlE/ZS

Eng No: 24019
Bid Opening. February 27, 2025 sl 10:00 a m

Ot
Dwabls Damehtion, LLC ‘Wargo Erterpnses, ic ACP Bufigio. LLC Rochester Earth Inc
Engineers Estimale PO&»-?‘! 5055 Havens Ra 135 Delgware Ave Suit 102 PO Box 170
Lotipar, NY 14085 Akron, NY 14001 Buffalo, NY 14202 North Chifi, NY 14514
(716)542-1333 716-259-8071 585-775-0010
tiem l Estimated Unit Una Uns nit
No |Description Ouai Urit Poice Asmount : Prica Amaunt PE Ameurd Pree
10 |Conficia Waict Sioraoe Tark Demaliton 1 LS $50.00C 00 s S0001S s 1T7EVE00 | 5 97875001 S JIG00 | 5 8811600 $179.600 00 s 175 800 00
20 Aftemate #1: Watar Tank Demalition 1 LS $85 000 00 $ 9500000 S s 1SS0S 125350004 § 184118001 § 184 145 00 $190 500 00 $ 190 500 00
Totzl Base 8ig: Bid nem No. 1 3 509200 3 47 800 00 ] 317 87500 3 5511800 $ 475 800 00
Total Alternate 1 Bid: 8id lam No. 182 3145000 DOI $172.450.00 $243.22% 00 $273.232.00 $370.300.00
16l Low Bidder 2rd Low Bldder 3rd Low Bidder
Bid Infonnalities.

1) ACP Buffaio, LLC Made ehanges (o e total attemate 1 bid price and did no initial the change Tris cid not change the bid results
2) Wargo Enterprises, Inc. had a malh emor by not comeclly adding Bid No 1 & 2 togsiher 1o equal the “Tatal Alterate 1 Bid Prics” This did nal change (he bid results
3) Wargo Enterprises, Inc. did not submd lhe intact full specification Qnly Sedlion 7 was submitted

4) Durable Demalition did nal initiel 8 change that was mada by while aut This did nat change the bid resudts
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WWTP Fire Protection System Extension - Rebid

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received Eng. No.: 24-S10
on April 23, 2025 at 10:30 a.m. for this project. Auth. No.: 241-100

Bid Opening: April 23, 2025
By: 72“:7 %ZM

Date: April 25, 2025

Johnson Controls Fire Protection LP
Engineers 475 Mile Crossing Blvd.
Estimate Rochester NY, 14624
585-737-2821
ltem Estimated Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity [ Unit Price Amount Price Amount
1 |WWTP Fire Protection Extension 1 LS | $ 77,500.00 | $ 77,500.00 | $ 77.000.00 | § 77,000.00
Total Bid Price $77,500.00 $77.000.00




representation of bids received on

2025 vacuum Excavaton Contract

Aprl\17}lmf";hf project Eng No: 25-015
Ity /{ L —
TA&K Harrington Ramsry Consuruciors. nc. Viliager Construction, loc,
Bt ‘{/zz /p_s' Sngineers 1294 State Riphway 12 5711 Gateway Park 425 0l Macedop Center Road
T 7 Estimare Creens, New York 13778 Lakevilie, New York 14480 Fairport, New Yorik 14450
607-656-7535 5B85-340-0720 585-223-7697
ltem Exmumated Uni Unir Wit Unit
s Urur Price Amaam Price Amgunt Prce Amount Price Amoumt
Na i ———— == . oo s e ——c
L.0] Vacuum Excavatios to Determ;ine Service Material in Lawi 2,500 00 [7) 75000 '3 2100000001S 60000 |5 168000000 60000 1.,680,000.00 $95.00 191800000
701 Vo runm Excavanen (o Betermine Senvice Material In Pavement 200.00 EA 1.000.60 | § 20000000 | § 715.00 | $ 143.000.00 1.i10.00 22000000 | §  L720.00 34400000
acusim Ercaveuon W Determinie Service Material in Lives a1 Serviee D & Feot 7500 I.F 20000 | S 15,000.00 | § 50.00 750.00 450.00 31,750.00 17500 13.125.00
vation to Dot=rmine Sorvice Materal i Pavement at Service | &Feet sooe LF 5 22500 ; % 11.250.00 | § 50.00 2.500.00 500 00 25,000.00 17500 £750.00
in Excavation at non-Waler Service Location in Lawn 10.00 FA < 100000 S 1000000 | S 60000 6,000.00 1,200.00 12,000.00 57940 79400 |
[z 0[Vacuam Excavation at o Water Senyce Locaton i Iavement 5.00 EA S 1250005 625000 [S 71500 357500 1.500.00 3.500.00 1.72000 00
A 0/C Cirh Box Locaos 10000 | FA S 25000 ]S 25.000.00 [ S 10000 10,000.00 72500 7250000 [$ 20000 [§ 200000
Total 52367.500.00! 51,8 52,050,/ 50.00] ,319269.00
Bid tnformalities: V&H Underground did not submil the entire baok, only Section ? Low Bidder 2nd Low Biddder 3rd Low Biddder



) cerufy that this labulatior. 1§ a true
representalion of bids received an

ApnlW\Ws project
By /{1 [

2025 Water Service Replacement Project Contract

Eng No: 25-003

Villager Consaruction, lnc. i 17 Inc Ramsey lac.
Due "/]?.l I’ZS Enginecrs 425 QId Macedon Center Razd 946 Atlantic Avenue 5711 Gateway Park.
TR Estimate Fairport, New York 14450 Rochester, New York 14450 Lakeville, New York 14480
585-223-7697 585-527-8020 585-346-0720
itarn Estimated Unit unit Unit
No. |Descrption uanb! Unit Prce Amaunt Price Amount Price Amount
s — — e — e
{L111" Corporstion in Lawn 3000 EA S 100000 18 $0.00000 1S 140000 12 | $ 39440013 354.960:00

L 12]1" Corporation in Favement 3600 EA § 185000 S 6660000 1 S 260000 53600.00 | $ 3 175.392.00
Copper Installanen by Open Catin Lawn 1700.00 LK 50.00 8500000 | s 2450 4165000 SE.00 98.600.00
2.2{1" Copper lastallation by Open Cut ir Pavernent 76500 LF 10000 ?ﬁ,s__gg.no 74.00 56,610.00 12100 92.565.00
3 011" Copper Installation by Non-Open Cut 52000 LF 75.00 39.00000 12.50 .00 12100 62.920.00
40" Curb St (o Lawn or Pavement 12600 CA 1.500.00 189,000.00 2.000.00 252.000.00 £50.00 81900.00
40 0| Rock Jemoval 5000 cy 2500 125000 | S 25000 | S 12500.00 20000 10.000.00
AL.0]Rock 50.0a LF 500 125000 1§ 375.00 | § 18,750.00 200.00 10,000.00
4211 1-1/2" or " Corparation in Lawn 1.00 EA $ 1250.00 125000 | S 300000 | ¢ 3.0600.00 3,900.00 .900.00
4221.1/2" or 2° Corporation in Pavement 100 EA $ 200000 2.000.00 | 3 4.000.00 | S 4.000.00 5.400.00 .400.00
431[1-1/2" or 2° Couper Installation oy Open Cut in Lawn 2000 LF 5 6500 130000 | § 280015s 560.00 7500 L500.00
£3211-1/2" or 2" Copper Installation by Open Cut in Pavement 2000 LF s 125.00 | § 2.500.00 9100 s 1820.00 140.00 .800.00
45 0{1-1/2" or 2" Copper Instailation by Non-Open Cut 2000 LF 3 9000 | § 1.800 00 5400 § 1.080.00 150,00 3.000.00
450]1-1/2" or 2" Curb in Lawn or Puvement 100 EA S 2.0000 2.000.00 3.675.00 | § 3.675.00 430000 | § 4.300.00
45.0| Exploratory Exeavation in Lawn 1000 | Y 3 50.01 S0000 | § 17500 | § .750.00 10000 | § 1.000.00

47 0|Expluratary Excavatian in 2avement 1000 | CY 3 100.0 10000018 37500 | § 3.750.00 000 | $ 1500.00 950,00 9.5040.00

Toul 6095000, S62 T.yﬂﬂ — 5909.737.00 $1.497
8id Informal.ses: V&B Underground did not submit the enure book. only Section 7 Low Bidder Znd Low Bidder 3rd Low Bidder



Neptune Bid WA042503

Item # GROUP A : ITEM DESCRIPTION Qry Unit Price Total Price

1|5/8" x 1/2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2] 8 130.00 | S 260.00

2|5/8" x 1/2" PROCODER900i T-10 INSIDE SET METER 200] $ 183.00 | S 36,600.00

3|5/8" x 1/2" PROCODERS00i T-10 PIT SET METER 2| $ 193.00 | $ 386.00

4]5/8" x 1/2" MACH10)JR900i METER 2[$ 245.00 | $ 490.00

5[5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2| $ 130.00 | $ 260.00

6[5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER900i T-10 METER INSIDE SET METER 12,000| § 183.00 | $ 2,196,000.00

7(5/8" X 3/4" PROCODER900IT-10 METER PIT SET METER 2| $ 193.00 | $ 386.00

8/5/8" X 3/4" MACH 10)RS00i METER 2| $ 245.00 | $ 490.00

9|5/8" X 3/4" MACH 10)STAND ALONE METER 2| § 170.00 | $ 340.00
10| 1" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2| $ 240.00 | $ 480.00
11| 1" PROCODER900i T-10 INSIDE SET METER 200| $ 290.00 | S 58,000.00
12| 1" PROCODER900i T-10 PIT SET METER 2| 8 300.00 | $ 600.00
13| 1" MACH 10)R900i METER 2| s 320.00 | $ 640.00
14| 1" MACH 10) STAND ALONE METER 2| $ 235.00 | $ 470.00
15(1 1/2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2| s 460.00 | $ 920.00
161 1/2" PROCODERS00i INSIDE SET T-10 METER 48| $ 530.00 | S 25,440.00
17|1 1/2" PROCODERSQ0i PIT SET T-10 METER 2| § 540.00 | $ 1,080.00
18|1 1/2" MACH10)R900i METER 2|8 626.00 | S 1,252.00
191 1/2" MACH10)STAND ALONE METER 2|8 535.00 | $ 1,070.00
20| 2" PROCODER STAND ALONE T-10 METER 2| $ 620.00 | $ 1,240.00
21| 2" PROCODERS00I INSIDE SET T-10 METER 48| $§ 680.00 | S 32,640.00
22| 2" PROCODERS00i PIT SET T-10 METER 2| s 690.00 | S 1,380.00
23| 2" MACH10)R900i METER 2] $ 720.00 | $ 1,440.00
24| 2" MACH10)STAND ALONE METER 2| 8 660.00 | S 1,320.00
25/|2" HPT TURBINE PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2| 8 775.00 | S 1,550.00
26(2" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODERS00i PIT SET METER 2| 8 1,820.00 | $ 3,640.00
27(3" HPT TURBINE PROCODERS00i PIT SET METER 2| $ 1,490.00 | $ 2,980.00
283" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2| $ 2,650.00 | S 5,300.00
29(3" MACH 10)R900i 12" LAY LENGTH METER 2§ 2,018.00 | $ 4,036.00
30[3" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 12" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 1,915.00 | § 3,830.00
31|3" MACH 10)R900i 17" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 2,067.00 | $ 4,134.00
32(3" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 17" LAY LENGTH METER 2| 8 1,967.00 | $ 3,934.00
33|3" FIRE HYDRANT DIRECT READ METER W/CPLG & VALVE 2| 8 1,700.00 | $ 3,400.00
34|4" HPT TURBINE PROCQDERS00i PIT SET METER 2| $ 1,680.00 | $ 3,360.00
35(4" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODERS00i PIT SET METER 2| 8 3,300.00 | $ 6,600.00
36(4" MACH 10)R900i 14" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 2,250.00 | § 4,500.00
37(4" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 14" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 2,150.00 | S 4,300.00
38|4" MACH 10)R900i 20" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 2,520.00 | $ 5,040.00
39(4" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 20" LAY LENGTH METER 2§ 2,420.00 | $ 4,840.00
40(4" PIII SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODER900I PIT SET METER 2] $ 8,800.00 | $ 17,600.00
41[6" HPT TURBINE PROCODER900I PIT SET METER 2] $ 2,495.00 | $ 4,990.00
42(6" TRU FLO COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2| 5,100.00 | $ 10,200.00
43|6" MACH 10)R900i 18" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 4,100.00 | $ 8,200.00
44|6" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 18" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
45|6" MACH 10)R900i 24" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 4,300.00 | $ 8,600.00
46(6" MACH 10)STAND ALONE 24" LAY LENGTH METER 2| $ 4,200.00 | $ 8,400.00
47(6" Pill SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODER900i PIT SET METER 2| $ 13,900.00 | $ 27,800.00
48(8" HPT TURBINE PROCODERS00i PIT SET METER 2| § 3,615.00 | $ 7,230.00
49|8" MACH 10)R900i METER 2l 8 7,400.00 | $ i 14,800.00
50|8" MACH 10)STAND ALONE METER 2| $ 7,300.00 | $ 14,600.00
51[8" PNl SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODERI00I PIT SET METER 2| $ 18,200.00 | $ 36,400.00
52(10" HPT TURBINE PROCODERS0Oi PIT SET METER 2| 8 5,600.00 | $ 11,200.00
53[10" MACH 10}R900i METER 2| ¢ 9,440.00 | $ 18,880.00
54|10" MACH 10)STAND ALONE METER ) 2| $ 9,340.00 | $ 18,680.00
55|10" PIl SS F/S COMPOUND PROCODERS00i PIT SET METER 2] 8 22,050.00 | $ 44,100.00
56[12" MACH 10)R900i METER K 11,110.00 | $ 22,220.00
57[12" MACH 10)STAND ALONE METER 2| 8 11,010.00 | $ 22,020.00
58/2" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2] § 422.00 | S 844,00
59|3" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2| $ 757.00 | $ 1,514.00
60[4" NL BRONZE STRAINERS ) 2| $ 1,310.00 | S 2,620.00
61/6" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2] § 1,760.00 | $ 3,520.00
628" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2| $ 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
63[10" NL BRONZE STRAINERS 2| 8 4,654.00 | S 9,308.00




64|3" STRAINER KIT SS FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2| $ 3,850.00 | $ 7,700.00
65|4" STRAINER KIT SS FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2| $ 4,846.00 | S 9,692.00
66|6" STRAINER KIT SS FS/PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| $ 6,100.00 | $ 12,200.00
67|8" STRAINER KIT SS FIRE SERVICE LENGTH 2| $ 9,200.00 | $ 18,400.00
688" STRAINER KIT SS PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| $ 11,210.00 | $§ 22,420.00
69/10" STRAINER KIT S§ PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| $ 13,100.00 | S 26,200.00
70/3" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2| § 420.00 | $ 840.00
714" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2| $ 760.00 | S 1,520.00
72|4" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| § 760.00 | S 1,520.00
73]6" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS/PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| $ 1,050.00 | $ 2,100.00
74(8" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT FS LENGTH 2| $ 1,250.00 | $ 2,500.00
75(8" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 2| $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00
76|10" SPOOL KIT W/2" TEST PORT PROTECTUS LENGTH 28 1,950.00 | S 3,900.00
77{2" HPT UME PROCODERS00i PIT SET 2| $ 595.00 | $ 1,190.00
78|3" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET B 2] 8 841.00 | $ 1,682.00
79|4" HPT UME PROCODER9Q0i PIT SET 2| $ 1,085.00 | $ 2,170.00
80(6" HPT UME PROCODERS00i PIT SET 2| § 1,575.00 | $ 3,150.00
81[8" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2 S 2,065.00 | 5 4,130.00
82|10" HPT UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2| $ 2,558.00 | $ 5,116.00
83|2" TRU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2| $ 1,450.00 | $ 2,900.00
843" TRU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2l § 1,810.00 | $ 3,620.00
85[4" TRU FLO UME PROCODER900i PIT SET 2| $ 1,940.00 | $ 3,880.00
86/6" TRU FLO UME PROCODERS00i PIT SET 2| $ 2,810.00 | $ 5,620.00
87(4" P Ill UME PROCODERS0Qi PIT SET 2| $ 1,930.00 | S 3,860.00
88|6" P IIl UME PROCODERS0QOi PIT SET 2| § 2,800.00 | S 5,600.00
89(8" P Ill UME PROCODERS00i PIT SET 2($ 3,600.00 | S 7,200.00
90{10" P Il UME PROCODERS00i PIT SET 2| $ 4,500.00 | $ 9,000.00
913" MACH 10)R900i UME 2| $ 1,570.00 | $ 3,140.00
923" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2| $ 1,470.00 | S 2,940.00
93[4" MACH 10)RS00i UME 2| $ 2,075.00 | $ 4,150.00
94|4" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2| $ 1,975.00 | $ 3,950.00
95(6" MACH 10)R900i UME 2| $ 3,050.00 | $ 6,100.00
96|6" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2] $ 2,950.00 | $ 5,900.00
97|8" MACH 10)R9001 UME 2| $ 4,025.00 | $ 8,050.00
98|8" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 3,925.00 | S 7,850.00
99{10" MACH 10)RS00i UME 2§ 5,005.00 | 5 10,010.00
100{10" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2($ 4,905.00 | $ 9,810.00
101{12" MACH 10jR900i UME 2 $ 5,990.00 | $ 11,980.00
102|12" MACH 10)STAND ALONE UME 2 $ 5,890.00 | $ 11,780.00
$

TOTAL GROUP A:

3,008,924.00




Neptune Bid WA042503

ITEM #I QTY GROUP B: ITEM DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

1 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODER STAND ALONE REGISTER W/TIGPAIL WIRE $ 7900 $ 1,580.00
2 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODER STAND ALONE REGISTER W/18" WIRE $ 79.00 $ 1,580.00
3 20 5/8" - 2" PROCODER900i INSIDE SET REGISTER $ 14700 $ 2,940.00
4 20 5/8" - 10" PROCODERS00i PIT SET REGISTER $ 158.00 § 3,160.00
5 20 6'PIT ANTENNA $ 2200 $ 440.00
6 20 20' PIT ANTENNA $ 2700 § 540.00
7 20 R900 V4 PIT SET MIU $ 101.00 $§ 2,020.00
8 20 RO00 V4 WALL SET MIU $ 81.00 § 1,620.00
9 20 CMIU WALL SET $ 12000 % 2,400.00
10 20 CMIU PIT SET $ 14200 § 2,840.00
1 2 POCKET PROREADER RF $ 87200 % 1,744.00
12 2 POCKET PROREADER BATTERIES $ 52.00 % 104.00
13 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR POCKET PROREADERS $ 3,706.00 % 7,412.00
14 2 BELT CLIP TRANSCEIVER $ 5600.00 % 11,200.00
15 2 BELT CL{P TRANCEIVER BATTERIES $ 13600 $§ 272.00
16 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR BELT CLIP TRANSCEIVER $ 6,342.00 $ 12,684.00
17 2 MRX MOBILE DATA COLLECTOR $ 8,900.00 § 17,800.00
18 2 ANNUAL MAINTENANCE FEES FOR MRX MOBILE UNIT $ 577000 % 11,540.00
19 2 MRX 12V AUTOMOBILE POWER CABLE $ 157.00 $ 314.00
20 2 REGISTER TAMPER SEAL PINS $ 013 § 0.26
21 500 5/8" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE NT-10 $ 19.00 $ 9,500.00
22 2 5/8" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE $ 19.00 $ 38.00
23 2 3/4" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE 3 29.00 % 58.00
24 2 1" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE $ 58.00 $ 116.00
25 2 1-1/2" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE-10 MOLD TO SIZE $ 130.00 % 260.00
26 2 2" MEASURING CHAMBER COMPLETE T-10 MOLD TO SIZE 3 17000 % 340.00
27 2 2" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO $ 400.00 % 800.00
28 2 3" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO $ 72000 $ 1,440.00
29 2 4" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO $ 78500 § 1,570.00
30 2 6" MEASURING CHAMBER ASSEMBLY HP TRU FLO $ 1,300.00 $ 2,600.00
31 2 1-1/2" CONTROL BLOCK ASSEMBLY T-10 S 10.00 $ 20.00
32 2 2" CONTROL BLOCK ASSEMBLY T-10 S 10.00 $ 20.00
33 2 2" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 57.00 $ 114.00
34 2 3" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 57.00 $ 114.00
35 2 4" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 115.00 § 230.00
36 2 6" METER GASKET KIT TRU FLO $ 14000 % 280.00
37 2 2" STRAINER COVER GASKETS 3 200 % 4.00
38 2 3" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 210 % 4.20
39 2 4" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 540 $ 10.80
40 2 6" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 700 % 14.00
41 2 8" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 1000 $ 20.00
42 2 10" STRAINER COVER GASKETS $ 12,00 % 24.00

TOTAL GROUP B: $ 99,767.26




NEPTUNE BID WAQ042503

iftem# GROUP C: ITEM DESCRIPTION Total Price
1 NEPTUNE 360 SAAS PLATFORM ANNUAL SUBSCRIPTION $  68,096.25
~ NEPTUNE 360 CELLULAR ENDPOINT ANNUAL DATA
2 SUBSCRIPTION $ 51.24
3 NEPTUNE 360 SET-UP FEE $
4 NEPTUNE 360 ON-SITE TRAINING $ -
TOTAL GROUP C: $  68,147.49
TOTAL BID - GROUP A $ 3,008,924.00
TOTAL BID - GROUP B $  99,767.26
TOTAL BID - GROUP C $  68,147.49
TOTAL BID - GROUPS A-D $ 3,176,838.75



MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY

WA 042502 MALWAREBYTES RENEWAL

1 - — — — — —— . —
' 1)
2
| ITEm INSIGHT 2) (3) )
No QUANTITY DESCRIPTION PUBLIC ATLAZ VPRIME NEWBEG,
) E i ’
SECTOR, INTERNTN'L. | TECH, INC INC.
_ R | R —— o T N N
1 275 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Elite $22,052.25 $21,312.50 | $21.483.00 |  $20,891.75
2 70 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Elite Server $9,988.30 | $9,702.00 $9,730.70 $9.463.30
3 10 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Moblle Security ~ $99.50 $100.00 | $96.80 | $94.20
i TOTALBID ) 18324005 |  $31,114.50 | $31,310.50 |  $30,449.25



WA 052504 DUMPSTER SERVICE

475 Norris Drive; Rochester, NY 14610 location

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly

6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly

40 Yard Open Construction/Demolition Dumpster, Service Weekly

4799 Dewey Ave; Rochester NY 14612 location
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly
6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly

205 Norris Drive; Rochester, NY 14610 location
6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly
4 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly

1325 Paul Road; Churchville, NY 14428
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly

593 Basket Road; Webster, NY 14580
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly

TOTAL:

*Additional Services and Costs as Needed
Extra Pickup for 8 Yard Dumpsters

Extra Pickup for 6 Yard Cardboard Dumpsters
Service Charge Per Haul For 40 Yard Dumpster
Disposal Fee Per Ton for 40 Yard Dumpster

Waste Management

Casella Waste Systems

Suburban Disposal

Annual Total
S 1,920.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,260.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,200.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,920.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,260.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,260.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,080.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,440.00 NO BID NO BID
S 1,080.00 NO BID NO BID
S 12,420.00 NO BID NO BID

$100.00/pick

$100.00/pick

$250.00/haul
$71.00/ton



Backwash Channel Dredging

Eng. No.: 25-S01
Auth. No.: -
Bid Opening: May 27, 2025

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received
on May 27, 2025 at 10:30 a.m. for this project.

Bv7e'7 '/ZQ

Date: May 27, 2025

Synagro Northeast, LLC Empire Marine Corp. Denali Water Solutions, LLC | New England Aquatic Services, LLC
Engineers 435 Williams Court, Suite 100 101 Ketchum Rd. 220 W. Commerce Ave. 12 Leach Hollow Rd.
Estimate Baltimore MD, 21220 Hilton NY, 14468 Russellville AR, 72801 Sherman CT, 06784
410-688-4438 585-545-1035 315-374-8645 203-885-2318
Itern Estimated Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1 |Dredging and Sludge Transfer 1 LS | $150,000.00 | $150,000.00 | $ 120,550.00 | $ 120,550.00 | $175,950.00| $ 175,950.00 | $ 188,000.00 | $ 188,000.00 | $§ 445,166.67 | $ 445, 166.67
Total Bid Price $150,000.00 $120,550.00 $175,950.00 $188.000.00 $445,166.67




Elmgrove Road Water Maln Repalcement
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GROUP 40440 - Vehicies, Class 1-8

1.0

Group 40500-23166, VEHICLES, Class 1-8

Form B (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Response (ltem 1)

Revision Date: 10/17/23

See the "Instructions and Definitions" worksheet for general form instructions. The Contractor business name in Row 3 and Mini-Bid Request Number in
Row 7 will automatically populate based on responses on the "Response Summary" worksheet, Use the drop-down menu to complete Question 1.1 in Row

8, and then complete the yellow-colored cells that appear in Parts A through D below. Failure to enter a response in a yellow-colored cell may result in

rejection of your Mini-Bid response.

Contractor: TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT, INC

Part A: Mini-Bid Information
Mini-Bid Questions

Contractor Response

10

Mini-Bid Reference Number from Form A (Chassis/Body Combination): Mini-Bid Request (e g
15060001)

WA062505

T4

Item Number for this Mini-Bid

Item 1

1.2

Is the Mini-Bid for Vehicle(s) to be burchased or leased by the Authorized User? [click on yellow
box and use drop-down menu]

Purchased

2.0

Vehicle Questions

21

What type of Vehicles were requested in the Mini-Bid, and are being offered in this Mini-Bid
Response? [click on yellow box and use drop-down menu}

(Note: Conlractor input cells below will be black until this question is answered. The Conlractor answer

to this question will resull in corresponding cells on this worksheel turning to vellow for Conltraclor
input. A Complete Vehicle is defined as the Product that is the result of the Chassis and Body being
Jjoined together to form a Vehicle that is ready for use and requires no further manufacturing operations
to perform its intended function.)

Body only (Contractor will not be required to

coordinate installation of a Chassis on the awarded

Body)

22

Is the Chassis, Body, or Complete Vehicle offered in this Mini-Bid Response to be Built to
Specifications, Pre-Existing Inventory (i.e., off the lot), or a combination?
[click on yellow box and use drop-down menuj

Built toispecifications

23

Can the Vehicles offered for the Mini-Bid be delivered by the delivery date specified?
[Note: A Mini-Bid response may be deemed non-responsive and be rejected if the Vehicles cannot be
delivered by the delivery date specified]

Yes

24

Does the Vehicle offered meet all Authorized User Specifications for the requested Vehicle?
{Note: See Form A (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Request and the "Additional Vehicle Specifications
Document" inciuded with the Mini-Bid Request, if applicable]

Yes

2.5

Enter the estimated number of days after receipt of a Purchase Order, or other ordering
document, that the delivery will be made.

135

2.6

Enter the Final Order Date for the Vehicles offered for the Mini-Bid (Enter "TBA" if the date has not
been announced by the manufacturer, or "N/A" if there is no Final Order Date)

N/A

Part B: Vehicle(s) Offered for Mini-Bid

[Enter the requested information for the Chassis and/or Body offered for the Mini-Bid in the yellow-colored boxes below]

1.0 [Chassis Information Contractor Response
11 |Chassis Model Year
1.2 [Chassis Make (e.g., Ford, International, Freightliner)
1.3 |Chassis Model (e g, F450, DuraStar, M2-106)
14 |Chassis Model Code (the OEM code used to identify a particular subset of a Model)
1.5 |Chassis provider business name (i.e., Contractor or third-party).
1.6 |Chassis Aftermarket Components Provider(s): Enter the vendor business name(s) of the Aftermarket
Components Provider(s), if applicable, If not applicable, enter "N/A"
2.0 |Body Information
Award 23166 Item 1 Page 1



GROUP 40440 - Vehicles, Class 1-8

2.1 |Body Model Year ) 2026

22 |Body Make (e g., Viking, Galion) FELLING

2.3 |Body Model (e.g., Proline, 450U) FT-45-2 LP

2.4 |Body Model Code (the OEM code used to identify a particular subset of a Model) FT-45-2 LP

2.5 |Body provider business name (i.e , Contractor or third-party). CONTRACTOR

2.6 |Body Aftermarket Components Provider(s): Enter the vendor business name(s) of the Aftermarket N/A
Components Provider(s), if applicable. If not applicable, enter "N/A".

Part C: Additional Information

If applicable, enter any deviations from the Authorized User Specifications, or other additional information applicable to this Mini-Bid. Bidders are strongly
encouraged to submit proposed deviations to the Aulhorized User by email prior to the Mini-Bid Response Due Dale, so that they may be given due
consideration prior to the submission of Bids. Do not enter information about Options or Aftermarket Components available for the Vehicle offered, unless it

has been included in the Authorized User Specifications. If not applicable, enter "N/A"

N/A

Part D: Vehicle Request Price Worksheets

Enter the requested pricing information for the Chassis and/or Body offered for the Mini-Bid in the yellow-colored boxes below in the “Chassis Price

Worksheet," and "Body Price Worksheet". Complete the pricing worksheets for each type of Vehicle request as follows:

Complete Vehicle : If the Mini-Bid is for a Complete Vehicle in which the Chassis and Body are sold and marketed by different OEMs, complete both the "Chassis Price

Worksheet" and "Body Price Worksheet" for the Vehicles offered.

Chassis Only : If the Mini-Bid is for a Chassis only, with no Body, complele the "Chassis Price Worksheet" for the Chassis offered. If the Authorized User is supplying the
Body for a Complete Vehicle, then enter the NYS Contract Price for installation of the Body in the "NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body)" fieid in the "Body Price

Worksheet ”

Body Only . If the Mini-Bid is for a Body only, with no Chassis, complete the "Body Price Worksheet" for the Body offered. If the Authorized User is supplying the Chassis for a
Complete Vehicle, then include the NYS Contract Price for installation of the Body in the "NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Chassis)" field in the "Chassis Price

[Automatically calculated: NYS Base Price (Chasis) plus the NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Chassis)].

Worksheet "

1.0 |Chassis Price Worksheet Price

1.1 |NYS Base MSRP (Chassis)

1.2 |NYS Discount (Chassis) 0.00
[Type a number only (e.g., 5.5); Do not type a percentage sign (%) after the number; For 5 5% type 5.5, not 0.055].

1.3 |NYS Base Price (Chassis) $0.00
fAutomatically calculated: NYS Base MSRP (Chassis) minus NYS Discount (Chassis)].

1.4 |NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Chassis) [If there are no Aftermarket Components, leave blank]

1.5 |NYS Price For Vehicle (Chassis) $0.00

Number of Vehicles (Chassis) [This quantity must match the Number of Chassis specified by the Authorized User in the
Mini-Bid Request]

1.7 |Total Price For Mini-Bid (Chassis) [Automatlically calculated: the NYS Price For Vehicle (Chassis) multiplied by the Total Enter Pricing or Number of
number of Chassis]. Chassis

2.0 |Body Price Worksheet Price

2.1 |NYS Base Price (Body) $42,445.73

2.2 |NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body) [If there are no Aftermarket Components, leave blank]

2,3 |NYS Price For Vehicle (Body) $42,445.73
{Automatically calculated: NYS Base Price (Body) plus the NYS Aftermarket Components Price (Body)].

24 |Number of Vehicles (Body) {This quantity must match the Number of Bodies specified by the Authorized User in the Mini- 1
Bid Request]

25 |Total Price For Mini-Bid (Bodies) [Automatically calculated: the NYS Price For Vehicle (Body) multiplied by the Total $42,445.73
number of Bodies].

3.0 [Grand Total Price For Mini-Bid for ltem Price

Award 23166

ltem 1

Page 2




GROUP 40440 - Vehicles, Class 1-8

Grand Total Price For Mini-Bid for Item
fAutomalically calculated as the sum of the following]
1) Total Price for Mini-Bid (Chassis), if applicable; and
2) Total Price for Mini-Bid (Bodies), if applicable

$42,445.73

Award 23186

Item 1

Page 3



GROUP 40440 - Vehicles, Class 1-8

Group 40440-23166, VEHICLES, Class 1-8 (Vehicle Marketplace)

Form B (Chassis/Body): Mini-Bid Response

(Response Summary)

Revision Date: 10/17/23

See the "Instructions and Definitions” worksheet for general form instructions. Celis below will be black-colored until Question 1 1 and 1 2 are answered

Complete all yellow-calored cells Failure to enter a response in @ yellow-colored cell may resull in the Mini-Bid Response being being deemed non-

reponsive and in the disqualification of the Mini-Bid response

Part A: Mini-Bid and Contractor Information

1.0 |Mini-Bid Questions Contractor Response
11 |Mini-Bid Reference Number (e g T15060001; see Form A (Chassis/Body): WA062505
Mini-Bid Request)
12 |Number of items included in this Mini-Bid (see Form A (Chassis/Body): Mini-|1
Bid Request)
[click on yellow cell and use drop-down menuj.
12.0 |Contractor Information
21 |Full Legal Business Name, including DBA if applicabte TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT, INC
21 |OGS Contract Number (e g, PC12345) PCE898s
23 |Federal Employer ldentification Number / FEIN (e g 14-1234567) 16-1058204
24 |NYS Vendor ID Number (e g, 1000012345) 1000007710
3.0 |Primary Contact Information
31 |Contact Name NICK PADULO
32 |Contact Email NPADULO@TRACEYROAD.COM
33 |Contact Phone (1) (585)278-8840
34 |Contact Phone (2) (315)437-1471
4.0 |Secondary Contact Information

41

Contact Name

JENNIFER KENT

42

Contact Email

JKENT@TRACEYROAD COM

43

|Contact Phone (1)

(315)350-2076

43

fConlact Phone (2)

(315)437-1471

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary

Parl B: Mini-8id Response Summary shall be automatically populated, based on Contractor input on the “ltem" worksheets Celis in each ltem Row will be black-colored until 3 number of Items is indicaled in Question 1 1 above After a number of
Items is selected, the carresponding Rows will be unhidden IF "Enter Pricing” appears in a Row for an item, that indicates that the pricing for that Vehicle (Chassis, Body) on the applicable "ltem” worksheet has not been completed by the
Contractor In order to submit a responsive Mini-Bid response, all requested information for all ltems included in the Mini-Bid Request should be entered on the applicable “ltem” worksheet

If "Enter Pricing" appears in the "Grand Total Price for Mini-Bid" cell {Cell R39), that indicates that all required pricing information has not been entered by the Contraclor on the applicable "ltem” worksheet Failure to enter all required pricing
information for an item shall deem the Mini-Bid response for that itern non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the Mini-Bid Response for the Mini-8id.

Award 23166

000

$0.00

of Number of
Chassis

Response Summary

FELLING

‘ FT-45-2 LP

$42,44573

= Chassis NYS NYS Base Total Price Total # Total Price  |Grand Total Price
Itern ;2:':'3“' Chassis Make  [Chassis Model |Model Z:':s':f Discount |Price for Mini-Bid 5:’::’ Model |pody Make  |Body Model gz:: Mods! :n(s B;“ For Mini-Bid |for Mini-Bid for
Code (Chassis) |(Chassis) |{Chassis) Bodies | "¢ (BOW) | o dies)  [item
Enter Pricing |

$42 44573

Page 1



2026 Roof Raehabllitation Program

1 certify that this Tabulation is a true representation of bids recelved
on Thursday, June 19, 2026 at 10:00 g m for this contract

T .
Date. glﬂm& 20, 2025

Engineering No.: 24-020
Autharizetion No.: 164-400
Bid Opening: Thursday, June 19, 2025 at 10:00 a.m.

Englneer's Estimate

Item Estimated
No Description Quantity | Unil Unit Cost Estimaled Cosl
Echo Sireet Pump Station Modified Bituminous
1.0 |Built-Up Roof Overlay Systam 2450| SF | § 4700 | ¢ 115.150.00 |'S
Low Lift Pump Station #1 Modifiad Bituminous Bullt{ .
2.0 |Up Roof Overiay System 2850 SF | & 47.00 [ $§  138,650.00 |
Wiaconsin Streel Storage Building Modified F
3.0 |Bltuminous Built-Up Roaol Overlay System B30 | SF | & 47.00 | 8 30,010.00 |
[ Tolal Bid Price | s

8id Informalities:

Spring Sheel Metal And Roofing 1)

1st Low Bldder

Unit price In words is wiitten as the multiplication of the eslimaled quantily
and unit price In figures. Multiplication of the estimated quantity and unll
price in figures does not match extended total In figures. The corrected Bld
amount is $286,372.50. This informality does not change the Bld results.



Brick Schooinoune Road Water Main Replacement
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12 1|4 Gooees Instanavan oy Open Cut i Lawn ) 7000 | § 6573000 | 8 “m|s ;mEmoo|s w8 n7am|s 700|3  e8s5a00 |3 ss00fz 6103003 6000|5300
12 241 Copper Insizliaton by Open Cut 11 Favemenl $ c00fa 3e2000| % "0 S0 | 3 s 140600) 3 2000 | & 7800 | 3 20000 | 3 780600 | 8 10000 | 380000
13 3}* Lopper Installation ky NenOpen Cot ] Ton| s 5306000 | & 00| %  asam|s oo |8 s1ss00| 3 85008 7RO | 80003 45480003 10500 |3 7850000
11 €134 or 1 Sewce Transter in Lawn or Pavement + 70000 % 1600000 | 5 250000| 3 o000 20006 | 5 28000 % 200000 | 3 1500000 8 200000 | % 1600000 § 125000 | 3 10.0000C
*2%/1" Curtr Siop in Lawa or Paverrent 3 ©2000C | § 5400200 | 8 60000 | & T00000 | 3 40000 | 3 oo | 3 70000/ $ 350000 % 100600 | £ 4h 20000 | 3 55000 | 3 2175000
20! Type 2 Stiect Fil- NG ¥ Clushior Rutt Stang s s000 |3 1565C00 | % 0m|3s g 5000 | 3 0700 | 3 5800 |8 1815400 | 2 45003 qossiofs 2400| 5 751200
130! Temsoray Asprall s s00| 4 1052500 | 3 sy t0s500]s soo|s W | s 50008 1052s00|% sc0| 3 wasson| s 5002 1052500
| +s0lsieet Asonak 1 000 4 794000 | 3 umls aw|s som|s maam |3 20008 7840 |3 000|2 79600 |8 20| 734000
180 Cravewdy Asphalt T 200| % 265000 | § “wls  Zemod]s Bo|s we75m | 5 2m|s 12ewm|s zoo|s  rasem]|s 2200|3% 1285000
<70} awn Reswraton 5 1503 e67e000 | 3 150/ egmco|s 2m|5 8204000 | 3 15|s  sarEmon|s 1503 esre0m |8 1503 6878000
86| Carersie Driveway s &coo | % 616000 | § 8000 | 3 sata0o | s 8200 | & 373800 | 3 8000 | § 818000 | 3 500 | 8 28950012 1300 5 100100
18 0lCarermi Gatiar s 3500 % 52900 | % 000 3 45000 | & 3Bm |5 540000 (% ToMm | & 10,5000 | & W00 | s 45000 s W 4500 00
200|F oieihy eon Encasement ] 400 | § 2067200 | % 200§ rosdMGo ]y 305 1586400 | 8 2001 § 1040600 | 8 so0| % 2800000 | % 2008 15654.00
1 O|Vesier Mo Absncanmant % 7500003 2250000 | & Aeen | § 000000 | 3 870000 | & 2000000 | § 4000 (% 1z00000 | 5 600000 | 3 7800000 |3 450000 |3 1350000
23 ©|Vave Bus Atangonmrent ] 55000 | 3 50008 | 3 X0 | § 00 | 3 195000 | 3 18.50000 | 5 62500 ( 3 s25000 | 3 00m | & 205000 | & 75000 | 3 750000
3 O rmant Asanecarant s 8000z | § 4820 f § e | 5 4zmonis 21000 | 5 1260000 | 3 85000 | & 510000 | ¢ 50200 | § sl s 75000 | 3 4.50000
24 QiVaU Anssonery 3 sownals soasmfs  Asoace| s e B 450006 | 3 4po00 | 3 470000 | % amam | 3 50000 | 5 500000 | % 150000 | 3 1,506 00
25 01 rwasen Conlrol — Drainage Siructuce Infat Prolection s 000 | % 270036 | 8 mamls  sxuools a0 | 3 420000 3 00003 2700032 20000 | 3 1| 2 1000 | 3 0000
3% 0l e Utiey Pole 3 70000 | & sveoc | & 000 | 5 22000 | 3 30000 | ¥ 350000 3 1000003 13000008 5000 | 3 55000 | 8 50000 % £500,00
2 6lRncx Removal % 2004 100000 |4 2003 1omm | s 2m|s 100000 | & 2000 8 100000 | & 000 | % 100020 | % 2000 % 00000
1 GlRock Oreeg 1] 2000 | & 100000 | 3 wo|s 1omood s 2000|% 1p0000 | & 2000 | & 140000 | 5 20| 8 1000 | 3 xoo| s 1,000 00
42 O Crploratory Exzavoten ] 2000 | & 4000 | & 20| 2 ol 20005 40000 | 4 000|3 aam |y 2000 5 40000 | & 2000 | & £00.00
23 0lExgomny Excavaior - Sheeted 3 3000 | » 60000 | § 00| 5 800,00 | 3 2000 |3 somo | s 3000|3 o [t Tw | 50000 | % w5 60000
<46{b° M J Uucule Iron Bera 45 Degrees 1 40000 | 3 80000 | 5 =om| 5 mom | 3 s00m | £ 80000 | % 80000 | $ oo | 3 s0000 | 3 eo0co | 3 @000 | § 810,63
35 Sffore WinozL Casing for 67 Waler Man 3 2500 | % 250000 8 =omly  zsox|s 2000|3 2500 | 3 Zom|s 250003 5c00| s 250000 | 3 25000|3 250000
2£ 3| 1unneng 3 12500 |3 17200 | & S| v 125000 | 3 12500 5 12000 | 3 12500 | 5 125000 s 12500 | § 12500013 12500 | 3 125000
47018 MJ Solig Sleeve i 15003 50| 8 N5\ s 1500 |5 Nsm| s Jsan | s ans00| 3 1800 3 21500 | 3 NE00 | 3 31500 8 1500
48 1| Ancnor Pipe 127, 18" or 24" . 0000 | % 000 | W00 8 90000 | 3 30000 | 5 mao |y 30000 | 5 2m0pa| 5 w000 | & 0G| s 30000 | & 300 00
<6 2|8 Ancnar Pipe 3 4 or B ' 00| 500 8 w3 3500 | 3 375005 Frseo | 3 a0 |3 EcT 1 a7s0a | 3 wscaf s 7500 | § bt
49 1| iyr e Tievaens 6 (7 ot 8 ;| 3000 | % o aleng I 4 Roa0 | 8 BOU0D | § 20600 | 5 30000 | ¥ x0m (3 3000 |3 e | s 20600 4 50000 | 3 590 00
25 3|wyoran Extensns. 24 30 o 36 ' 37500 | 3 arsco |y ;500 & bt K I3 ssoo| s 7|3 37500 | 3 a7500 | 8 o500 8 100000 | & 1,060 60
22| fype 1 Seiect Fill - #1 Crusner Run Slone 3 5003 67500 | 3 2600 % oeco|s sm|s e2500|3 25003 @s00 |4 2003 82500 | 3 250/ 3 82500
57 2| Type 3 Seiect Fil - Run of-Bank Gravel s 5000 |3 12900 | 2 sa0a) s et k] wwls 125000 | 3 eI 12001 s000 | 3 12000 | 3 soo0c| 5 250,00
52 0{Type 4 Select Filt - Sanc s 1500 |3 <000 | % 15m| 3 =@ |3 wools 45000 | 3 1500 3 asnpo | w003 0wl ol as0.00
33 2 Type § Select Fill - Conlroliea Censily Fill L] 5000 % 100000 | % S000| 3 120000 1 5 %00|s 100000 | & 50003 10000 | ¥ 5600 | % 102000 & 00| 1.000.00
23 Dfvane Ko Exaracn S 3 2500 8 30| 2= =mls Mol mo0|s 23008 200 | 4 2500 | § nw|s 12500 § & 12500
24 O P anakel Hyaran: Assembly 1 400000 | & «00020 | $ 400000 | 5 0o | s 400000 | & angoe | 4.00000 | 4 400000 | 3 400000 | & ool s 750000 | 3 2.500 00
4 & Tev=gorary Constr.cien Feraing % 500 25505 | 8 50| s 2000 s L TR =a00 |8 sw| s 28000 | & 500| & sewls 5008 25000
57 0| Trow Frtiaason 3 25600 | & sooos | § 25000| 5 0000 | § 2000 | 5 woes | 3 25000 | 3 50000 | 3 000 | 5 soe|s 25000 | 3 500,00
250012' - 18" Smooin Inlenor Gorvgated Peroraler “olycinylenc Pige 1 2000 | 3 a0 |8 00| & oo | s 2000 s 000 | & 2000 | 3 emoo | & 2000 | & ol 220003 30000
£50[12 - 19" Gavared My Sac Sestons s 25000 | & 100000 | 8 me|s \poo s =000 | 3 i ened B 25000 | 5 100000 | 3 23000 | & 100000 3 250001 3 1.00000
20| Exgs0r ConTo) - Simw Bales anc S Fancs 3 3 ADE{ S wmools secls 5000 |3 sl 00| 4 seel soo | sls 0000
7 ERG-] KL FRE RN
T3l Low Biager 2ng Law Brdoes Jrd Lo B age! 4 Low Bager 5ih Law Broddes



ITEMNO

1
2
3
4

WA062506 48" CONCRETE ADAPTERS

DESCR Rangeline [ *Thompson Pipe
48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP BELL X MJ SPIGOT (PLAIN END) ADAPTER-MCWA #2246 $9,552.00 $9,808.00

48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP SPIGOT (PLAIN END) X MJ SPIGOT ADAPTER-MCWA #2245 $9,552.00 $9,808.00

48" GROUT BAND DIAPERS $72.00 $0.00

48" LCP LAY GASKETS $200.00 $0.00
TOTAL: $19,376.00| $19,616.00

*Thompson Pipe Group was found to be non-responsive as they did not sign the Certificate of Non-Arrears.




| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received

on August 26, 2025 at 10:30 a.m. for this project.

o oy JLLA

Date: August 26, 2025

Webster WTP Filter GAC Replacement

Town of Webster

Eng. No.: 25-S05

Auth. No.:

152-000

Bid Opening: August 26, 2025

Carbon Activated Corporation Calgon Carbon Corporation
Engineers 3774 Hoover Road 300 GSK Drive
Estimate Blasdell NY, 14219 Moon Township PA, 15108
(716) 821-7830 (412) 787-6700
Item Estimated Unit Unit Unit
No. [Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1 |Filter Media - GAC 1 LS | $ 1,082,000.00| $ 1,082,000.00 | $ 1,010,000.00 | $ 1,010,000.00 |°$ 1,061,400.00 | $ 1,061,400.00
2 [Filter Media - Additional Sand 1200 CF | $ 2500 % 30,000.00 | $ 40.00 | 3 48,000.00 | $ 1760 | $ 21,120.00
Total Bid Price $1,112,000.00 $1,058,000.00 $1,082,520.00




Monroe County Water Authority
Lee Road Booster Pumping Station 35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear Rebid

Bid Tabulation n

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received Eng. No.: 22-S07
on August 21, 2025 11:00 a.m.  for this contract. Auth. No.: 142-600

. Bid Opening: August 21, 2025 11:00 a.m.
o Gl [T
Christopher J. LaManna, P.E., Director of Production

Date: S/ 2\[e5”

VP Supply Corporation
3445 Winton Place

Engineer's Estimate Rochester, NY 14623
585.455.2584
Iltem Estimated Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount
1 |35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear 1 LS | $ 1,500,000.00 | $ 1,500,000.00 | $ 1,337,625.000 | $ 1,337,625.00

Total Bid Price $ 1,500,000.00 | $ 1,337,625.00




Lee Road BPS 35kV Metal-Clad Switchgear Rebid
August 21, 2025 Bid Opening
Bid Results

$1,600,000

$1,400,000

$1,200,000

$1,000,000

$800,000

$600,000

$400,000

$200,000 — S
g | Engineer's Estimate VP Supply Corporation
@ Total Bid | $1,500,000.00 $1,337,625.00




- MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY

P.O. Box 10999 e 475 Norris Drive ® Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999
Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220

To: Larry Magguilli Date: 08/28/2025
From: Laurel Neff File: WA 082507
Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies:

Bids were received on August 28, 2025 for Broadcom/VMWare VSphere Foundation Licensing.
The apparent low responsive responsible bidder was CDW Government, with a bid of
$36,576.00 for one year.

One other bid was received from Insight in the amount of $38,743.68. However, they were
determined to be non-responsive as they failed to return the signed Proposal and Affirmation

of Understanding that were required in the bid documents.

I recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible bidder.

[in
7/ ]
prroved by ;,% // f ~7 7j
Department Head Date
))K)’Kpproved by 7 ﬂ// ,/ /) é/ 7 4//j ,/‘57 5
asmg Date
(DisfApproved by A M \( v 4/7//’5
E{ecutwe Director Date y

(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



[ certify that this tabulation is a true
representation of bids received an

Walker Road Gas Well Abandonment Re-Bid

Seprembez 18 2025 &t 10000 a.m. for this project Eng No: 23-S04
F4 -
By /?lf— __Qﬁ“"
Sam Koehler Enterprises Plants and Goodwin, loc.
e 9 / | j’_}ZT Englneers 191 Slaght Road 360 High Streer
LA Estimate Andover, NY 14806 Bradford, PA 16701
607-382-0301 B14-598-1474
Item Estimated Unit Unit Dmit
No |Descriotios Iy Unic Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1.0/ Gas Well Abandonment 1.00 LS 50.000.00 | S 50,000.00 | § 79,000.00 | § 79.000.00 | § 148845.00 [ S 14884500
Total iSlJ.OO0.00I $79,000.00 $148,845.00
Bid Informalities: Sam Koehler Enterprises did not fll out the bid price in Figures Low Bidder 2nd Low Biddder




