WA122320 CURB BOXES REBID

ITEMNO |DESCR Core & Main | Blair Supply | T. Mina Supply | F.W. Webb Co.
1/1-1/4" CURB BOX AND ROD, WITHOUT ROD $59,362.50 | $65,625.00 $56,937.50 $60,712.50
2|42" STAINLESS STEEL CURB BOX RODS $21,510.00 $23,500.00 $26,840.00 $29,370.00
3[24" STAINLESS STEEL CURB BOX RODS $6,000.00 $6,675.00 $7,602.00 $8,469.00
4|BRASS COTTER PINS - 5/32" X 2-1/2" $2,040.00 $2,200.00 $2,460.00 $2,780.00

(REF. FORD #800848)

TOTAL: $88,912.50 | $98.000.00 $93,839.50 $101,331.50
LESS PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT (2%): $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,026.63
FINAL TOTAL: $88,912.50 $98,000.00 $93,839.50 $99,304.87




Monroe County Water Authority
WA 122323 - Chlorine Gas Cylinders Supply

Bid Tabulation n

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received Eng. No.: N/A
on December 28, 2023 at 11:00 a.m. for this contract. Auth. No.: N/A

. Bid Opening: December 28, 2023 at 11:00 a.m.
By: %J (J lvﬁb
Christophef J. LaManna, P.E., Director of Production

Date: | ] 3 [éi

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.
100 Sunny Sol Blvd.
Caledonia, NY 14423

585.538.2314
Item Estimated Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount
1 |Deliver 150 Pound CI2 Gas Cylinders 20 EA | § 490000 | $ 9,800.00
Total Bid Price $ 9,800.00

Notes:



REQ 5435 WA122319 CYBERLOCK LOCKS, KEYS, PARTS, ACCESSORIES, SOFTWARE & MAINTENANCE

TEC SOLUTIONS CONCEPTS INC.
ITEM# QTY DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

10

11

12

13

48

12

48

24

24

24

Annual Software and Maintenance Agreement
Enterprise Version for Cyber Audit/Mgmt of
Cyberlock System

Cyberlock Control Key for installing/removing
Cyberlock interchangeable cores (CK-IR7C)

Cyberlock User Cyber Key USB w/ rechargeable battery
(CK-USB)

Cyberlock Dual Mode Biuetooth Cyber Key (CK-BLUE2)

Cyberlock Bluetooth 5.0 Cyber Key w/ USB charging
port (CKR-BLUE3)

Cyberlock User Cyber Key Wi-fi w/ rechargeable
battery (CK-AIR2)

Cyberlock Padlock, Brass, 2" x 3/8" diameter stainless
steel shackle, key retaining pre-installed core (PL-02KR)

ABUS Padlock, brass, 83/45 series 2, Medium/short 1"
shackle, key retaining pre-installed core (TSABUS-MED)

ABUS Padlock, brass, 83/45 series 2, Medium 2" shackle
key retaining pre-installed core (TSABUS-MED2)

ABUS Padlock, Titalium, 83 AL/40 series 2, 1", Key
retaining pre-installed core (TSKIK1-KR)

Cyberlock door cylinder, small format, interchangeable
core, best format, 7 pin (CL-SF03)

Cyberlock door cylinder, mortise, 1.125", w/cover
(CL-M2¢)

Cyberlock door cylinder, mortise, 1.25", w/cover
(CL-M4C)

$6,995.00

$160.00

$165.00

$175.00

$179.00

$280.00

$374.00

$435.00

$445.00

$405.00

$312.00

$498.00

$498.00

$6,995.00

$320.00

$7,920.00

$350.00

$358.00

$3,360.00

$17,952.00

$10,440.00

$10,680.00

$9,720.00

$1,872.00

$2,988.00

$2,988.00



ITEM# QTY DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

6

50

50

12

12

$1,764.00

$1,398.00

$1,764.00
$622.00

$6,306.00

$4,392.00

$540.00
$1,700.00
$264.00

$192.00

$144.00

$65.94

$282.00

Cyberlock standard U.S. Rim (CL-R1) $294.00
Cyberlock door cylinder, 6 Pin, Schlage format (CL-6P1) $233.00
Custom rim (TS-RIM) $294.00
Communicator, USB desktop, Cyber Key Charger (CKS-020) $311.00
Communicator Hub for Authorizer Key Port, US version $1,051.00
(AHG2R-W1)
Authorizer Key Port, communicator, indoor/outdoor $732.00
(AKG2R-01)
Cyberkey tip cap (CK-CAP-010) $10.80
Replaceable case for CK-RXD2 (TIP-010) $34.00
Replaceable tips and hex wrench (TIP-011) $22.00
Lock and key pin cleaning brush, stainless steel bristles $16.00
(Brush)
Cleaning drill brush bit (CL-DRILL BIT) $24.00
3 Contact Pins/1 Ground Spring for CK-RXD/RXD2 $10.99
(PP-SPRING)
Powerport USB Charge for Bluetooth Ck (PP-01) $47.00
TOTAL:

$95,376.94



WA012402 48" CONCRETE ADAPTER REBID

ITEMNO |DESCR Rangeline | Tech Interntnl | Thompson Pipe
1|48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP BELL X MJ SPIGOT (PLAIN END) ADAPTER-MCWA #2246 $9,404.00 $13,100.00 $11,642.68
2(48" SP-5 LCP CONCRETE ADAPTER-LCP SPIGOT (PLAIN END) X MJ SPIGOT ADAPTER-MCWA #2245 $9,404.00 $13,100.00 $11,642.68
3|48 GROUT BAND DIAPERS $35.00 $140.00 $96.00
4|48" LCP LAY GASKETS $145.00 $300.00 $200.00
TOTAL: $18,988.00| $26,640.00 $23,581.36
LESS PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT (1/4%): $0.00 -$66.60 $0.00
FINAL TOTAL: $18,988.00 $26,706.60 $23,581.36




ITEMNO
1

10

1

12

13

14

WAO012403 Meter Couplings, Valves, Adapters, & Fittings

DESCR Core & Main Blair Supply Ferguson *T. Mina Ti Sales
PRODUCT #C38-23-2-5-NL, 5/8" X 3/4" X 25" $21,040.00 $21,300.00 $32,340.00 $24,000.00 $25,000.00
LENGTH, LEAD-FREE MALE IRON PIPE THREAD STRAIGHT

METER COUPLING

PRODUCT #C38-3-NL, 5/8" X 3/4" X 3" LENGTH, LEAD- $1,282.00 $1,290.00 $1,961.00 $1,460.00 $1,516.00
FREE MALE IRON PIPE THREAD STRAIGHT METER

COUPLING

PRODUCT #138-23-NL, 5/8" X 3/4" LEAD-FREE MALE $3,108.00 $3,140.00 $4,776.00 $3,532.00 $3,632.00
IRON PIPE THREAD ANGLE METER COUPLING

PRODUCT #(C38-44-2-625-NL, 1" X 2.625" LENGTH, $3,254.00 $3,300.00 $4,980.00 $3,704.00 $3,802.00
LEAD-FREE MALE IRON PIPE THREAD STRAIGHT MTR CPLG

PRODUCT #L38-44, 1" LEAD-FREE MALE IRON PIPE $4,434.00 $4,500.00 $6,830.00 $5,050.00 $5,120.00
THREAD ANGLE METER COUPLING.

PRODUCT #CF31-66-NL, LEAD-FREE, 1-1/2" METER $4,705.00 $4,770.00 $15,856.00 $6,156.00 $5,185.00
FLANGE X 1-1/2" FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD

PRODUCT #CF31-77-NL, LEAD-FREE, 2" METER $12,286.00 $12,460.00 $43,534.00 $13,980.00 $13,540.00
FLANGE X 2" FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD

PRODUCT #A23-NL, LEAD-FREE ADAPTER, 5/8" X 3/4" $2,246.00 $2,280.00 $3,464.00 $2,558.00 $2,656.00
METER TO 3/4" METER LENGTH

PRODUCT #A24-NL, LEAD-FREE ADAPTER 5/8" X 3/4" $1,350.00 $2,730.00 $2,081.00 $3,077.00 $3,117.00
METER TO 1" METER COUPLING SIZE AND LENGTH

PRODUCT #(C14-33-Q-NL, LEAD-FREE 3/4" FEMALE $524.70 $519.00 $789.90 $584.40 $593.10
IRON PIPE THREAD TO 3/4" QUICK JOINT CTS

PRODUCT #C14-34-Q-NL, LEAD-FREE, 3/4" FEMALE $617.70 $612.00 $930.90 $688.20 $698.70
IRON PIPE THREAD TO 1" QUICK JOINT CTS

PRODUCT #TA47-NL, LEAD-FREE ADAPTER 1" METER $2,434.50 $4,935.00 $10,888.50 no bid $5,366.00
TO 2" METER SIZE AND LENGTH

PRODUCT #KV43-332W-Q-NL, LEAD-FREE ANGLE METER $1,164.00 $1,095.00 $1,661.75 $1,229.00 $1,277.50
VALVE 3/4" QUICK JOINT CTS BY 5/8" X 3/4" METER

SWIVEL NUT

PRODUCT #KV43-342W-Q-NL, LEAD-FREE ANGLE METER $2,060.00 $1,940.00 $2,940.40 $2,174.40 $2,260.80
VALVE 1" QUICK JOINT CTS BY 5/8" X 3/4" METER

SWIVEL NUT

TOTAL PRICE: $60,505.90 $64,871.00 $133,033.45 $68,193.00 $73,764.10

*T. Mina is non-responsive because they did not bid on all items



ITEM &#

WA 012301 PRINT/MAIL CUSTOMER BILLS, NOTICES AND READ CARDS

PRINT, FOLD, INSERT AND DELIVER CUSTOMER WATER BILLS,
DELINQUENT NOTICES AND BILL INSERTS TO U.S. POST OFFICE
(MAIN BRANCH, JEFFERSON ROAD) EACH WEEK PER SPECS.
PRINT, CUT, FOLD, ADHERE WAFER SEAL, AND DELIVER METER
READ CARDS TO U.S. POST OFFICE (MAIN BRANCH, JEFFERSON
ROAD) EACH WEEK PER SPECS.

TOTAL:

*Envelope 1 was determined to be non-responsive

IMS, INC. APPLIED BUSINESS SYSTEMS, INC. DATA PROSE/MATRIX *ENVELOPE 1
$147,420.00 $153,790.00 $122,850.00 $91,000.00

$3,404.00 $4,508.00 $5,704.00 $3,680.00
$150,824.00 $158,298.00 $128,554.00 $94,680.00



- MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY

P.O. Box 10999 = 475 Norris Drive ® Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999
Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220

To: Steve Trotta Date: 02/27/24
From: Laurel Neff File: WA 022404
Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies:

Bids were received on February 22, 2024 for 5W-40 Full Synthetic Premium Heavy Duty Engine
Oil. This is for a six (6) month contract with the option to extend for up to five (5) additional six
(6) month terms upon mutual consent. The apparent low responsive responsible bidder was
Schaeffer Lubricants in the amount of $13,644.36

Bid packages were sent to 10 Vendors.

| recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible hidder.

7 £ (> ——
(,DisTAT:)p roved by % p I B [ fo
g

Departr/nent Head Date

[Di%proved by 2 Q/¢77/-2(%
Purchasing Date ' /

(D/'Z)Approved by Ai JY %p/ﬂ 0(,(_ J/ZQ/?/V
Executive Director Date (

(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



GAC Replacement - West H Fliiters
Shoremoat Water Treatment Pt
1 cerufy that this tabulation is a true
epresentation of bids

don
Wmami«mwﬂm
By: /b

Calgon Carboa Corporation Carbon Acthvated Covporatian
Dare: 2/27/.?‘#{ Engleer’s £ 3000 G5X Drive 3774 Hoover Road
7 < Estinate i
Moon Township, PA 15108 Blasdeli, NY 14219
[411)42-5735 (716)!21@
rem Estimated Unit Unit Unit
1.0 |Flker Med - GAC LS 1S SR.000.00 | § B803,000.00 § S 23250000 | § 83250000 § 5 gm0 | S 852 000.00
20 |Filter Media - Sand (L3 1]s 22000.00 | § 2200000 | § 2700000 | § 27.000.00 § § 36,0000 | S 36,000.00
3.0 |Filter Media - Additional Sand CF 48415 dsools 726000 | S 15.00 | § 7265000 | S 1500 | S 726000
———r Yol $832.25000] —Saeh, 7000
Bid informalities,
Calgon Carbon Corporation - Total Bid Price did not indude Bid Item No. 3.0, which was 3 stipulated i Total Bid amount i by $7,250.00.
G O Was i . No seal was applied.




Pavilion BPS Generator

Town of Pavilion

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received

on February 26, 2024 at 11:00 a.m. for this project.

w £ [l

Eng. No.: 22-S02
Auth. No.: -
Bid Opening: February 26, 2024

Date: 02-26-24
Southworth-Milton, Inc. (dba Milton Cat)
Engineers 4810 E Saile Diive
Estimate Batavia, NY 14020
716-277-4295
item Estimated Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount
1 [100kW Generator 1 Ea. $88,000.00 $88,000.00 $82,540.00 $82,540.00
$88,000.00 $82,540.00




Shoremont West 1 Water Treatment Plant Phase 3 Improvements

[ certify that this tabulation is a true Eng. No.: 17-S01
representation of bids received on Auth. No.: 131-500
February 22, 2024 at 11:00 a.m. for this project. Bid Opening: 2/22/2024
By: Bryan Malone John W. Danforth Company
Engineers 930 0ld Dutch Road
Date: 2/22/2024 Cost Opinion Victor, New York 14564
(585) 924-7030
Item Estimated Unit Unit
No. [Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount
1.0 |General Construction 1 LS |$%$ 3,530,000.00 | $ 3,530,000.00 |$ 3,395,000.00 | $ 3,395,000.00
\
$ 3,530,000.00 $ 3,395,000.00

Bid Informalities:
1. None



| certify that this tabulation is a true
representation of bids received on
February 1, 2024 at 2:00 p.m. for this project

2024 Pavement Replacement Contract East

Eng. No.: 24-011

Auth. No:
By: S. Priem
Central Roadways, Inc. Villager Construction, Inc.
Date: 2/2/24 Engineers 590 Salt Road 425 0ld Macedon Center Road
Estimate Webster New York 14580 Fairport, New York 14450
(585)-265-2117 (585) 223-7697
ltem Estimated Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity Unit Price Armount Price Amount Price Amount
1.0|Asphalt Replacement (< or = 3 cf per patch) 30.00 CF $ 51.00 | $ 1,530.00 | $ 55.00 | § 1,650.00 | § 32000 | § 9,600.00
2.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 3 but < or = 25 cf per patch) 1,000.00 CF $ 19.00 | § 19,000.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 21,000.00 | § 100.00 | § 100.000.00
3.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 25 but < or = 100 cf per patch) 17,000.00 CE $ 2300 | § 391.000.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 357.000.00 | § 6200 | 3 1,054.000.00
4.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 100 but < or = 1,000 cf per patch) 52,500.00 CF $ 2200 | $ 1,155.000.00 | § 2400 | $ 1,260,000.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,312,500.00
5.0| Asphalt Replacement (> 1,000 cf per patch) 11,000.00 CF $ 19.00 | $ 209.000.00 | $ 18.50 | § 203.500.00 | $ 23.00 | $§ 253,000.00
6.0|Concrete Subbase 100.00 CF $ 13.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 2.000.00 | § 70.00 | $ 7.000.00
7.0| Type 2 Select Fill (#2 Crusher Run) 100.00 CF 3 075 | § 75.00 | $ 100 % 100.00 | $ 760 | $ 760.00
8.0| Mobilization 10.00 EA $ 200.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 16,000.00
9.0 |{Saw Cut Pavement 250.00 LF $ 6.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 125000 | $ 510 | § 1,275.00
10.0| Traffic Inductance Loop - Saw Cut and Seal Pavement 400.00 LF $ 6.00 | § 2,400.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 24.00 | $ 9.600.00
11.0| Traffic Inductance Loop - Inductance Wire 1,000.00 LF $ 300 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 2.00 | 8 2.000.00 | $ 220 | $ 2,200.00
12.0|Valve and Curb Box - Adjustment 250.00 EA $ 42.00 | $ 10,500.00 | § 50.00 | § 12,500.00 | § 210.00 | 3 52,500.00
14.0|Crack and Gouge Filler 1,500.00 LF $ 100 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1.20 | $ 1.800.00 | 400 | % 6.,000.00
15.0|Milling 40,000.00 SF $ 400 | $ 160,000.00 | § 250 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 330 | $  132,000.00
16.0|Concrete Sidewalk and Gutter 3,500.00 CF $ 50.00 | $ 175.000.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 210,000.00 | $ 54.00 | §  189,000.00
17.0|Concrete Curb 100.00 LF $ 4000 | $ 4,000.00 | § 50.00 | $ 5.000.00 | § 95.00 | $ 9,500.00
18.0| Driveway Sealer 5,000.00 SF $ 0651 8 3,250.00 | $ 02518 1.250.00 | § 050 (3 2.500.00
19.0|Re-Set Granite Curb 150.00 LE $ 2000 | $ 3,000.00 | $§ 35001 8% 5,250.00 | § 3300 |9 4.950.00
20.0|Winter Concrete 200.00 CF $ 1800 | § 3,600.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 30.00 | § 6.000.00
21.0|Road Striping - 4" Stripes 2,500.00 LF $ 2.00 | § 5.000.00 | $ 200 | 5,000.00 | § 500 |$ 12.500.00
22.0{Road Striping - Pre-Formed Symbois 10.00 EA 3 750 | % 75.00 | § 2500 | $ 25000 | § 50000 |58 5,000.00
23.0|Stamped Concrete 25.00 SF 3$ 2500 | 8 62500 | § 45.00 | $ 1,125.00 | $ 190.00 | § 4,750.00
24.0|Adjust Catch Basin or Manhole - Top Section 5.00 EA $ 750.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | § 2,200.00 | § 11,000.00
25.0|Install Catch Basin or Manhole - Complete 1.00 EA $ 5,000.00 | $ 5.000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | § 2,500.00 | § 4900.00 | $ 4,900.00
26.0|Bollard 2.00 EA $ 450.00 | 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | § 660.00 | $ 1,320.00
28.0| Emergency Mobilization 10.00 EA $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 27,000.00
40.0|Removal of Concrete Subbase or Concrete Pavement 50.00 CF $ 25.00 | § 1,250.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 1.250.00 | $ 4100 | $ 2,050.00
41.0|Exploratory Excavation in Pavement 100.00 CF $ 50.00 | § 5,000.00 | § 5000 | % 5.000.00 | $ 71.00 | $ 7.100.00
42.0|Reinforcing Bar 25.00 EA $ 20.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2100 | $ 525.00
43.0| 2ft x 5ft Detectable Warning Surface 5.00 EA $ 800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | § 800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | § 1.000.00 | § 5.000.00
44.0|Bump Sign 5.00 EA $ 750.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 75000 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 75000 | $ 3.,750.00
Total $2,180,505.00 $2,226,975.00 $3,253,280.00

Bid Informalities:

Low Bidder

2nd Low Bidder



| certify that this tabulation is a true
representation of bids received on
February 1, 2024 at 2:00 p.m for this project

2024 Pavement Replacement Contract West

Eng No.: 24-012

Auth. No.:
By: S. Priem
Central Roadways, Inc. Villager Construction, Inc.
Date: 2/2/24 Engineers 590 Salt Road 425 Old Macedon Center Road
Estimate Webster New York 14580 Fairport, New York 14450
(585)-265-2117 (585) 223-7697
Item Estimated Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
1.0|Asphalt Replacement (< or = 3 cf per patch) 30.00 CF $ 51.00 | § 1,530.00 | § 55.00 | $ 165000 | $§ 32000 S 9,600.00
2.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 3 but < or = 25 cf per patch) 1,000.00 CF $ 19.00 | § 19.000.00 | § 21.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 100.00 | § 100.000.00
3.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 25 but < or = 100 f per patch) 10,000.00 CF $ 2300 | $ 230,000.00 | $ 21.00 | 8 210,000.00 | $ 62.00 | $§ 620,000.00
4.0|Asphalt Replacement (> 100 but < or = 1,000 cf per patch) 30,000.00 CF 3 2200 | $ 660.000.00 | $ 2400 | $ 720,000.00 | $ 25.00 | $§  750.000.00
5.0/ Asphalt Replacement (> 1,000 cf per patch) 10.000.00 CF $ 19.00 | $ 190.000.00 | $ 1850 | § 185,000.00 | $ 23.00 | § 230,000.00
6.0]Concrete Subbase 100.00 CF 3 13.00 | $ 1300.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 70.00 | $ 7,000.00
7.0 Type 2 Select Fill (#2 Crusher Run) 100.00 CF $ 075 | § 75.00 | § 1.00 | $ 100.00 | § 7.60 | $ 760.00
8.0 |Mobilization 10.00 EA 3 200.00 | $ 2,000.00 | § 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 16,000.00
9.0|Saw Cut Pavement 250.00 LF $ 6.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 5001 8% 1,250.00 | $ 510 | $ 1,275.00
10.0|Traffic Inductance Loop - Saw Cut and Seal Pavement 250.00 LF 3 6.00 | $ 1.500.00 | $ 5.00|$ 1,250.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 6,000.00
11.0| Traffic Inductance Loop - Inductance Wire 1,000.00 LF $ 3001 §$ 3.000.00 | $ 200 | § 2,000.00 | $ 220 | § 2,200.00
12.0|Valve and Curb Box - Adjustment 275.00 EA $ 42.00 | § 11,550.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 13,750.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 57,750.00
14.0|Crack and Gouge Filler 500.00 LF $ 100 | § 500.00 | § 120 | $ 600.00 | $ 400 | § 2,000.00
15.0|Milling 8,000.00 SF $ 4.00 | $ 32.000.00 | $ 250 | § 20,000.00 | $ 33018 26400.00
16.0|Concrete Sidewalk and Gutter 2,500.00 CF 3 50.00 | $ 125,000.00 | $ 60.00 | § 150,000.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 135,000.00
17.0|Concrete Curb 100.00 LF $ 40.00 | $ 4.000.00 | § 50.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 9.500.00
18.0|Driveway Sealer 5.000.00 SF 3 0.65 | % 3,250.00 | $ 025 | % 1,250.00 | $ 050 | $ 2,500.00
19.0|Re-Set Granite Curb 150.00 LF $ 20.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 35.00 | § 5,250.00 | § 33.00 | $ 4,950.00
20.0|Winter Concrete 500.00 CF $ 18.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 25.00 | § 12,500.00 | $ 30.00 | § 15,000.00
21.0|Road Striping - 4" Stripes 2,500.00 LF $ 2.00 | § 5.000.00 | $ 200 | $ 5,000.00 | § 5.00 | % 12.500.00
22.0|Road Striping - Pre-Formed Symbols 10.00 EA 3 750 | § 75.00 | § 2500 | $ 25000 |§ 50000 )% 5.000.00 |
23.0|Stamped Concrete 25.00 SE $ 25.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 1,125.00 | §  190.00 | § 4.750.00
24.0|Adjust Catch Basin or Manhole - Top Section 4.00 EA $ 750.00 | $ 3.000.00 | § 500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $§ 2200.00 | $ 8.800.00
25.0|Install Catch Basin or Manhole - Complete 1.00 EA $§ 500000 | § 5,000.00 | § 2,500.00 | § 2,500.00 | $ 4.900.00 | $ 4,900.00
26.0|Bollard 2.00 EA $ 450.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | 8 66000 | § 1,320.00
28.0| Emergency Mobilization 10.00 EA $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | § 400.00 | § 4,000.00 | $ 2,700.00 | § 27.000.00
40.0|Removal of Concrete Subbase or Concrete Pavement 50.00 CF $ 25.00 | $ 1.250.00 | § 2500 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 4100 | $ 2,050.00
41.0|Exploratory Excavation in Pavement 100.00 CF $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 5.000.00 | $ 7100 | § 7.100.00
42.0|Reinforcing Bar 25.00 EA $ 20.00 | § 500.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 21.00 ( $ 525.00
43.0|2ft x 5ft Detectable Warning Surface 5.00 EA $ 800.00 | § 4,000.00 | $ 800.00 | § 4,000.00 | $§ 1.000.00 | $ 5,000.00
44.0|Bump Sign 5.00 EA 3 750.00 | § 3,750.00 | § 750.00 | $ 3.750.00 | § 75000 | $ 3.750.00
Total $1,331.305.00 $1,387,775.00 $2,078,630.00
Bid Informalities: Low Bidder 2nd Low Bidder




I certify that this tabulation is a rue
representation of bids received on
February 22, 2024 at 2:00 p.m. for this project

2024 Lawn Restoration Contract East

Eng No.: 24-013

Aurh. No.:
By: S. Priem
Central Roadways, inc.
2/22/2024 Engineers Estimate 590 Salt Road
Webster New York 14580
(585)-265-2117
Item Estimated Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity E:ng FPrice Amount Price Amount
1.0{Lawn Restoration 400,000.00 SF 5 076 | § 304.000.00 | § 0863 344.000.00
2.0/Annual Erosion Control Materials Allowance 1.00 DC § 5.000.00]| 8§ 5.000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | § 5,000.00
Totl ~—$309,000.00] $349,000.00
Bid Informalities: Low Bidder



1 certify that this tabulation is a true 2024 Laown Restoration ContractWest

p of bids received on
February 22, 2024 at 2:00 p.m. for this project Eng. No: 24-014
Auth. No:
By: S. Priem
Central Roadways, Inc.
2/22/2024 Enjinpers Yoty S80Sk Hesd
Wedsma-Now Vork: 14500
(585)-265-2117
Item Estimated Unit Unit
No_ % Quantif Unit FPrice — Amaunt Price Amowunt
1.0|Lawn Restoration 300,000.00 SF S 076 | S 228.000.00 | S 083 |$ 249,000.60
2.0|Annual Erosion Control Materials Allowance 1.00 Dc § 500000 % 5.000.060 | § 5.000.00 | § 5,000.00
Towml SR SO0, ul

Bid Informalities: Low Bidder



Monroe County Water Authority
WA 042408 - Liguid Sodium Hypochlorite

Bid Tabulation n

| certify that this tabulation is a true representation of bids received Eng. No : N/A
on April 25, 2024 at 10am for Whis contract, Auth No.: N/A

\I . éz Bid Opening: April 25, 2024 at 10am

Manna, P E . Dwecior of Production

Date: 4‘!26!%

By

Christopher J.

Bison Laboratories, Inc. JCI Jones Chemicals, inc Amrex Chemical Co, Inc Kuehne Chemical Co, Inc. Archie Supply, LLC
100 Leslie St 100 Sunny Sol Blvd. 117 E Frederick St B6 North Hackensack Ave 5939 West Friendly Ave, Unit 51K
Buffalo, NY 14211 Caledonia, NY 14423 Binghamton, NY 13304 Keamy, NJ 07032 Greensboro, NC 27410
716 895.2707 585538 2314 607.772 8784 973.589 0700 540818 5822
Iltem Estimated Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
No. |Description Quantity | Unit Price Amount Price Amount Price Amounl Price Amount Price Amount
1 |Delivery of Liquid Sodium Hypochiorite 170,000 | GAL | $ 204 | % 346,800.00 | $ 205| § 348.500.00 | § 309983 526,830.00 | § 495 | § 84150000 | § 41250 § 1,275,037 50
(price per 55-gal drum)
Total Bid Price $ 346,80000 | $ 348,50000 | $ 526,830.00 | § 841,500.00 | $ 1,275,037.50
Non-Respansive' ! Non-Responsive' Non-Respongve'’

Notes:
1 Amrex Chemical did not submit a certificate of compliance with NSF, certified chemical analysis, or SDS with their Bid, For this reason, their Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Articles 5 and 8; and
Technical Specifications Article 5.

2 Kuehne Chemical did not submit a cerlified chemical analysis with their Bid For this reason, their Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Articles § and 8; and Technical Specificalions Article 5.
3. Archie Supply's Bid 1s for Ihe supply of sodium hypochlorite in 55-gallon drums, which is not meet the technical specificalion requirements. They also modified the Bid Form accordingly by revising the quantily, to represent Lheir proposed Bid of 55-

gallan drums In addition, they did not submit a cenificate of compliance with NSF, certified chemical analysis, or SDS with their Bid. For thease reasons, their Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Articles
5 and 8: and Technical Speciticahons Article S



$400,000

$350,000 |

$300,000

$250,000

$200,000 |

$150,000

WA 042408 - Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite Rebid
April 25, 2024 Bid Opening Results
Responsive Bids

$100,000

$50,000 |

$ -

mTotal Bid

; ‘Bison Laboratories, Inc.
$346,800.00

7J_'CI_Jones Chemicals, Inc.

 $348.500.00




Monroe County Water Authority
WA 042408 - Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite

Bid Review
Reviewed By: CJL C&t/

Engineering No : N/A

Date: 4/26/24 Authorization No : N/A
Bid Opening: April 25, 2024 al 10am
Bison Laboratories, Inc JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. Amrex Chemical Co_, Inc Kuehne Chemical Co, Inc Archie Supply, LLC
100 Leslie St 100 Sunny Sol Bivd. 117 E Frederick St 86 North Hackensack Ave. 5939 West Friendly Ave, Unit 51K
Buffalo, NY 14211 Caledonia, NY 14423 Binghamton, NY 13904 Kearny, NJ 07032 Greensboro, NC 27410
716 895 2707 585 538 2314 607 772 8784 973 589 0700 540 818 5822

Proposal Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Addenda Acknowiedgement N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A
Affirmation of Understanding & Agreement Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bidder/Offerer Disclosure Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Inslructions to Bidders Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusive Bidding Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bonds NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A

Bid Form Yes Yes Yes Yes No '

Prices vs Words N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Extensions of Unil Prices Yes Yes Yes Yes No ™
Technical Specifications Yes | Yes Yes Yes Yes
Certificalion of Non-Arrears and Non-Default Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Compliance Clauses Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Terms and Conditions Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Certificalion of Compliance with NSF Yes Yes No'V Yes No !
Certified Chemical Analysis Yes Yes No'™ No'? No'™

SDS Yes Yes No!” Yes No ™
Additions or Qualifications to Bid No No No No Yes”

All Pages of Bid Documents Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Other Notes None None None None Note 3

Delermination: Responsive Responsive Non-Responsive'” Non-Responﬁ‘-'.’ Non-Responsive'”

Notes:

1 Amrex Chemical did not submil a certificate of compliance with NSF, certified chemical analysis, or SDS with their Bid For Ihis reason, their Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions 1o Bidders Articles 5 and 8;

and Technical Specifications Article 5

2. Kuehne Chemical did not submit a certified chemical analysis with their Bid For this reason, lheir Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions to Bidders Articles 5 and 8; and Technical Specifications Article 5

3. Archie Supply's Bid is for the suppty of sodium hypochlorite in 55-galion drums, which is not meet the technical specification requirements. They also modified the Bid Form accordingly by revising the quantity, to represent their proposed Bid of
55-gallon drums. In addition, they did not submit a certificate of compiiance with NSF, cerlified chemical analysis, or SDS with their Bid For these reasons, their Bid is determined to be non-responsive in accordance with Instructions to Bidders

Articles 5 and 8; and Technical Specifications Article 5.
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Colonnada Driva and Glen Iris Driva Water Maln Replacements

i certity thal lrus tabulalon 18 a frue epredantalionar tids received Eng No: 22-024
@ At 16 124 81 10100 & A A Tl ey Did Opening Apif 18 2024 a1 10 00a n

s S/23 /2

Randaco Pipeine, Inc Kasler Construction Co , Ing
740 Quuker Rpad 13518 Wast Lee Rpad
Engineess Esomate Maoadan, NY 14502 Aloron, NY 14411
(585) 5894481
ltem [ Eshmated l Unit
No lngscnplmn Quaniity | Unt Prce Amount
<08’ Ductile Iron Waler Main 4476 LF 3100 00 ] 447 600 03 1 20
21 &'MJ DucllelronBend 11-174 Degrees 2 EA 5/00 00 b 1400008 80000 | % 100000 | & 3
23 8°MJ Duclie lron Bend 22122 Degrees T __EA $700 00 k] 460000 )% 60000 | 3 35000018 *
23 6'MJ Ouclile lipn Band 45 Dedreas 14 EA 1800 00 ] 1200031 soools Towuals 3
24_6'M.J Ductielran Bend B0 Degrees s EA 5900 00 ' 44000018 4000918 0013 L]
30 _8"MJ huclie on Brod 45 Drgrees J EA 2400 00 L3 ann o | & 500008 3 1
40 8 Restrained Joint Duclia on Watar Main 33s_LF 39800 3 aazsopl$ woals 187S000 § 8 4 3 773500 |
44 6" Tie-in Conneclian and Abandonment a6 LF $50000 & 2300000 § % 40000 | 3 18440000 | & ] 3938360 |
i B Tie in Conneclion and Abandonmenl 42 LF 2/00 00 [} 29.40000 | § 1 L) 08500 3 38 330 00
70 8 x 6" Tapoing Sleave, Valve and Tap 1 EA 28 000 00 5 800000 | 8 B.000.00 | & 800000 | 3 980000 | 4 9,000 00
80 8" Gale Valve 12 EA $2.200 00 s 2640000 | & 180000 | & 2100000 | 8 230000 (% 2700000
90 Pemendavlar Hutiant Azgemay Sy— - —— 7 _EA 44,400 00 ' saacoo0 | 4 ’Tg [} 2 £ aococals 48000 08
100 _Dead End Perpendicular Hyorant Assemoly 1 EA 19.000 00 i 900000 | 3 woo00d |8 B00000 | 3 9500001 % ¢ L0000
110 Puoysityiene Encausment 4583 Lf 00 s 837200 | § d0a|s RLEIZ ) K 200)s AL IFL
120 1" Copermtion — — 58 FA 560000 | & 54400008 80000 | $ S44000013 3300013 2244000
13 11" Copoer Inatal auon by Open Cut in Lawn 1207 Lk §50.00 £} 8036000 | 8 400018 4328000 | 8 Se00{3 8517800
13.2_1” Coppe Instal ation by Open Cul in Pavemenl 21 LF 570 DO 1] 147000 8 80008 152000 )3 9000} & 18000
331" Copper Insialiation by Non-Open Cuf 893 IF $70 00 s 6251000 | § anoo |y 53580 00 87001 % 9,831 00
1404 or 1" Servics Transfer in Lawn ar Pavemenl 12__EA 52.00000 1 2400000 | 3 320000 | 3 14400008 4300013 5 10000
150 1" Curb Slop in Lawn or Pavenknl 67 _EA $1,200 00 5 sa4nee |y 10000018 87 L) 47000 8 31460 60
160 TYypa 2 Select Fill - No 2 Ciusher Run Stone g Cv $45 00 3 1881000 | 8 500l 1841000 |3 @uls 250108 00
370 _Temporay Avphal 5913 SF 3500 8 2056500 |3 5 1 3 s00(% 28 385 00
180, Strest Avohalt v i0r_ oF 52000 i n7acao ]y mwls 23740003 2500 8 2267500
180 Diwowsy Adomyt 1178 CF §2200 £ 2591600 |8 22003 2600600 % 2004 37 598 00
200 Llawn Restoralion 31170 SF 3150 s 5275500 | § 3|8 123.00500 | 9 21013 80 881 00
210 Hoizonlal D recticnal Dnling wiih 8 Pipe 335 LF $140.00 5 4860000 |8 125.00 | § 4167600 | 8 13800 | 3 46 230 00
220 _Aore Withoul Casieg for 6* Water Main 120 IF 3250 00 s 20000003 12500 | 5 1500000 | 3 22003 3524000
230_Tunneling 20 LF $20.00 ) 400008 12800 | § 28 00) s 138003 272040 |
240 Watet Maln Abanddsmest rEA 57500 00 1 1spocoa | s 8.00000 | § 10.000.00 | 3 1080000 | & ".‘DNP
250 Vahe Box Abandsnment 7 EA $560 00 S 385000 $ 30ap0 |3 210000 | 3 X20000 | 3 22400 00
80 _yydranl Abaroareent 7___EA 380000 s sa0000 |8 %0000 |8 aemato | 1 87000 | 3 808000
270 Concrele Guller = 325 SF 41500 5 487500 |4 Rwmis 191378001 3 s000l% 13,000 00
280 Conereta Sidewalk 1.0 St $12.00 L] Jaeqocals qols 1710000 | 8 24503 48,850 00
750 Hod Weily Pora 1 EA 5700 00 3 7001 3 20000 ) 8 20000 8 800.00 | 3 50000
300 Miling 2300 SF 3300 1 6300008 20018 46000013 42213 9821.00
400 Fook Maweval w__CY 52000 s 100000 |3 20008 100000 & s7ga] s 425000
410 _Rock Drllng S0 iF 3000 1 1a9n00 | 8 __Wo00]s§ 100000 | $ 18200 | 5 4.100.00
420 y Excavaton m__CcY 3060 L) 40wy mools 40000 |8 2702 540000
430 Exoloraloy Ezravalion - Sheated ] cY 33000 5 ool oo ls LIIELERS 000§ 1400 00
440 & MJ Oudile tron Benos 11 144,22 1,2 or 90 Degrees 1 EA $800 0D 13 8000018 B000O | & B00.0D | & ARL AR 1180 00
45 08" Duchin Iron Waler Main 1 LF 5300 €0 5 dcaoo)s  ap|s Soaoo | 8 24000 3 24000
450 & Ouw Vaby 1 EA $215 U0 £} stsools emls a500 |3 340000 3 340D 00
ATH 6"MJ Sold Sieavos [} EA 3300 00 S 30000} & M L] A 3 7200018 72000 |
480 8 MJ Soid Steeve 1 EA 3374 00 3 500 |8 ELLICARS yapals 62000 | s 82000
A9 1B Anchos Pioe 1T 18 ore” 1 EA $300 00 3 nnoe | s 00| 0000] 8 55000 | 8 550 00
492 8" AncharPipe 3,4 o0 B 1 EA $375 00 3 37500} 9 47500 | 8 376500 | & 8500018 85000
50 1 Hydrant Exenslons & 12"or 18" \ EA $301 00 5 30000} % 20000 | & 20000 | § 500018 5000
502 Hydail Edensany 74°, 30" of 3 1_EA 037500 s arsoo s 37500 | 8 WE00 | 4 asam | & 850 a0
510 Type 1 Seleci Fil_¥1 Crusher Run Stone 25 oy $1500 3 37500 | § 18008 srno |3 sapa| s 1,450 00
220 Tvmed Sakeet FiF fun ot Gaw Grawnt % Ly 350 00 $ 12500048 sn_g 1 1250004 8 6700|% 142500
320 f:&lﬂeﬂﬁ‘d- Sang 30 cY 41000 4 30000(% 3 0000 | $ 800D S 240000}
540_Type 5 Select Fill - Conirol'ed Densty Fill 20 _GcY 34000 s 800003 _4000|5 80000 | 9 25003 4,500 00
550 Vave Nl Exierson Sieny ! EA 37300 3 250008 2/00 |8 _ BNl 44000 | 3 44000 |
| 40 Paryicl Hydrart Assamtty $__EA sang0od s 400000 % co00a s 400000 | s 830000 % 4300 00 |
5§70 Temoaiary C Fencog 30 tF 380 ] 20m|s 50018 280003 et0|s 2000 |
580 Teaa Fawhraton 1 EA 3250 00 3 S0 |3 000 |4 wowls 4000 | 3 840 00
3901V - I8 Smoot Iedor Comgaied PMaitonated o4ty Pion 4 LF $2000 3 3000 |9 Eslcd B2 wls 6003 |s 240000
800 12 - 18 ized Metal End Sections 4 EA 37400 3 100000 )% W08 10004y 5400013 2,180.00
| 810 Eroven Conlied~ Stoaw liaws snd 5 Fenca 100 \F §5 00 3 $0000] % soole 60006 | s 540} 1 oeo
820 Erasion Control _ Drslnage Stucture tnlel Prolect on - _ 2 _EA 100 00 ] 80000 | 8 3000] 8 60000) s 11400) 8 828 00
o g Pros] fraeson ey 3 g.um = 51,501,041 )
I8l Low B dder 2nd Law Bidder

8id Informalifas.
1) Rardsoa Pipeline did nol corractly wiile the Unil Price in Words vs Ihe Unil Price ni Figuas for one nid lem  This did nal changs the averal bidianking



MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY
WA 042409 MALWAREBYTES RENEWAL

Req. 5829-16
|
ITEM (3) (4)
No QUANTITY DESCRIPTION (1) (2) BMB ABRZ |
i NEWBEG INC. INSIGHT SOLUTIONS INTERNATIONAL
1 300 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Elite $21,390.00 $21,744.00 $22,062.00 '
TDELI12N250
2 70 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Elite Server $ 8,881.60 $9,030.00 $9,028.60
- | TDELIS12N50
3 10 EA | Malwarebytes Threatdown Mobile Security $§ 8840 $ 8990 $ 85.00
) TDMOBS12N1
. TOTAL BID $30,360.00 $30,863.90 | $31,175.60 | NON RESPONSIVE




MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY
P.O. Box 10999 ¢ 475 Norris Drive ® Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999
Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220

To: Steve Trotta Date: 06/14/2024
From: Laurel Neff File: WA 052410
Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies:

Bids were received on June 14, 2024 for 48” Concrete Adapters. The apparent low responsive
responsible bidder was Thompson Pipe Group Pressure, Inc., with a bid of $24,730.00.

No other bids were received. Bid packages were also sent to Blair Supply Corp. and Technology
International.

I recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible bidder.

/In

jD?ﬂprroved by -27-24
' Depaftment Head Date
s)Approved by \f ( WL ( /)r K Z//.f\’/— } -;/,(,/L
Purchasing. { \ Date
41/]
/v l// S Vi G //

%pproved by i 7 /2 7

Executive Director Date
(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



WA 062411 DUMPSTER SERVICE

475 Norris Drive; Rochester, NY 14610 location

8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly

6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly

40 Yard Open Construction/Demolition Dumpster, Service Weekly

4799 Dewey Ave; Rochester NY 14612 location
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Weekly
6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly

205 Norris Drive; Rochester, NY 14610 location
6 Yard Cardboard Only Dumpster, Service Weekly

1325 Paul Road; Churchville, NY 14428
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly

593 Basket Road; Webster, NY 14580
8 Yard Dumpster, Service Bi-Weekly

TOTAL:

*Additional Services and Costs as Needed
Extra Pickup for 8 Yard Dumpsters

Extra Pickup for 6 Yard Cardboard Dumpsters
Service Charge Per Haul For 40 Yard Dumpster
Disposal Fee Per Ton for 40 Yard Dumpster

Waste Management

Casella Waste Systems

Suburban Disposal

Tiger Companies

Landmark Equipment Rental

Annual Total
S 1,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
] 1,164.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 1,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 1,800.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID
S 1,164.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 960.00 NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID
$ 960.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 960.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
S 10,008.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

$100.00/pick

$100.00/pick

$250.00/haul

$71.00/ton



2024 Roof Rehabilitation Program

Enpineering No.: 23-028

| certify that this T; ton is a true repr of bids

on Thursday, June 27, 2024 at 11:00 a m for this contract.

,h:lm Al

Aulhorization No.: 144-400
Bid Opening: Thursday, June 27, 2024 a1 11:00a m

T
', a = United Thermal Systems, LLC
£ [ 2024 2939 Lockport Road
7 Engineer's Estimate Niagara Falls, NY 14305
(716) 285-0216
mmm‘!‘"_
tem| Estimated |
No. | Descriotion Quantity | Unit Unit Cost Estimated Cost Unit Cost Estimated Cost
|Webster Lake Water Pump Station Concrete Roaf ‘
1.0 and Screen Buikiing Concrete Slab Coating 8300 SF_ |8 16.00 | $ 13280000 |S 18718 98.521.00
[ Total Bid Price s 132.800.00 | § 98.521.00 [ §
1st Low Bidder 2nd Low Bidder 3rd Low Bidder 4th Low Bidder
Bid Informalities:
United Thermal Systems, LLC 1) Multiplication of the

Elmer W. Davis, Inc.

Spring Sheet Meta! and Roofing

Weatheright Instaliations.

y and unit price in words does not match extended lotal in figures and in words. The corrected total is $98,521 00 This informality does not change the Bid results

1.) Multiplication of the estimaled quantity and unit price in wolds daoes not match extended total in figures and in words The corrected Bid amount s $148,487 00 This informality does not change Bid results.
2) White out used on name line in Bid R stion, and Offerer/Bldder Disclosure in Section 7 These informalities do not change the Bid resulis.

1.) Unit price in words is written in words as the multiplication of the estimated quantity and unit price in figures. Muitiplication of the estimated quantity and unit price in figures does not match exiended total in words
The cormmected Bid amount is $156,787.00. This informality does not change the Bid resulis

2.) White out used in Corporate Resolution an Bidder Qualifications  This informality does not change the Bid results

1) Unit price in words is written in figures as the iplication of the y and unit price figures Multiplication of estimated quantity and unit price in figures does not maich exiended total in figures
The cormected Bid amount is $209,858 00. These informalities do not mange the El|d results

2) Corporate Resolutian nat completed and left blank This informality does naot change the Bid results.
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| certify that this tabulation is a true
representation of bids received on
July 16, 2024 a1 2:00 p m For this Qeraject

» "X Shupeid

2024 Cement Lining Prgrom

Eng No: 23-019
Auth No.: 143-100
Bid Opening: July 16, 2024

: Insituform Technologies, LLC Matalining America LT Michels Trenchless, Inc.
oote: ] / | (5/ 7 ‘-4 5 el 580 Goddard Avenue 354 Eisenhower Parkway 817 MainStreet, PO Box 125
. y Englneer’s Estimate Chesterfield, MO 63005 Livingston, NI 07039 Brownsville, W1 S3006
{636)530-8000 {716] 652-3700 {920 924-4300
Item Estimated Unit unit Unit Unit
Ng. IDescrnpnon unit Quantity Priee Amount Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount

T Ol6- Water Main Ocarwg and Lement Lining [ 14,860 51001 S 921,320001 5 5400 1,396 840,00 70001 5 1.060200.00 10150 1,508 290,00 |

21T Temporary Bypas Ppe LF 14.570 1100 160,270.00 | § 12,50 182,125 00 000! 5 45,700.00 451 55,710.70

221%" Temporary Bypass Pipe LF 14,190 15.00 212,85000] 5 20 00 783,800.00 1200 70,280.00 300 122,710.00

3 0f Temporary Bypast Pipe Burial LF 1720 45.00 740000 | S 15.00 15,800 00 65.00 111.800.00 99.65 171.398.00

4 0] 112" and Smailer Tempaorary Service EA 290 200.00 58,000.00 250 00 72,500 00 350.00 101,500 00 602.00 174,580 00

5 1{2" - 6" Temporiiy Bysass Conaethign EA ,000.00 6,000 00 300 00 900.00 3,500.00 10.500 D0 ,025.00 27,075.00

$ 2[5‘ and Larger Temporiry Byvtaw Tomnetion EA 3,500.00 17.500.00 | S 1,000.00 5,000.00 3,500.00 | 5 17.500 00 .025.00 45,125 00

6.0{6" Gate vahe EA 33 4,000.00 156.00000 { S 3,500 00 136,500.00 4,200.00 163,800.00 .146 00 24,694 00

7.3{iem Nal Used . 3 - - C

7 2 Replace Perpendutdr Hydfant Assembly LA 15 7.200 00 108,000.00 10,000 00 150.000.00 1860000 274.000.00 19,385.00 230.775.00

7 diular Hydrant A [] 7,500 00 45,00000 | § 10,000,00 60.000.00 18 600 00 11150000 19.385.00 116.310 00

3.0 Hygrant Avsembly Abandanment A 1 S00.00 500.00 4,413 00 4,413.00 3.500.00 2,500.00 1.572.00 7,872 00

Tegrn NOT Vg . 3 3 = » =
10.0}Vaive Removal EA 5 1.200 00 6.00000 | 5 3,000.00 | 5 15,000.00 3,00000 | S 15,000.00 7.972.00 39,860 00
11.0{\Vadeo Water Mains LF 29,720 800 $34,950.00 1.10 1265200 500§ 5 1 890 264.508.00
32,0 Tyoe 3 Select £l - No 2 Cruner Aun 5100¢ of 465 45 00 20.925.00 10.00 4,650.00 175.00 8137500 7255 33,7358
13.0[Temporary Asphalt SF 2,515 20 00 50,300.00 2.00 5.030 00 ke o) 50, 300.00 990 24,398.50 |
14 05t ¢t and Orveway Asphalt C¥ 585 20 00 19.700.00 20.00 19.700.00 20.00 19,700 00 2000 19.70000
15 0jConc) ete Sidewalk CF 308 30.00 5.150.00 AC.0C 12,200 00 4500 1372500 7500 22 875 00
16.0] Ramave and Reinstall Granie Curh [1] 30 5500 1.650 00 5000 ,S00.00 200.00 6.000.00 13.00 2.3?2000
17 0fConcrete Curb LF 2D 45.00 900.00 50.00 .000.00 100.00 .000.00 65.00 1380 00 |
15.0{Concrete Guiter SF 690 5500 37,950.00 50.00 34,500 00 4500 31,050.00 639.00 182 31000
19 Cilawn Kestoration 5F 31.925 2.00 7.850 00 100 7,850.00 200 ,850.00 2.00 7.850.00
20 115" Ducti'e Iron Water Mawn LF 130 95.00 12.350.00 120.00 15,600 00 250.00 32.500.00 864.00 112,320 00
21.04V Bro Polvethylene Encasement LF 140 $.00 700.00 10.00 1,400.00 5.00 700.00 400 560.00
40 OfRock Remaval [<] S0 5000 2,500.00 50.00 2.500 00 50:00 2,500.00 50.00 2.500.00
41 OjEsploratony Latdvaton [ 20 20.00 400.00 20.00 400 00 2000 400.00 2000 400.00 |
42 D]Esmoratony Excavaton Sheeted (<3 10 3000 300.00 30.00 300 00 3000 300.00 3000 300.0
23.0]timng Venfization tachvation 1o Pavement  Shoeted cY 20 4000 B800.00 40.00 800,00 40.00 £00.00 40,00 800.0¢
44 06" M |, Ducti Iron Sendy 11144, 22172, 45 ar 90 Degreed [ 300.00 300.00 300.00 %00 00 300.00 300.00 300,00 300 OC
45 0]8° M L. Duetie ron Bonds: 11-1/4, 22-1/2, 43 or 30 Cegrees A 000D 500 00 500.00 500.00 500.00 ;L(n 00 300.00 50000
45.0/6° & 8" M Solid Sleeve EA 300.00 300 00 300.00 300.X 300.00 300 00 300.00 300 00
47 DiE™ Anchor Pioe 3. 47,6 or & A 1 50.00 350 00 350.00 350.0¢ 350.00 350.0C 350,00 35000
L8 CiGrivm Tt t LF 10 4000 400 00 40.00 400 X 40.00 400.0C 40.00 40000
90| Type 1 Select Fil No. 1 Crusher Run Stone Y 25 2000 500 00 2000 | S 500.00 20.00 500.0C 20.00 500 00
50 0] Twpe 3 Serect Fill » Run of-Bank Gravel (S 25 15.00 375.00 15000 S 375.00 15.00 375.00 15,00 375.00
51-0[Type 4 Select Fill - Sand [4] 30 10.00 300,00 1000 | § 300.00 10.00 300.00 1000 300 M_
$2 0] Type 5 Select Flll - Controlied Densaty Fill cY 20 £0.00 £00.00 4000 830.00 40.00 800.00 40.00 500.00
53,1]Valve Nut Extension Stems: 1" 0r 2" EA 1 S000 .00 50.00 50 00 5000 | S $9.00 S0.00 50 0C
53 2] Valve Nut Extensian Siems: 3 or 4’ EA 1 75 00 .00 75.00 75.00 75.00 25.00 75.00 75.00
54.0j1" Copper Instalistion by Open Cut LF 20 35.00 70000 35.00 700 00 35.00 200.00 1500 700.00
550117 Codoer tnitalaition by Nan-Open Sut LF 0 40 00 £00.00 4000 $00.C0 40.00 800.00 40.00 800 00
56.0] 1" Curb Stop EA bl 1.00C.00 100000 1.000.00 1,000 00 1,000.00 1,000.00 1.000 00 1.000.00
5221 1" Corporation EA b 1,000 00 1.000.00 1,000.00 1.000.00 1000 00 100000 1.000.00 1.000.00
S8.0!0ean ard Rarse Cutb Bax A 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 )0.00
59 0]6” or 8” Leaking Sidei.ne Gate Valve Replacement A 1,500 00 7.500 00 1.500.00 1.500,00 150000 7, 1 500.00 2.500.00
&0 D]5" or B' Leaxing Sioeiine Gate Verve & Toe Aepiacement EA 2.500.00 7,500 00 2,500.00 7.50003 2.500.00 2,500 00 2 500.00 7.500 0O
61 0] Traflic indusrante Laos - Sew Cut 3nd Seal LF S| 5.00 50 00 .00 250.00 500 150.00 5.00 250.00
£2 D|Tealic Induciance Loos - inducTance Loop Wire F 100 7001 5 700 0 1.og 700.00 700 700,00 7.00 700.00
63.0] Winser Contrete 4 S00 5.00 2.500.00 o0 2,500 00 5.00 2.500.00 500 2.500.00
54.0]Tres Ramoval EA 3 300,00 | § 500.00 | Fs 30600 $00.00 300,00 500.00 30000 5 90000 |
T15t3i: 52,456, $2.455.%00. 52,5551 53.522,50m,

B3 infprmal tiey
None



Buffalo Road Tank Water Main Connection

1 cenify 1hat this 115 & true repr af bids receved Eng No.: 24-006
on July 18, 2024 at 10:00 a.m. far Ihis contract Bid Opening: July 18, 2024 at 10:00 a m,
Hedtzmn Sakloe
4
Dale: 7/24/2024
Randsco Pipelne, Inc. V:.ger Construction, Inc. Mﬁ% Inc. Underground Innovations Group LLC
740 Quaker Road 425 Old Macedan Cir. Rd. 294 Elmgrove Road PO Box 536
Engineers Eslimate Macedon, NY 14502 Faitpart. NY 14450 Rochester NY 14628 Andaver, NY 14808
randscopipeline@yahoo.cam tawless@villagerd.com rechesterpipeline@yahon.com casey_joyce@UIG-LLC.com
(S85) 7454467 (585) 223-7697 (585) 270-5256 (716) 438-8418
ftem Eslimated unn Unit une Lnkt untt
No. |Descriplmn uuamﬂ‘ Unit Piice Amagnt Price Amount Prica Amount Prica Amouat Price Amount
1.1 116" Duclite Iron Water Main 163500 | LF |5 500013 24525000 &5 250018 SS152Ep0ts 200,00 32700000 s Jea00ls 326008 523.200.00
1.2 |12 Quctles kon Waler Main 1000] LF §5 15000 | 5 1,500.00 § & 40000 5 400000 S 155.00 15500015 45000 | 3 4.500.00 523400 1 S 52 4000
| 21 [36° M. Bend: 90 Degrees 200 EA | S 350000 | S 700000 1S i 3 .00 'S 520000 12400001 S 175000 | 3 3 500,00 65130018 13.086.00
22 [16" M J Bend 45 Degrees 2001 EAlS 3poooo | § 5000001 S 240000 S 480000 3 4.000.00 9800001 S 1,750.00 § S 3,500.00 3271.00 € 542 00
23 |16° M J. Bend: 22 172 Degless 100] EA | S 300000 5 3 000 DO 2 2.400.00 } § .300.00 7.300.00 1850001 s 1.650.00 3.271.00 3.271.00
24 |16' M J. Bend: 11 114 Degrees 3001 EA lS 3000003 §,000.00 24000015 20200 .100.00 9300001 185000 4.950.00 1.090.00 3270.00
30 (12" Bend: 90 Degrees 200 EA s 200000 | 3 4,000.00 1.800 00 00 z 1.800.00 3711001 S 6.542 00
4.0 118" Gale Valve 100 EA LS 800000 | $ 80000018 15,000.00 | 3 1 13.457.50 1348750) s 1750008 17500 28171001 S 2617100
$.0 [187«12" Reducer 1001 EA 1S 2000001 5 20000018 1.800.00 { 5 1800001 S 3 000.00 300000 S 3.500.00 1 .00 6543.00 | $ 5 543.00
[ 61 [16°16" Tupping Siceve Vae ana Tad 100 EA LS 1800000 § 18 00000 3000000 | 3 ols 00 nmwocels 20,900 00 20.060.00 1308500 | S 13 DA5 00
6.2 |'27x1F Tagpne Sieeve. Vahe and 1ad 100 EA LS 11,00000 | § 11000.00 11.000.00 11.00000| 8 16.500.00 i) s 18.500.00 16,500.00 1308500 | § 13.085 00
70 Perpendulr Hyaianl Assemdey 2000 EA | S 750000 % 15,200.00 E800001 S 1760000 | 5 8.000.00 16boonals 1 0|3 20.000.00 654300 ' 8 13.088.00
| 8.1 JLown Resioraton 210000 SF |$ 22515 473500 225 4725000 22618 «msoels 22603 : 2251 4725.00
| 32 IField Restoralion 1445000 | SF I 8 125]% 180625 S 125 18.06250 | § 125 isoe2so s 12613 18.082.50 12618 12 583.50
9.0 |Solysmvicne Encasement 170500 LF {§ 22518 383625 5.00 8.525 00 J.00 511500 _8sals 11 1500 | 3 25.575.00
100} 18" Aestrmneg Jowd Duclie lion Vister Wan 6000 | LF IS 200001 S 12 060000 14500 2 700 00 155.00 $300Dp0 35000 | & 21 20500 S 1230000
| 11.0 |Jackng and Burag with 39° Sieel Canng Pipe S000) LF IS 40000} 5 200000018 100000 50,000 00 1000.00 50,000.00 1.100.00 5500000 47500 | 3 23,750.00
| 40.0 [Roze Reweval D er |s 75001 S 3750.00 7500 3.750.00 7500 | 3 3,750.00 75.00 3.750.00 750018 3.750.00
411 |Exploratory Excavation 2| cY s 20001 s 40000 |'s 2000 |5 40000 |'S 2000] s 400,00 30007 400.00 20008 400,00
41,2 (Explaraiory Excavatien - Sheeted 100 CY | % 000! 8§ 30000 | § 3000 | S 300 $ 66.00 | § 600.0Q, 30.00 300.00 3000 | 8 300.00
42 115" Anchor ige 3' 4'0r 6" 1l EA LS 350001 S 350001 S 350.00 3500018 350.00 350001 % 35000 350.00 35000 | § 350.00
422 [5° Anchar Pioe. 12° 19” or 24~ 1l A ls 300003 3000013 300.00 300001s 300.00 30000§s 30099 300.00 3000018 300.00
430018 o £2° M 1 Sold Sireves i EA S50001 5 ss000 s 550.00 55000} 3 S50.001% 550.00 550.00 550.00 550008 550.00
4401 Tvow ! Seloct P32~ 81 Cruaher Run Sisas L 251 CY MWoois Ispoels 3000 75000} S 30.00 3000 750 00 001S 750.00
45 0| Tvpe 2 Select Fill - 82 Crusner Run Stone | s cy s 4000 € 1000.00 4000 1S 100000{ 35 40001 S 1.000.004 $ 4000 1,000.00 40.00 | § 1.000.00
460 Type 3 Seiec! Fill - Run-af-Bank Gravel i 25] €Y | S 3005 52500 330018 500 % 3300} S 8250018 30018 #2500 330018 82500
47 0[Tvpe 4 Sclect Fil - Sand }4 cY |s 30004 % 500.00 § 3000|5 80000) S 300013 GOOD0YS 3000(s 800 00 30001 S 800.00
48 0| Tvoe S Setect F) - Contrefies Densay Fi W0 cy s 8000 | 160000 1% s00|s 1.60000 | $ 80.00{ S 15000048 wo0is 160000 #0001 % 1500.00
40 0 {Rack Dnlng Si)l LF |3 50001S 250000 s 5000| s 2.500.00 50.00 250000} 5 Saoo|s 250000 5000 S 2.500.00 |
50.0 | Tunneting sol LF |8 125008 _£3s000]§ 12 s 6.250.00 125.00 625000 125.80 6.250.00 1250013 5 250.00
51.0 | Temoorary Construction Fenang soo| LF |5 5.00 2.500.00 S001 S 2.500.00 5.00 2.500.00 500 ,500.00 0o ls 2 500.00
52 0 |Erosion Control - Slone Check Dam 3 EaA |3 535 00 17550008 sas00l s 755.00 585001 8 1.755.00 58500 ,T55.00 585.00 | § 1_755.00
53 0 [Winter Conzrete 100] CF [S 6.50 s5000)% ss0)s 85000 | 3 6501s £50.00_ 850 550,00 S0(S 650,00
540 Duweway Asphan 0] CF | 5 35.00 350001S 315003 350001 S 350018 350.00 350013 35000 35001 % 350.00
Talal Ba Price $413.108 75 % 3 ﬁﬁi‘iﬁ[ T7H0 103 30

8id In

formalibes:

1) UG total writtan in Seckan 7 1 not Ma corract wtal valve bassa on tha umi prioo prepsed

2) Fredernics C:

aD

7

suom

3) Dehi Devalopment only suomawmd Section 7

1st Low Bidder

2nd Low Bidder

3rd Low Bidder



East Manitou Road Water Main Replacement

1 zecly that IMs japuialon « 3 Iferepresentalion o’ bias receved Eng No 22,025
onJduly 24 20243l 10U0a m Rorimis centeac) did Opering July 24, 2C24 3t W0 UG am
AeiBernre Hahbos
N
Dl Trzmmra A
Rargees PEane s Nardazs Faving & Coosuucion LG Vinager Corshucon, Ing. Jnaetgiound Innovations Group LLC
740 Quake! Road 124 North Genesae Swesl 425 Ofd Maczdon Cr, Rd. ‘0 5
Aeen Srmmae Macedon, NY 14502 Geneva NY 14458 Fairpar, NY 14450 . LBOE
s i cam com viB: £com nasey
1585) 7464467 1315) 716-9846 _:wlﬁ;w ;1151458 8418
T [ unt Tt
i Amauni Aol Prica Amount = e Amayn:
X (£ BT MmO Tpuenools h 1 0013 Teeag
: 3300 £30000 -] 535200 S0 1300 Sieace
L3t o Y B30 38, 20000 il 5 250 234700
250000 (T 200000 T E # b 25400 Lo
E ) F, e T E B S 14300 G
210050 i) L3000 e 1 481200 fﬁ B0 2]
|3 %g 10,375 153000 37 S1200 kL 00
< — 78020 3 3 L L %ﬂ«
o = = oo T
_,_4%_.1__::4_!”? 3 . 02000 i B67.00 = 8190, 3723800
& _S2000 £000 | E ¥ $5100 SMoo
£t EALY 1 E W TroeT Tewm i emoc]
BS0.00 00 23,289.00
F ) 3 (s V505 153,
7, _3300 20013 108 0000 1042500 |
1 —_eeom CT) iAoy 33 - FRE O
E 1600 3 ERICES B 1552 55800 |
4, 5 3 1 1 830D $300)
'%252 1, £21.20 ____Sne
5100 3100 4353000
] 138 _JORE0I0 700 1000 ].".é?.ﬁ.l
) 29 %E 30 00 BT TR
prd f2d 20} 7 2500 krd
2351 225 730
4343400 150 REL 0o ¥}
9, 570,00 5 54000 7 466100
4 Z.106.00 BET 00 i
4} 2 I FeL00 7 Entl ]
Ja 30, 4 2 1 00
: B — o — ) —
20200 § 104 1
1 TN k] 1 153 00
RIS T 2700
125 7, 425 135 0TS 00
75.00, { k) =X 7
Lo 2000 50
__30.00ds 000
350.00 T
m Lm
350,00 35000 }
: E = .
50C 00 500 00 X
= 2000 2000 £ F000 250,00 |
i =10) =1 800 83500 |
$00.00 —2e0 SO0.00 E5) 0000 |
160050 5050 2056 80000
00 lm S0 2300 25020¢ |
8E00.00 __B.,50000 | BE€00.00 B R020C 8 600.00
£00 200000 3
_mm o 1.755.00
T 550,07

2nd | ow biddel f1e Low Biader

1 only & Bm3es M6 PA Lerie oty 1 £ 0 Trs 3a L0 s ded
A e 3 a3Ddes u gricey

#imete s




Watker Road Tank, Electrical, Mechanlcal, and Plumbing Services

| certify that this Tabulation is a true representation of bids received
on Tuesday, August 27, 2024 at 10,00 a.m. for this contract.
. ' | <t
i | ‘

J -7
LA 3 3 LA
‘ TN =

iy
{

Engineering No.: 24-008
Authorization No.: 214-100
Bid Opening: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 at 10:00 am

gl ] -;J‘_ i "_{ L; T T _
] 7 ; Whitney East, Inc. Villager Construction, Inc. Concord Electric Corp
Dzte y 3 1 36/ 2029 1504 Scottsville Read 425 Old Macedon Center Road 305 Pinewlid Drive, Suite 4
4 4 Engineers Estimate Rochester, NY 14623 Fairpont, NY 14450 Rochester, NY 14606
(585) 328-7100 (585) 223-7657 (565) 436-6870
pullders@whitnayesst com liawless@villanefckom | bwood@concordelectriccomp.com
item Estimated
No. Description Quantity  Unit Unit Cost Estimated Cost Unit Cost Estimated Cost Unit Cost Estimated Cost | Unit Cost Estimated Cost
Watker Road Tank, Electrical, Mechanical, and ‘ \ - ’
1.0 Plumbing Services 1 LS |$ 50000000 § 50000000|S 40800000 $ 40800000 |S 497.50000|$ 497500.00|$  534.000.00 | §  534.000.00
- Total Bid Price | § 500,000.00 | § 408,000.00 | § 497.500.00 | S 534,000.00 |
1st Low Bidder 2nd Low Bidder 3rd Low Bidder
Bid Informalities:

Whitney East, Inc

Concord Electric Corp

1.) Bid Documents are bound but are not in the original binding This informality does not change the Bid results.

1.) Section 7 Bid pages submitted as unbound single sided copies. This informality does not change the Bid results.



Allers Creek Vauit Demolition

1 cantly that

o Sepeeas 8, X048 13

AL

&

7/25 /29

Eng. o 23005
8id Opening: Septamber 19, 202¢ a1 10:00 am

Sab
Frasers Ceretian LUC Botie Deveifen AC Equpfa Uniimies o NV LLC Eite Extavating & Demalition, Inc S Dpvesoroest e
Enginewss Esvmale DL 259 Fom 7 PO Tt 2107 Suge Fouar § 53 Kely Road 2520 Mises Sian
Fochame WY (4591 Latgrat, NY Tat0d Lgzs, NY 13502 Futton, NY 13069 Barger. NY 14416
(55815533567 71952011 208, (75815500804 At e ] (31515323325 e
Hem ' Im Unit m und valt Unit Uniz
No._|Ceecrinton Quaantity | Lt Price Amoust Foce Amoat Prica ! Amgust Sder Aamoce Price Ao Price Amoer
) ia e Loetd Wbt Temasen 1 -5 B 0500 50 ’ L] BP0 WO |3 Jsmo | 4 ARS0000 ) 3 Ayegaosd § sasioolt Py 20 < O 3 At ro AN S000 3 TR0 08
Total e Pace | 42 20C W Lo eac) s o] nung, mun::‘ ST X2
15t ).ow Bidder 2nci Lows Bidkder 3rd Low Bisder 4ih Low Biider

1) Durable Dernofition used white out in saction 7 10 GFrest &Y Sgeith ASTe which was Then noljnitialed, This ded not changs i bid results,

2) Bife Excavating & Demolition did not inchude a 5% bid bond This did nol change the bid results



I certify that this tabulation is a true
reptowntaton of oy reconved N

2024 Structural Lining Prgrom - REBIO

Eng No. 23024
Ociober 3. 2024 21 2:00 p.m for this project Auth. No.: 143 000
Bid Opening: October 1, 2024
By
Insltuform Technojogles, IAC ™ America LT
Date; !0/, /2 "‘} Engii s Estimat 380 Goddard Aveaue 354 Eisenhower Parkway
=7 . Chesterfield, MO 63005 Lwingston, N 07039
(636) 530-8679 (716} 652:3700
nmen tstimated uait unit unit
No.  |Desesiation Uait QuaﬂliL Price Amount Price Amount Price Amount
Water a1 Cloaning ana CIP? Ling o 355 1500 TA13075%0 T1600 L35315000 P TI7.675.00
8" Water Main Cleaning and CIP? Linin; [ 100 W00 600,000.00 315.00 530,00000 305.00 610.000.00
[ AC Water Main Giparing 3o COP Liting i 555 30 183.61500 ) 177 57500 3500 19492500
10" Water Man Cieaning and CIPF Lirirg [ TES () 1.275.750.00 339,00 508,365 00 335,00 1348.175 00
1|2 Termpotary Bypass Pige LF 1,440 00 12,960.00 1250 18,000.00 14.00 20,160.00
12 |2 Tamporary Fioe LF 6800 14 00 95.200 00 2000 136,000.00 1500 108.800.00
6" Tempna 58 F 3.010 2200 56,220 00 3200 36,320.00 22.00 £3
|Temperary Bypass Fige Sunal LF 11 5000 67,800.00 15 00 16.950.00 16000 11300000
T[3-3727 anet Seraller Temoorary Service EA 61 401.00 24,461 00 250.00 3525000 | S 500.00 30.500.00
w1 &7 &7 Temporary Sypass Connecnan LA 4500 12.525.00 30000 90000 |'§ 5,000.00 15.000.00
.2 __|E" and Lurger Temputaty Bynass Conaccion A 450800 35,066 00 1,000.00 8,000.00 |15 S0 4000000
i1 |6 Sute Valve A T 255000 50,150 00 150000 55,500.00 45000 68.000.00
~Jate Valve A 7 400000 2800000 2A00.00 36,500.00 800.50 33.600.00
107 Gate Valvo A S50 00 $8.500.00 50000 4550000 £.500.00 £1.20000
Reniace Pl pendiculer Hydrart A 1 15. 58 00 191,540.00 12.000.00 144.000.00 17,000.00 204,000.00
El [Porpend <ular Hycram Asuemaly A 18.996.00 15,555 00 .000.00 9.000 00 17.000.00 17.000.00
7 rrvdrant Assematy Abangoament A 5.296.00 10.580.00 200 00 10,000.00 2,000.00 4,000.00
EX: |V01u¢ BoX Abanaanment A 53 00 720000 S0 33.000.00 3.200.00 35,
S0 |Vigea Warer Mars 7 1853 A E 97,650.00 110 LABO <00 17577000
[ 700 _[7vpe 3 Setect Fil - Ko 7 Cravies Hun Sione =3 g BE00 237000 1600 45000 T0.60 9345000 |
110 JTemporary Asobhait s 1,935 2100 2128600 2.00 3 EN0.00 2000 38.700.00
120 _[Sereet Asphalt cr 1,580 2000 31,600 00 2000 33,600.00 2000 31,600.00
150 _[Contie soewalk cF 215 5400 11,610.00 40.00 3 50000 5000 19.350.00
160 [Conereti: Cuet 7 ¥ TRT0 2.250.00 5000 50000 16000 2.500.00
181 |Granite Curt Aemovii ang Replicenant 1 95 110.00 10,450.00 50.00 ,750.00 200.00 15.000.00
13 ncrete Guiter B 75 265.00 62500 5000 125000 20000 ,000.00
ib. "~ Ductie iron Water Nain L 512.00 .S50.00 20000 1,000.00 A0.00 2.000.00
170 |6 Tieir Connection J 763.00 81500 100.00 500 00 2.500.00 12.500.00
[ 38¢ ik AtanSonrent €A 1,000 00 ,000.00 1,000.00 ,000.00 500 00 .500.00
| 190 |v Service instaliation EA 1.500.00 500 00 250000 2.500.00 ,000.00 000 00
20.0 |Lawn Restaration SF 380 200 £ 2.00 . S60.00 2 1.860.00
40.0 _[Rock Removal Y £ S0.00 .S00.00 000 1,500 00 50,00 2 500.00
31.0_[Escloratury Excovaion al 20 20.00 00 0 20000 30.00 400.00
£ Escioratory xavaion - SHeews CY i 30.00 300.00 3000 390.00 30.00 300.00
43.0 |Uring Vesificauor Extavation in Pavement - Shected Cr 2 2000 30000 40.00 800.00 40.00 800.00
360 _|5 W . Ductie irgn Bends 113/, 22-1/2 o 45 Degroes A 30000 30090 200.00 300.00 300.00 30000
[TA50 |5 M Ductlio Iron Bengs. 13-1/4, 22-1/2 6f &5 Degroes [ g w000 S00.00 40000 400.00 400.00
460 [10° ML Ductile iron Bends: 12-1/4, 22372 or 45 Segrtes A S00.00 000 500,00 500.00 0000 50006
70 |6 &5 W Soid Sleewe A 36008 30G.00 30000 30000 30000 300.00
[ 380|107 M Sole Seeve T SO0.00 000 <00.00 SO0.00 B0 50000 ]
49 " Anchot Pige: 127, 187 o 28° A 30000 300.00 300.00 30000 300.00 390,00
S00_|& Ancnor Pipe: 3, &', 6 01 B ) 300 350.00 35006 350.00 350.00 35000
(570 [fyoe 1 Select Full - No. & Cruaher un Sione Y = 000 5000 2000 500.00 2000 500.00
17520 ITvoe 3 Select Fil - Run-ol-Bank Gravel o i 1500 3750 1800 3750 1500 37500
30 |Tyoe & Select Fil - Sand cY 30 1000 30000 1000 300.00 10.00 300.00
540 _|Tyoe 5 Sulect Ful - Conyroles Desay il [4] 20 2000 00.00 4000 800.00 40.00 200.00
500 [vaive Nul Eatenyion Siams 1706 2 EA 50,00 2000 S0.00 $0.00 5000 £0.00
56 ahee Nut Extension Stems: 3' or & EA 1500 75.00 7500 S0 5.00 7500
[57.0_|" Coaper atatation oy Open Cut i P 3500 70000 35.00 700,00 35.00 — 70000 |
580 |1 Conper instaliution by Non-Open Ct g ) () 00 <000 £00.00 2000 80000
%60 |1 cumsSton A H 100000 0000 1,060.00 000,00 1,000.00 000,00 |
€04 |1 Corpotation ¥ 1 3.00000 000,00 1.000.00 1000 00 1.000.00 _D00.C0
61.0 [2" Copper Instailation by Open Cut ] 0 70.00 .500.00 F0.00 ,S00.00 70.00 .500 00
62 C»an and Raise Curb Bax EA i 100.00 10000 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
530 |5 or & (eaking Sidetng Gate Ve Replacennt A 5 150000 TS0.00 | 150000 15000 150000 7.500.00
[ Ba *or B _eaking Sideloe Gate Vilve B Tee Neplacerent A 3 2.500,00 7.500.00 2,500.00 7.,500.00 2.500.00 7.50000
BS0_[Trailic (nouctance Loop  Saw Cul and Seal [0 5 590 250.00 500 25000 500 0 |
[ Ea [ 100 700 700.00 700 700.00 7.00 700.00
[0 o [ 1800 540.00 1800 $40.00 3320 54000
a1 23 3 00 00 500,00 300.00 ]
Yotal ; = mij

i nformatitios:

Mainlining America - Bict item 5 2, Words and numbers aid not maleh (words gavern), changed tota! Bio by $4,000 00
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- MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY

P.0. Box 10999 e 475 Norris Drive ® Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999
Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220

To: Steve Trotta Date: 11/26/2024
From: Laurel Neff File: WA 112415
Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies:

Bids were received on November 21, 2024 for One (1) New 2026 Five Man, Four Door Crew
Cab Truck with Body. The apparent low responsive responsible bidder was Regional Truck and

Trailer with a bid of $216,537.03.

No other bids were received. Bid packages were sent to Conway Beam, Tracey Road
Equipment, Kenworth Northeast, Prime Vendor, STS Trailer, and Nassau Trading Inc.

| recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible bidder.

/In
(DisTApproved by /?,,;:\_-}——— iH-26-2
Depﬂtment Head Date
4 74 [/
V> , Y. F 75 &
(Di$)Approved by, M/(.f(’?/d/ /, // /‘/I A [é V?(/Qy
f]urchasing 5 , /‘ Date (
# ‘ I °f /o
7 2 L(,//‘//”kﬁ ///}-/)/2/({
(D}szpproved by / 4 '
Executive Director Date

(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



- MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY
P.O. Box 10999 e 475 Norris Drive ® Rochester, N.Y. 14610-0999
Phone: (585) 442-2000 Fax (585) 442-0220

To: Steve Trotta Date: 11/26/2024
From: Laurel Neff File: WA 112414
Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies:

Bids were received on November 20, 2024 for Eight (8) New Compact Pickup Trucks. The
apparent low responsive responsible bidder was Van Bortel Ford, Inc. with a bid of $231,960.00.

No other bids were received. Bid packages were sent to Van Bortel Chevrolet, Robert Green
Truck, Joe Basil Chevrolet, Jim Barnard Chevrolet, West Herr Dodge, Cortese Ford, Bob Johnson

Greece, and Prime Vendor, Inc.

| recommend that the bid be awarded to the low responsive, responsible bidder.

/In
Mpproved by /-2 -24
Dep'a{tment Head Date
aF g @ = } € ’ } / /
!mproved by (\ %M‘bud ){ ,é:/// H 2(/': (Q O}(‘I]Z
P/urchasing M/! Date ' / ‘
(D/itﬁ\pproved by A j £ (* (‘ // Qj)
/ Executive Director Date

(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



