Monroe County Water Authority

\ 4
[\ Memorandum

To: Board Members Date: August 2, 2018

From: Nicholas Noce, Executive Director

Subject: Regular Board Meeting — Thursday, August 9, 2018  9:30 a.m.
at 475 Norris Drive — Board Room

Agenda Items:
1. Personnel Items:

There are resolutions on this agenda to confirm the following three (3) new hire appointments.

Recommendation memorandums for each of these appointments and their applications are enclosed
for Board review:

e Provisional Appointment of Scott Gabel to the title of Chemist
e Provisional Appointment of Amy Molinari to the title of Budget Analyst
e Appointment of Dennis Guarino to the title of Heavy Motor Equipment Operator

There are resolutions on this agenda to confirm four (4) promotion appointments.

Recommendation memorandums for each of the following are enclosed for Board review and all are
reachable on the Civil Service Exam Lists for promotion to their respective title:

Heidi Young to the title of Jr. Project Engineer — Water Distribution

Matthew Smith to the title of Jr. Project Engineer — Water Distribution

Justin Sullivan to the title of Jr. Project Engineer — Water Distribution

Timothy Stevens to the title of Project Engineer — Water Distribution

2. There is an item on the agenda to authorize the execution of professional services agreements with
three qualified firms for Heating, Ventilating, and Air Conditioning (HVAC) engineering services.
The services performed under these agreements are for HVAC engineering primarily for various
MCWA facilities on an as-needed basis. Individual price proposals and schedules will be requested
and evaluated for each project. The professional services agreements will be for a term of two years.

Staff has reviewed the qualifications received and recommend agreements be executed with the
following firms:

e Erdman, Anthony and Associates, Inc.
e Pathfinder Engineers and Architects, LLP
e LaBella Associates, P.C.

3. There is an item on the agenda to authorize award of a lump sum contract for the MCWA Eastside
Operations Center Emergency Boiler Replacement project. Last winter (2017 / 2018), the boiler for
the Eastside Operations Center had to undergo its second significant repair requiring the unit to be
taken out of service for an extended period of time. This unit was installed in 1992 and is reaching its
life expectancy. This is the main boiler for the facility and as such, there is concern of its reliability
going into another winter season. Pathfinder Engineers & Architects LLP was hired to expedite the
necessary engineering to bid the installation of a replacement boiler system during favorable weather
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conditions. There were six bids submitted for this project. Our recommendation is to award the
contract to the lowest responsive, responsible, bidder Emcor Services Betlem, in the bid amount of
$229,500.

ESOC Emergency Boiler Replacement
$400,000.00
$350,000.00 —
$300,000.00
$250,000.00
$200,000.00
$150,000.00
$100,000.00
$50,000.00
s Landry
SE:?:JS Crosby- Cor.:s;lreuec{:.ion Bell Mechanical Melc-:lr?gr?ical
Brownlie, Inc. Mechanical Contractors,
Betlem Corp. Ine Co. LLC
Bid Amount $229,500.00 @ $264,450.00 @ $289,400.00 = $308,000.00 $350,500.00 $360,000.00

There is an item on the agenda to authorize the purchase and delivery of rock salt for the Corfu Water
Treatment Plant softening process. One bid was received from Compass Minerals in the amount of
$17,000 ($170 per ton). This is a one year, unit price contract with the option to extend for up to four
additional one-year terms. Compass Minerals is the current supplier and is the low, responsive,
responsible bidder. Recommendation memo and bid tabulation sheet enclosed for Board review.

There is an item on the agenda to authorize utilizing Monroe County Contract — Ford Motor
Company Automotive Engine & Auto Body Parts — BP #0601-17 (currently held by Emerling Ford,
Inc.) for the purchase of Ford vehicle parts /supplies for maintenance and repair of Water Authority
vehicles for an estimated amount of $20,000 through the contract period ending July 31, 2019.

The Authority’s standard procurement compliance resolution.

There is an item on the agenda to approve the Authority’s Disposal Guidelines, as revised and
presented; this is in order to reflect a change in designation of Contracting Officer.

There are items for approval of the Authority’s 2" Quarter Investment Report — period ending June
30, 2018; and for approval of the Authority’s 2" Quarter Financial Report — period ending June 30,
2018. These reports are enclosed for Board review.

It is anticipated there will be an executive session requested under Attorney — Client privilege to discuss
potential security enhancements.

There may be additional items placed on the agenda not finalized for this mailing.

There may be items presented for discussion and/or notification.

Enclosures

CC:

Department Heads
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To: Richard Metzger, P.E. Date: 07/24/2018

From: Karin Anderson File: WA 061813

Subject: Recommendation for Bid Award Copies: R.Cleveland

August 9, 2018 Board Meeting

One bid was received on July 17, 2018, for purchase and delivery of Rock Salt for use at our
Corfu Water Treatment Plant. This is a one year, unit price contract with the option to renew
up to four additional one-year terms upon mutual consent. The apparent low responsive,
responsible bidder is Compass Minerals in the amount of $17,000.

[ recommend that the bid be awarded to the low, responsive, responsible bidder.

/ka
Attachment: Bid Tabulation

(Bipapproved by / W W . 7/ Eci.’//‘g

bef)artment Head Date
digapprovedty K AMN ANANLON 7/R4/[(8

Purchasing Manager Date’
(DYs)Approved by /] J i S” : /1 V

Executive Director Date
(Dis)Approved by

Executive Assistant/Board Date



July 24, 2018

Monroe County Water Authority
MCWA 061813 — Rock Salt, Corfu Water Treatment Plant

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5)
Item No Qty Description Cargill Compass Mid-Atantic Abraxus Midwest
Minerals Salt Salt Salt
1 100 Tons Purchase/Delivery of Rock Salt No Bid $17,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 Submission Submission Submission | Submission
(6) (7) (8) (9) (10)
Item No Qty Description National Morton Sait | Morton Salt Us Salt UsS Salt
Salt Distrib. Chicago New York Minnesota New York
1 100 Tons Purchase/Delivery of Rock Salt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Submission Submission Submission Submission Submission




MONROE COUNTY WATER AUTHORITY
D1SPOSAL GUIDELINES
REVISED APRIL 2018
PROPOSED AUGUST 2018

The Monroe County Water Authority (the “Authority”), a New York public benefit
corporation, in compliance with the New York State Public Authorities Law, has established
these Guidelines for the Disposal of Property (the “Guidelines”).

These Guidelines shall apply to the disposal of real property and personal property
throughout the year following their adoption and until such time as the Authority adopts new or
revised Guidelines. The Members of the Authority shall review and approve of these Guidelines,
with any necessary modifications and revisions, on a no less than annual basis.

1. Designation of Contracting Officer

The Authority hereby designates Paul Liess as the Authority’s Contracting Officer, in
compliance with the provisions of New York State Public Authorities Law. The Contracting
Officer shall hold this position until the Members of the Authority designate a new Contracting
Officer or until such time as the Members adopt new Disposal Guidelines.

The Contracting Officer shall be responsible for the administration and implementation of
these Guidelines. The Contracting Officer shall cause these Guidelines to be posted on the
Authority’s website so that they are available to the general public.

2. Application of Guidelines

The procedures outlined in these Guidelines shall apply to the Authority’s disposal from
time to time of all personal property having a fair market value at the time of disposal of more
than five thousand dollars ($5,000.00) and all interests in real property. In addition, these
Guidelines contain procedures governing the disposal of property for less than fair market value.
As used in these Guidelines, “property” shall include personal and real property. Personal and
real property are distinguished from each other as appropriate in some Sections of these
Guidelines.

The Authority shall dispose of personal property with a fair market value at the time of
disposal of five thousand dollars ($5,000.00) or less under the terms of the Authority’s Policy for
Tracking and Disposal of Fixed Assets.

3. Purpose

The Authority has adopted these Guidelines to comply with the provisions of NYS Public
Authorities Law and to realize a favorable return on the disposal of Authority property.

4. Fair Market Value

Before disposing of property, the Contracting Officer shall take reasonable measures to
determine the fair market value of the property to be disposed. The fair market value of property
that (i) is unique in nature, or (ii) due to unique circumstances of the proposed transaction, is not
readily valued by reference to an active market for similar property, shall be determined through



an appraisal by a qualified professional. Prior to its disposal, the fair market value of all real
property shall be established by an appraisal conducted by a qualified professional.

5. Advertised Bid

All disposals of Authority property shall be made after public advertisement for bids for the
purchase of Authority property. The Contracting Officer shall order the advertising for bids in
such a manner and in such publications as the Contracting Officer deems reasonably necessary to
permit full and fair competition for the property consistent with the fair market value and nature
of the property.

All advertisements for soliciting bids on Authority property shall state the method, place and
deadline for the submission of bids, and request any other information the Contracting Officer
deems necessary to evaluate bids being solicited.

All advertisements and announcements soliciting bids shall state the place and time at which
the content of all bids received for the property advertised shall be publicly disclosed. The
content of all bids received shall be publicly disclosed as announced in the solicitation for bids.

6. Award of Property Subject to Bid

Award of the property for which bids have been solicited shall be made within a timeframe
reasonable for the evaluation of the bids received. The Contracting Officer shall evaluate the
bids and select the bid most advantageous to the Authority based upon (a) conformance with the
invitation for bids, (b) the terms, including but not limited to the price offered, and (c) any other
factors that warrant consideration.

Notwithstanding the foregoing, the Authority may reject as inadequate all bids received in
response to a particular solicitation for bids if the Contracting Officer deems that it is in the best
interest of the Authority to reject all bids.

7. Notification of Successful Bid

The Authority shall notify the successful bidder in writing of the Authority’s acceptance of
the bid. This notice shall contain a description of the property, the amount of the successful bid
and any other material terms of the bid, The bidder shall be required to make payment to the
Authority Treasurer in a form and on terms acceptable to the Authority before taking possession
of the property.

The Authority shall gather the following information regarding any successful bidder:
name, address, phone number.

The Authority shall provide to the successful bidder a deed, bill of sale, lease or other
appropriate instrument adequate to transfer to the successful bidder the interest in the property.

8. Contracts to Dispose of Property

The Authority may solicit bids for contracts to dispose of the Authority property covered by
these Guidelines. In the event that the Authority determines that the services of a company are
necessary to assist the Authority in disposing of certain of its property, the Authority shall follow



the same procedures in selecting an organization to dispose of property as the Authority follows
under these Guidelines for disposal of property through advertised bid.

9. Disposal of Property by Negotiation

The Authority may dispose of property through negotiation or by public auction without
regard to the above described procedures if the Contracting Officer determines that any of the
following conditions exist:

(a) introduction into the market of the personal property to be disposed of would adversely
affect the state or local market for that kind of property due to the property’s artistic
qualities, antiquity, historical significance, rarity, or other quality (separate from the
property’s utilitarian purpose), and a fair market price and other terms for the sale of the
personal property can be obtained through negotiation;

(b) the fair market value of the property does not exceed fifteen thousand dollars ($15,000);

(c) prices for the property that were obtained by advertised bid were not reasonable or the
bid process did not generate open competition;

(d) disposal of the property to the state or any political subdivision at fair market value can
be arranged through negotiation;

(e) the property is being disposed of for less than fair market value under the circumstances
set forth in Section 11 of these Guidelines; or

(f) such action is otherwise authorized by law.

10. Documentation of Disposal by Negotiation

The Contracting Officer shall cause to be prepared an explanation of the circumstances of
the disposal when property is disposed of through the negotiation process described in Section 9,
and any of the following are true:

(a) personal property disposed of has an estimated fair market value in excess of fifteen
thousand dollars ($15,000);

(b) real property sold has an appraised value in excess of one hundred thousand dollars
($100,000.00);

(c) real property leased has an estimated annual fair market rent over the term of the lease in
excess of fifteen thousand dollars ($15,000.00);

(d) the personal or real property has been disposed of by exchange; or
(e) any part of the consideration for the property disposed of consists of real property.

Not less than ninety (90) days prior to the scheduled date of any transaction under Section 9
and 10 of these Guidelines, the Contracting Officer shall provide the following information to
the members of the Authority (the “Members”), the Office of the State Comptroller, the New
York State Director of the Budget, the New York State Commissioner of General Services, the

New York State Authorities Budget Office, and the New York State Legislature c/o the Speaker
of the House and the Senate Majority Leader:

(a) description of the parties involved in the property transaction;

(b) justification for disposing of the property by negotiation;



(c) identification of property, including its location,;
(d) estimated fair market value of the property;

(e) proposed sale price of the property;

(f) size of the property; and

(g) expected date of sale of the property.

11. Disposal of Property for Less than Fair Market Value (Effective March 1, 2010)

The Authority may sell, lease or otherwise alienate an asset owned, leased or otherwise in
the Authority’s control for less than fair market value only if the Contracting Officer determines
that any of the following conditions exist:

(a) the transferee is a government or other public entity, and the terms and conditions of the
transfer require that the ownership and use of the asset will remain with the government
or any other public entity;

(b) the purpose of the transfer is within the purpose, mission or governing statute of the
Authority; or

(c) the Authority seeks to transfer the asset to a non-governmental entity, the disposal is not
consistent with the Authority's mission, purpose or governing statutes, and the Authority
either:

i. provides written notification to the Governor, the Speaker of the Assembly, and the
temporary President of the Senate, and all such recipients fail to deny the proposed
transfer within the applicable time period as set forth in Section 2897 of the Public
Authorities Law; or

ii. the transfer is of property obtained by the Authority from a political subdivision
where the Authority resides and is approved in accordance with Section 2897(7)(it1)
of the Public Authorities Law.

For each proposed transfer of an asset below fair market value, the Contracting Officer shall
provide the following information to the Members and to the public:

(a) a full description of the asset;

(b) an appraisal of the fair market value of the asset and any other information establishing
the fair market value requested by the Members;

(c) a description of the purpose of the proposed transfer and a reasonable statement of the
kind and amount of the benefit to the public resulting from the transfer, including,
without limitation:

i. the kind, number, location, wages or salaries of jobs created or preserved that are
required by the transfer; and

ii. the benefits, if any, to the communities in which the asset is situated that are required
by the transfer;

(d)  astatement of the value to be received compared to the fair market value;

(e) the names of any private parties participating in the transfer and a statement of the
value to the private party; and



(f) the names of other private parties who have made an offer for such asset, the value
offered, and the purpose for which the asset was sought to be used.

The Members shall consider the foregoing information before approving the disposal of any
property for less than fair market value. The Members shall also make a written determination
that there is no reasonable alternative to the proposed below-market transfer that would achieve
the same purpose. The reporting requirement of this Section 11 is in addition to the reporting
requirements of Section 9 and 10 of these Guidelines, as applicable.

12. Yearly Property Report

Each year the Contracting Officer shall publish a report listing all of the real property of the
Authority to the extent permitted under applicable laws and regulations governing homeland
security. The report will list and fully describe all real and personal property disposed of by the
Authority during the previous twelve-month period.

The report shall contain a full description of each item of property disposed of, the price
received by the Authority and the name of the individual(s) or entity that purchased the property.

The Contracting Officer shall cause the report to be delivered to the Office of the State
Comptroller, the New York State Director of the Budget, the New York State Commissioner of
General Services, the New York State Authorities Budget Office and the New York State
Legislature c/o the Speaker of the House and the Senate Majority Leader.

The Contracting Officer shall publish the report on the Authority’s website.
13. Annual Report to the New York State Authorities Budget Office

The Authority will include in its Annual Report, in addition to providing the information
contained in the Yearly Property Report described above, a listing and description of all real
property disposed of by the Authority during such year having an estimated fair market
value in excess of Fifteen Thousand and No/100 Dollars ($15,000.00). The Annual Report
must include, at a minimum, the price received by the Authority and the name of the
purchaser for all property sold. The Annual Report shall also contain a description of all
assets, services or both assets and services that are sold by the Authority without
competitive bidding, which description shall include the following:

(a) the nature of those assets and/or services;
(b)  the names of the counterparties; and

(c) where the contract price for assets that are sold by the Authority is less than fair
market value, then a detailed explanation of the justification for making such sale
without competitive bidding will be provided along with a certification by the
Executive Director and Director of Finance and Business Services stating that
they have reviewed the terms of the sale and determined that it complies with the
applicable law and the Authority’s procurement guidelines.

The Authority shall cause its Annual Report to be delivered to the County Executive, the
Chief Financial Officer, the President of the Monroe County Legislature and the Authorities
Budget Office within ninety (90) days after the end of the Authority’s fiscal year.

The Authority shall publish its Annual Report on the Authority’s website.



